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I. INTRODUCTION 

1. On August 10, 2018 (the “Filing Date”), the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the “Court”) 

issued an order (the “Initial Order”) granting Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc. and Aralez Pharmaceuticals Canada 

Inc. (“Aralez Canada” and together with Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc., the “Companies”) protection pursuant to 

the Companies’ Creditors Arrangement Act, R.S.C. 1985, c. C-36, as amended (the “CCAA”), and appointing 

Richter Advisory Group Inc. (“Richter”) as Monitor of the Companies in their CCAA proceedings (the “Monitor”).  

The Initial Order provided the Companies with a stay of proceedings until September 7, 2018. The Companies’ 

CCAA proceedings are referred to herein as the “CCAA Proceedings”. 

2. Also on the Filing Date, Aralez Pharmaceuticals Management Inc. (“APMI”), Aralez Pharmaceuticals R&D Inc., 

Aralez Pharmaceuticals U.S. Inc. (“APUS”), POZEN Inc., Halton Laboratories LLC, Aralez Pharmaceuticals 

Holdings Limited (“APHL”) and Aralez Pharmaceuticals Trading DAC (“Trading DAC”, and collectively with the 

foregoing, the “Chapter 11 Debtors”; and the Chapter 11 Debtors together with the Companies, collectively the 

“Aralez Entities”) each filed voluntary petitions with the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District 

of New York (the “U.S. Court”) for relief under title 11 of the United States Bankruptcy Code, 11 U.S.C § 101-

1532 (the “Chapter 11 Proceedings”).   

3. On September 5, 2018, the Court issued the Amended and Restated Initial Order (the “Amended Initial Order”), 

which incorporated certain amendments to the Initial Order. Also on September 5, 2018, the Court issued an 

order extending the stay of proceedings in respect of the Companies to November 14, 2018. 

4. On October 10, 2018, the Court granted orders approving, among other things: 

(i) the proposed sales process (the “Sales Process”), including the bidding procedures and bid protections 

to be used in connection with the Sales Process;  

(ii) the share purchase agreement (the “Share Purchase Agreement”) dated September 18, 2018, between 

the Companies and Nuvo Pharmaceuticals Inc. (“Nuvo”) for the sale of all of the shares of Aralez Canada 

(the “Canadian Assets”), which would serve as a stalking horse bid as part of the Sales Process; 

(iii) a priority charge (the “Bid Protections Charge”) in favour of Nuvo as security for payment of the 

Termination Fee and the Expense Reimbursement (as defined in the Share Purchase Agreement”); 

(iv) the procedure to solicit claims against the Companies and any of the Companies’ current and former 

directors and officers (the “Claims Process”), including establishing November 29, 2018, by 5:00 p.m. 

(EST) (the “Claims Bar Date”) as the deadline for creditors to file Pre-Filing Claims or D&O Claims (as 

defined in such Order (the “Claims Procedure Order”)); and 



 

2 

 

(v) an extension of the stay of proceedings in respect of the Companies to December 7, 2018. 

5. On October 25, 2018, the Court granted an order approving a cross-border insolvency protocol to provide 

coordination and cooperation between the Court and the U.S. Court overseeing the Chapter 11 Proceedings. 

6. On November 16, 2018, the Court granted an order approving, among other things, the Companies’ proposed 

key employee retention plan (the “KERP”).  On November 28, 2018, the Court granted an order approving the 

Companies’ proposed key executive incentive plan (the “KEIP”) and granting a charge (the “Key Employees 

Charge”) in favour of the participants under the KERP and the KEIP, including the priority ranking thereto. 

7. On December 7, 2018, the Court granted an order approving, among other things: 

(i) the transaction contemplated by the Share Purchase Agreement (the “Nuvo Transaction”); 

(ii) vesting in Nuvo, upon the closing of the Nuvo Transaction, the right, title and interest of Aralez 

Pharmaceuticals Inc. in and to the Canadian Assets; and 

(iii) terminating the CCAA Proceedings and discharging Richter as Monitor in respect of Aralez Canada upon 

the filing of a certificate by the Monitor (save and except for certain further responsibilities pertaining to 

claims filed against Aralez Canada pursuant to the Claims Process) (the “Aralez Canada CCAA 

Termination Order”).  

8. On December 17, 2018, the Court granted orders approving, among other things: 

(i) the transaction contemplated by the asset purchase agreement (the “Intercept APA”) dated December 6, 

2018, between Aralez Canada and Intercept Pharmaceuticals, Inc. (“Intercept”), for the sale of the 

Bezafibrate US Assets (as defined in the Intercept APA) (the “Intercept Transaction”); 

(ii) vesting in Intercept, upon the closing of the Intercept Transaction, Aralez Canada’s right, title and interest 

in and to the Bezafibrate US Assets; and 

(iii) the distribution protocol for any interim or future distributions made in cash or otherwise to Deerfield Private 

Design Fund III, L.P. and Deerfield Partners, L.P., (collectively, “Deerfield” or the “DIP Lender”), subject 

to Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc. maintaining a sufficient reserve of funds (the “Reserve”) to satisfy priority 

charges, any post-closing matters related to the Nuvo Transaction,  and the ongoing obligations of Aralez 

Pharmaceuticals Inc. (such order being the “Distribution Order”). 
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9. On January 30, 2019, the Court granted orders: 

(i) authorizing Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc. to change its corporate name to Old API Wind-down Ltd. (“API”) 

and amending the style of cause of the CCAA Proceedings, which was a requirement of the Share 

Purchase Agreement; and  

(ii) extending the stay of proceedings in respect of API to April 19, 2019. 

10. On March 28, 2019, the Court granted an order (the “March 28 Order”) authorizing API to transfer certain 

intercompany claims to one or more of its affiliates for nominal consideration and extending the stay of 

proceedings in respect of API to July 31, 2019.  

11. Richter, in its capacities as Proposed Monitor and Monitor, has previously provided this Court with nine reports 

(the “Prior Reports”).  Pursuant to the Aralez Canada CCAA Termination Order, this Court has approved the 

pre-filing, first, second, third, fourth and fifth reports of the Monitor and the activities and conduct of the Monitor 

referred to therein.  The Monitor did not, however, seek approval of its accounts or those of its counsel, Torys 

LLP (“Torys”), at the time that the Aralez Canada CCAA Termination Order was obtained.   

12. A copy of the sixth report of the Monitor dated December 12, 2018 (the “Sixth Report”), the seventh report of the 

Monitor dated January 25, 2019 (the “Seventh Report”), and the eighth report of the Monitor dated March 21, 

2019 (the “Eighth Report”), are attached hereto (without appendices) as Appendices “A”, “B”, and “C”, 

respectively.   

13. The Amended Initial Order and copies of other material documents pertaining to the CCAA Proceedings are 

available on the Monitor’s website at http://insolvency.richter.ca/A/Aralez-Pharmaceuticals. 

II. PURPOSE OF REPORT 

14. The purpose of this report of the Monitor (the “Ninth Report”) is to provide information to the Court pertaining to: 

(i) the activities of the Monitor since the Eighth Report;  

(ii) an update on certain matters in connection with the CCAA Proceedings, including the Nuvo Transaction, 

distributions made to Deerfield and the Claims Process; 

(iii) API’s reported receipts and disbursements for the period from March 16, 2019, to May 3, 2019, including 

a comparison of reported to forecast results;  

(iv) the accounts of the Monitor and its legal counsel, Torys, since the commencement of the proceedings up 

to and including April 30, 2019, and the estimated additional fees and disbursements to the effective date 

of the termination of the CCAA Proceedings; 

http://insolvency.richter.ca/A/Aralez-Pharmaceuticals
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(v) API’s motion for an order (the “Termination Order”): 

(a) approving the Sixth Report, the Seventh Report, the Eighth Report and the Ninth Report, and the 

activities, actions and the conduct of the Monitor set out therein; 

(b) approving the accounts of the Monitor and Torys, including the Remaining Fees and Disbursements 

(as hereinafter defined), as set out in this Ninth Report; 

(c) terminating, releasing and discharging, effective immediately upon the granting of such order, the DIP 

Lender’s Charge (as defined in the Initial Order), the Bid Protections Charge, the Key Employees 

Charge, and the Transactional Fee Charge (as defined in the Amended Initial Order);  

(d) authorizing API to file an assignment in bankruptcy; 

(e) terminating the CCAA Proceedings and the stay of proceedings upon the filing of a certificate (the 

“Discharge Certificate”) by the Monitor with the Court certifying that the Remaining Matters (as 

hereinafter defined) have been completed; 

(f) terminating, releasing and discharging the Administration Charge and the D&O Charge (each as 

defined in the Initial Order), effective upon the filing of the Discharge Certificate;  

(g) discharging Richter in its capacity as Monitor upon the filing of the Discharge Certificate; and 

(h) upon the Monitor’s discharge, releasing Richter from any and all liability that it now has, or may 

hereafter have, by reason of, or in any way arising out of, its acts or omissions while acting as Monitor, 

save and except for any gross negligence or willful misconduct on the part of the Monitor. 

III. TERMS OF REFERENCE 

15. In preparing this Ninth Report, the Monitor has relied solely on information and documents provided by API and 

its financial advisor, Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. and Alvarez & Marsal Healthcare Industry Group LLC 

(collectively, “A&M”), including unaudited financial information and declarations and affidavits of API executives 

(collectively, the “Information”). In accordance with industry practice, Richter has reviewed the Information for 

reasonableness, internal consistency and use in the context in which it was provided.  However, the Monitor has 

not audited or otherwise attempted to verify the accuracy or completeness of the Information in a manner that 

would wholly or partially comply with Generally Accepted Auditing Standards (“GAAS”) pursuant to the Chartered 

Professional Accountants of Canada Handbook and, accordingly, the Monitor expresses no opinion or other form 

of assurance contemplated under GAAS in respect of the Information. 

16. Unless otherwise stated, all monetary amounts noted herein are expressed in United States (“U.S.”) dollars, 

which is API’s common reporting currency.   
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17. Capitalized terms used but not defined in this Ninth Report are defined in the Affidavit of Mr. Christopher Freeland 

sworn May 8, 2019 (the “May 8 Freeland Affidavit”), filed in support of the within motion.  This Ninth Report 

should be read in conjunction with the May 8 Freeland Affidavit, as certain information contained in the May 8 

Freeland Affidavit has not been included herein in order to avoid unnecessary duplication. 

IV. ACTIVITIES OF THE MONITOR 

18. Since the date of the Ninth Report, the Monitor’s activities have included: 

(i) monitoring of API’s cash flows and reviewing analyses on variances to API’s cash flow forecast; 

(ii) approving the payment of certain post-filing obligations of API pursuant to the terms of the Amended Initial 

Order; 

(iii) attending at Court in connection with the March 28 Order;  

(iv) corresponding with API, Nuvo, Deerfield, and their respective advisors, in respect of the claims received 

pursuant to the Claims Process; 

(v) reviewing the Closing Date Statement (as hereinafter defined) and dealing with other post-closing matters 

in connection with the Nuvo Transaction;  

(vi) corresponding with A&M, API and Deerfield with respect to the making of one or more further distributions 

to Deerfield from the funds in the Reserve; 

(vii) corresponding and communicating with Deerfield and its legal counsel; 

(viii) corresponding and communicating with Torys; 

(ix) monitoring the Chapter 11 Proceedings and matters of interest to API in the Chapter 11 Proceedings;  

(x) responding to calls and enquiries from creditors and other stakeholders regarding the CCAA Proceedings;  

(xi) posting materials to the Monitor’s website; and 

(xii) preparing this Ninth Report. 

V. UPDATE ON CERTAIN MATTERS RELATED TO THE CCAA PROCEEDINGS 

Nuvo Transaction 

19. Pursuant to the Share Purchase Agreement, Nuvo was required to prepare and deliver to API, within 75 days of 

the Closing Date, a statement (the “Closing Date Statement”) setting forth Nuvo’s calculation of the Closing Net 

Working Capital, the Closing Indebtedness, and the Closing Net Cash (each term as defined in the Share 

Purchase Agreement).  As noted in the Eighth Report, the Closing Date Statement was delivered by Nuvo on 
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March 15, 2019.  On April 4, 2019, API delivered a notice (the “Notice of Objection”) to Nuvo objecting to the 

Closing Date Statement. 

20. After ongoing discussions among Nuvo and API, in consultation with the Monitor and Deerfield, and their 

respective advisors, the parties resolved the Notice of Objection without the need for the dispute resolution 

process contemplated under the Share Purchase Agreement.  On May 7, 2019, the parties reached an agreement 

in principle that would result in an approximately $1.8 million (the “Adjustment Amount”) post-closing increase 

to the purchase price and corresponding payment from Nuvo to API.  The parties are currently in the process of 

documenting the agreement. 

21. As a result of the foregoing, the final proceeds from the Nuvo Transaction will amount to approximately $59.5 

million, which amount includes the $2.5 million deposit previously paid by Nuvo to the Escrow Agent (as defined 

in the Share Purchase Agreement).  Once payment of the Adjustment Amount is received from Nuvo, all matters 

to be attended to in connection with the Nuvo Transaction will be complete and accordingly, Nuvo and API shall 

instruct the Escrow Agent to release the remaining $1.0 million held from the initial deposit to the Monitor. 

Claims Process 

22. The Monitor received 39 claims (the “Aralez Canada Claims”) totalling $66.7 million filed against Aralez Canada 

and 34 claims (the “API Claims”) totaling $136.9 million filed against API as at the Claims Bar Date.  All of the 

Aralez Canada Claims have been irrevocably settled or withdrawn.  In addition to the Aralez Canada Claims, the 

Monitor received two additional Pre-Filing Claims (as defined in the Claims Procedure Order) (the “Late Claims”) 

filed after the Claims Bar Date against Aralez Canada.   

23. Pursuant to the Claims Procedure Order, any person that did not file a proof of claim on or before the Claims Bar 

Date is not entitled to receive any distribution in respect of such claim and is barred from making or enforcing 

such claim against the Companies and their directors and officers.  Further, the Monitor nor API has any discretion 

to accept any claim submitted subsequent to the Claims Bar Date.   

24. As part of the ongoing efforts to resolve the Notice of Objection, API and Nuvo agreed that Aralez Canada (now 

owned by Nuvo) will address the Late Claims.  Counsel to API has advised the Monitor that notice will be sent to 

the holders of the Late Claims advising that the Late Claims have been barred pursuant to the Claims Procedure 

Order, and that it would be up to the claimants to seek resolution of the Late Claims with Aralez Canada or relief 

from the Court.  Any resolution of the Late Claims will not impact the Adjustment Amount.   

25. The Claims Procedure Order does not establish a process for the resolution or adjudication of Claims.  As the 

API Claims are all either unsecured or equity claims, and Deerfield, as the secured creditor of the Aralez Entities, 
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including API, will suffer a significant shortfall on its advances, there will be no recovery available to creditors or 

shareholders in respect of the API Claims.  As such, API does not intend to seek a further order of the Court to 

determine and resolve any of the API Claims.   

Distributions 

26. The Distribution Order provides that any portion of the Reserve determined by the Monitor, in consultation with 

API and Deerfield, to no longer be necessary or appropriate to retain, shall be distributed to Deerfield as soon as 

practicable following such determination, up to the maximum amount of the obligations owing by the Aralez 

Entities under the June 8, 2015, loan agreement (as amended) (the “Facility Agreement”) between Deerfield, 

as lender, and API, Aralez Canada and Pozen, as borrowers.  As noted in the Prior Reports, the Aralez Entities 

owed Deerfield approximately $281.5 million under the Facility Agreement as at the Filing Date, of which 

approximately $54 million1 remained outstanding after accounting for the distributions made by the Aralez 

Entities, including API, to Deerfield as part of the CCAA Proceedings and the Chapter 11 Proceedings. 

27. On April 26, 2019, Travis and Tonya Gunderson (collectivity, the “Gundersons”), shareholders of API that filed 

a claim against API as part of the Claims Process, contacted the Monitor via email to request, inter alia, that the 

Monitor: (i) inform the Court of the Gundersons’ objection to the planned sale of Zontivity, filed in the Chapter 11 

Proceedings; and (ii) make no further distributions to Deerfield until the Gundersons’ claim against API is settled.  

The Gundersons have apparently detailed this and other objections – including allegations with respect to the 

role and conduct of Deerfield and the propriety of Deerfield receiving distributions in priority to shareholders – in 

filings made in the Chapter 11 Proceedings. The Monitor notes that the Gundersons also filed a claim against 

Aralez Canada for financial losses incurred in connection with their API shareholdings, but subsequently agreed 

to irrevocably withdraw the claim as against Aralez Canada.   

28. On May 3, 2019, the Monitor’s counsel informed Mr. Gunderson that: (i) the Monitor has no formal role in the U.S. 

Chapter 11 Proceedings; and (ii) in light of the Distribution Order (which authorized and directed the Monitor to 

make interim and future distributions to Deerfield), the Monitor has no authority to elect to cease making 

distributions to Deerfield.  The Monitor’s counsel informed Mr. Gunderson of the within motion and pending motion 

materials (which have been or will be provided to the Gundersons) and agreed that the Monitor would inform the 

Court of the Gundersons’ objection filed in the Chapter 11 Proceedings.   

29. As at May 3, 2019, API had distributed approximately $57.4 million to Deerfield pursuant to the Distribution Order, 

either by way of direction or set-off of debt amounts.  As discussed in greater detail below, approximately $5.6 

                                                 
1 As set out in the Disclosure Statement Supplement for Second Amended Joint Liquidating Plan of the Debtors Under Chapter 11 
of the Bankruptcy Code, dated March 27, 2019, Exhibit 1 page 9 (Docket 607). 
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million remained in the Reserve as at May 3, 2019.  The granting of the Termination Order and the relief therein 

will facilitate the making of one or more further distributions to Deerfield. 

VI. CASH RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS FROM MARCH 16, 2019 TO MAY 3, 2019 

30. API’s consolidated cash flow projection for the period from March 16, 2019, to August 2, 2019 (the “March 16 

Cash Flow Forecast”), was filed with the Court in support of its application for the March 28 Order. 

31. API has continued to provide the Monitor with its cooperation and access to its books and records. The Monitor 

has implemented procedures for monitoring API’s receipts and disbursements.  The Monitor, with the assistance 

of A&M, has also worked with API to prepare forecast to actual variance analyses with respect to its weekly cash 

flows as compared to the March 16 Cash Flow Forecast. 

32. A summary of API’s actual to forecast results as compared to the March 16 Cash Flow Forecast for the period 

from March 16, 2019, to May 3, 2019, is set out as follows: 

 

33. As reflected in the summary table above, API reported a net cash outflow of CAD$0.9 million over the period, 

and a cash balance of approximately CAD$5.4 million, as at May 3, 2019.  The actual cash balance was 

approximately CAD$2.2 million higher than forecast.  The favourable cash flow variance principally relates to 

timing differences due to lower than projected professional fees, mainly with respect to transaction fees payable 

to API’s investment banker. 

34. The Monitor notes that the cash balance does not take into account the: (i) $1.5 million held by the Monitor as 

part of the Reserve and (ii) the $1.0 million held by the Escrow Agent as the balance of the deposit pursuant to 

Old API Wind-Down Ltd. (formerly Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.)

Cash Flow Variance Analysis

For the Period March 16 to May 3, 2019

(C$ in Millions) Forecast Actual Variance

Total Receipts $0.00 $0.06 $0.06

DISBURSEMENTS

Operating Expenses ($0.28) ($0.21) $0.07

Professional Fees (2.78) (0.71) 2.08

Total Disbursements ($3.06) ($0.92) $2.15

Total Net Cash Flow ($3.06) ($0.86) $2.21

CASH BALANCE

Beginning Balance $6.21 $6.21 $0.00

Total Net Cash Flow (3.06) (0.86) 2.21

Ending Balance $3.15 $5.36 $2.21
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the Share Purchase Agreement.  Adjusting for these amounts, the aggregate ending cash balance available to 

API would be approximately CAD$8.6 million, of which, $5.6 million (CAD$7.3 million) relates to the Reserve. 

VII. UPDATE ON THE CHAPTER 11 PROCEEDINGS 

U.S. Plan 

35. On February 5, 2019, the Chapter 11 Debtors, excluding Trading DAC, filed with the U.S. Court a Joint Liquidating 

Plan of Certain of the Debtors under Chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code (the “Plan”) and the Disclosure 

Statement to the Plan.   

36. With the closing of the sale of the Toprol-XL franchise and the consensual resolution of the disputes among the 

Chapter 11 Debtors, Deerfield and AstraZeneca AB, the Chapter 11 Debtors filed their second amended Joint 

Liquidating Plan (the “Second Amended Plan”), which incorporated Trading DAC as a “Debtor” under the Plan 

and provided for the classification and treatment of claims against Trading DAC.  On March 27, 2019, the Chapter 

11 Debtors filed a supplement to the Disclosure Statement (the “Disclosure Statement Supplement”) for the 

Second Amended Plan. 

37. Pursuant to the Disclosure Statement Supplement, the holders of general unsecured claims against the Chapter 

11 Debtors (excluding Trading DAC) are projected to receive an estimated recovery of 51% on their prepetition 

claims, based on their pro rata share of a $3.25 million fund available for payment to general unsecured creditors.   

38. Based on the information available on the U.S. docket, the Chapter 11 Debtors received acceptance of the 

Second Amended Plan by each of the eligible voting classes.  

39. On May 6, 2019, the U.S. Court heard the Chapter 11 Debtors’ motion for approval of the Second Amended Plan 

and granted an Order (I) Approving the Disclosure Statement Supplement and (II) Confirming the Second 

Amended Plan.  The Monitor understands the Chapter 11 Debtors anticipate the Second Amended Plan to be 

implemented before the end of May 2019.  

40. The Second Amended Plan requires that APUS merge with APMI and become the ultimate parent company of 

APHL. As both APMI and APHL are currently wholly owned by API, prior to the effective date of the Second 

Amended Plan, API will consent to the merger of APUS and APMI, and transfer its shares in APHL to APUS.  As 

noted in the May 8 Freeland Affidavit, the shares of APMI and APHL have nominal equity value and the sole 

purpose of the transfers is to facilitate the implementation of the Second Amended Plan and the wind-up of API’s 

subsidiaries.   
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Sale of Zontivity 

41. On May 6, 2019, the U.S. Court heard the Chapter 11 Debtors’ motion for Order (A) Authorizing and Approving 

(I) Sale of Zontivity Related Assets Free and Clear of Liens, Claims and Encumbrances, (II) Assumption and 

Assignment of Certain Executory Contracts, and (III) Settlement with Licensor of Related Intellectual Property; 

and (B) Granting Related Relief (the “Zontivity Sale Order”).  As noted above, the Gundersons objected to the 

granting of the Zontivity Sale Order. 

42. The U.S. Court entered the Zontivity Sale Order on May 6, 2019 and the Chapter 11 Debtors anticipate closing 

to occur on or about May 10, 2019. 

VIII. DISCHARGE OF THE MONITOR AND TERMINATION OF THE CCAA PROCEEDINGS 

43. As noted in the May 8 Freeland Affidavit, API has no ongoing business operations and substantially all of its 

assets in Canada were sold pursuant to the Nuvo Transaction and the Intercept Transaction.  However, there 

remain certain administrative matters (collectively, the “Remaining Matters”) that need to be resolved by API, 

including: 

(i) providing for the winding up of certain subsidiaries of API; 

(ii) distributing the remaining proceeds from the Nuvo Transaction and the Reserve to Deerfield; and 

(iii) transitioning the CCAA Proceedings into bankruptcy proceedings to allow for an orderly wind-up of API.  

44. Once the Remaining Matters are completed, there will no longer be any need for the CCAA Proceedings.  As 

such, API seeks the Termination Order providing for the termination of the CCAA Proceedings on the filing of the 

Discharge Certificate.  The Termination Order and the proposed ancillary relief related thereto are being sought 

by API at this time in order to maximize efficiency and avoid the need for additional future Court appearances. 

45. The proposed Termination Order provides for the termination, release and discharge of the DIP Lender’s Charge, 

the Bid Protections Charge, the Key Employees Charge and the Transactional Fee Charge, effective upon the 

issuance of the Termination Order.  As such, only the Administration Charge and the D&O Charge will remain 

until the delivery of the Discharge Certificate.   

46. Subsequent to the eventual termination of the CCAA Proceedings, API will have no material assets with which to 

pay its remaining obligations, including the API Claims.  To provide some finality to these proceedings, the 

proposed Termination Order authorizes, inter alia, API to file an assignment in bankruptcy and a lifting of the stay 

of proceedings to permit such assignment.  Should the Court grant the requested relief, Richter has agreed to 

act as trustee in bankruptcy (the “Trustee”), provided that it receives funding for the administration of the 
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proceedings (there are no material assets remaining in the estate).  Deerfield has agreed, in order to fund the 

bankruptcy, to provide a limited guarantee of the fees and disbursements of the Trustee (including those of its 

legal counsel).  In support of such guarantee, Deerfield has agreed to the transfer by the Monitor of $100,000 

(the “Administration Deposit”) from the funds remaining in the Reserve to the Trustee.  As a matter of 

expediency, the proposed Termination Order authorizes and directs the Monitor to transfer the Administration 

Deposit to the Trustee, concurrently with the commencement of the bankruptcy proceedings. 

47. Upon the filing of the Discharge Certificate, the proposed Termination Order also provides for: 

(i) the discharge of the Administration Charge; 

(ii) the discharge of the D&O Charge; 

(iii) the termination of the stay of proceedings granted in the CCAA Proceedings; and 

(iv) the discharge of the Monitor and related customary relief, including a release of claims against the Monitor. 

48. The proposed Termination Order contemplates releases effective to the date of the Termination Order if granted 

(the “Releases”) and separate releases for the period between the date of the Termination Order and the effective 

date of the termination of the CCAA Proceedings (the “Subsequent Releases”). The proposed Termination Order 

provides that the Monitor shall, at least seven days prior to the filing of the Discharge Certificate, provide notice 

to the service list in order to provide an opportunity for any interested party to object to the Subsequent Releases. 

49. If no objections are received before the proposed filing date, the Subsequent Releases shall become effective on 

the date the Discharge Certificate is filed. If any objection is received within the seven-day period, the Subsequent 

Releases shall only become effective if the objection is resolved or upon further order of the Court. 

IX. REQUEST FOR APPROVAL OF FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS 

50. The Monitor and Torys have maintained detailed records of their professional time and disbursements prior to 

and since the Monitor’s appointment. 

51. Pursuant to paragraph 29 of the Amended Initial Order, the Monitor and its counsel shall each be paid their 

reasonable fees and disbursements as part of the CCAA Proceedings.  Further, pursuant to paragraph 30 of the 

Amended Initial Order, the Monitor and its legal counsel shall pass their accounts from time to time.  As noted 

above, this Court has already approved the activities and conduct of the Monitor as set out in the first, second, 

third, fourth and fifth reports of the Monitor (although the fees and disbursements in connection with such activities 

and conducts were not previously approved). 
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52. The total fees and disbursements of the Monitor during the period from July 31, 2018, to April 30, 2019 (the 

“Richter Fee Period”), amount to $865,328.75, together with disbursements in the amount of $61,872.21, both 

excluding sales taxes (collectively, the “Richter Accounts”).  These amounts represent professional fees and 

disbursements not yet approved by the Court.  Attached hereto as Appendix “D” is the affidavit of Pritesh Patel 

in respect of the Richter Accounts.  

53. The total fees and disbursements of Torys during the period from July 6, 2018, to April 30, 2019 (the “Torys Fee 

Period”), amount to $587,886.00, together with disbursements in the amount of $20,948.38, both excluding sales 

taxes (collectively, the “Torys Accounts”).  These amounts represent professional fees and disbursements not 

yet approved by the Court.  Attached hereto as Appendix “E” is the affidavit of Lily Coodin in respect of the 

Torys Accounts.   

54. The Monitor has reviewed the Torys Accounts and confirms that the services reflected therein have been duly 

authorized and duly rendered and that, in the Monitor’s opinion, the charges are reasonable. 

55. On the assumption that there are no delays, disputes or unforeseen developments in connection with these 

proceedings, including the within motion and the performance of the Remaining Matters, the Monitor has 

estimated fees and disbursements in the amount of $75,000, excluding applicable taxes (the “Remaining Fees 

and Disbursements”), for services that have been provided or will be provided for the period from May 1, 2019 

to the date of the Discharge Certificate, as follows: 

(i) Richter - $50,000; and 

(ii) Torys - $25,000. 

56. The above estimates take into consideration the reasonable professional and legal fees required to prepare the 

Ninth Report, participate in the within motion, and complete the Remaining Matters up to the effective date of 

discharge.  If the actual Remaining Fees and Disbursements are less than the above estimates, no further Court 

approval of fees is required.  If the actual Remaining Fees and Disbursements exceed the estimates, the Monitor 

will seek the consent of API to pay same, without further Order of the Court.  

57. The fees and disbursements of the Monitor and its counsel, including the Remaining Fees and Disbursements, 

have been reviewed by API and Deerfield.  The Monitor has been advised that API and Deerfield do not oppose 

these fees and disbursements.   
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Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Date: 08/24/2018
Invoice No.: 20403178

Engagement No.: 2021281
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered to August 19, 2018 $ 124,308.25

Disbursements  102.59

Sub-Total 124,410.84
Technology and Administrative Fees 6,215.41
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 16,981.41

Total Due CAD $ 147,607.66



Invoice No.: 20403178
Date: 08/24/2018

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Sherman 2.50 $ 795.00 $ 1,987.50
Adam Zeldin 67.50  400.00  27,000.00
Carol O'Donnell 1.90  200.00  380.00
Eric Finley 16.25  300.00  4,875.00
Paul Van Eyk 48.85  795.00  38,835.75
Pritesh Patel 76.60  650.00  49,790.00
Soazig Bourgine 7.20  200.00  1,440.00

220.80 $ 124,308.25
Disbursements

Disbursements $ 102.59

$ 102.59



Invoice No.: 20403178
Date: 08/24/2018

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

07/31/2018 Paul Van Eyk 4.00 $ 795.00 $ 3,180.00
Preparing draft pre-filing report, emails with
A&M and Stikeman, review of material.

08/01/2018 Paul Van Eyk 4.00  795.00  3,180.00
Reviewing material, preparing draft report.

08/01/2018 Pritesh Patel 0.50  650.00  325.00
Update call with A&M, Stikemans, Torys re:
status and next steps.

08/01/2018 Adam Zeldin 1.80  400.00  720.00
Perform preliminary research into the
Company. Prepare summary of historical
financials for pre-filing report.

08/02/2018 Paul Van Eyk 4.25  795.00  3,378.75
Call with A&M on cash flows, review of
emails, drafting of report.

08/02/2018 Pritesh Patel 1.80  650.00  1,170.00
Call with A&M to discuss CF.  Review of CF
and discussion with A. Zeldin on same.

08/02/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.85  400.00  1,540.00
Perform preliminary research into Aralez,
including reviewing most recent public filings
and financials. Attend call with Richter team
and Alvarez & Marsal re: 13-week cash flow.
Review 13-week cash flow, and discussion
with P. Patel.

08/03/2018 Paul Van Eyk 8.25  795.00  6,558.75
Review of draft materials, emails with Torys
and Stikemans, emails and discussions with
Richter professionals, drafting of report,
review of CF material and other financial
details.

08/03/2018 Pritesh Patel 3.50  650.00  2,275.00
Review of CF with A. Zeldin, and call with
A&M on same. Review of draft motion
materials from Stikeman. Review of revised
CF from A&M.

08/03/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.60  400.00  1,840.00
Continue to review 13-week cash flow,
including updates thereto. Prepare questions
for A&M re: cash flow and attend call with
A&M re: same. Correspond with A&M re:
various other matters. Review June 2018 trial
balance. Review pre-filing payables analysis.

08/03/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.80  400.00  1,120.00
Draft newspaper notice. Prepare Form 1.
Review drafts of the initial affidavit and initial
order. Correspond with Richter team re:
various matters.

08/04/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.00  795.00  2,385.00



Invoice No.: 20403178
Date: 08/24/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Preparing draft reports, review of documents,
discussions with P. Patel, emails with Torys.

08/04/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.50  650.00  1,625.00
Review of draft Pre-Filing Report and
comments to P. Van Eyk on same.  Review
of draft DIP and comments to P. Van Eyk
and D.Bish.

08/04/2018 Adam Zeldin 1.30  400.00  520.00
Review and comment on Pre-filing Report.

08/05/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.00  795.00  1,590.00
Review of draft report, discussions with P.
Patel, review of emails.

08/05/2018 Pritesh Patel 6.50  650.00  4,225.00
Review and edits to revised Pre-Filing
Report. Review revised Affidavit and update
Pre-Filing Report accordingly.

08/05/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.20  400.00  1,280.00
Review historical financials and prepare
tables for the Pre-filing Report re: same.
Review and comment on Pre-filing Report.

08/06/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.50  795.00  2,782.50
Review of emails, call with P. Patel on Torys
comments, review of Torys comments,
review of latest draft report.

08/06/2018 Pritesh Patel 6.00  650.00  3,900.00
Finalize draft Pre-Filing Report and circulate
to Torys for comments. Review of comments
and call with P. Van Eyk on same. Update
report and circulate revised draft to Richter
team. Reivew of revised DIP and comments
on same.

08/06/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.40  400.00  1,760.00
Correspond with Richter team re: Pre-filing
Report and other matters. Review/update
Pre-filing Report. Review updated Initial
Affidavit.

08/07/2018 Paul Van Eyk 5.50  795.00  4,372.50
Review of draft material, call with A&M, call
with counsel and A&M, review affidavit,
discussions with Richter team.

08/07/2018 Pritesh Patel 8.00  650.00  5,200.00
A&M call to discuss CF/pre-filing liabilities.
Stikemans call to discuss outstanding issues.
Call with Torys to discuss DIP/outstanding
issues. Continuing review/edits to Report,
review of revised Affidavit. Correspondence
re: creditor inquiries/hotlines.

08/07/2018 Adam Zeldin 10.20  400.00  4,080.00



Invoice No.: 20403178
Date: 08/24/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review updates to Initial Affidavit.
Review/update multiple versions of Pre-filing
Report. Attend call with A&M/Aralez re:
various matters. Correspond with A&M re:
pre-filing liabilties, 13-week cash flow/other
matters. Meeting with Richter team.

08/08/2018 Soazig Bourgine 1.00  200.00  200.00
Initial documents (Monitor's & Company's
reports on cash flow, draft of Mailing, etc).

08/08/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.00  795.00  1,590.00
Review of emails, discussions with P. Patel,
review material.

08/08/2018 Adam Sherman 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review, revise, update and provide
comments on proposed monitor report,
including emails/discussions with Richter
team.

08/08/2018 Pritesh Patel 10.50  650.00  6,825.00
Continuing review and edits to Report, review
of revised Affidavit. Call with A&M re: CF,
pre-filing liabilities, etc. Review of comments
from A. Sherman on Report.
Correspondence with counsel re: Admin
Charge, DIP.

08/08/2018 Adam Zeldin 9.40  400.00  3,760.00
Review updated pre-filing AP schedule;
discuss same with A&M. Attend calls with
A&M/Company re: historical financials and
other various matters. Review/update the
Monitor's pre-filing report. Review/comment
on updated 13-week CF; discuss same with
A&M.

08/09/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.40  795.00  2,703.00
Emails, discussions with Torys, discussions
with P. Patel, review of material.

08/09/2018 Adam Sherman 1.50  795.00  1,192.50
Review, revise, update and provide
comments on proposed monitor report.
Review and provide comments on cash flow
reports (debtor and monitor).
Emails/discussions with Richter team.

08/09/2018 Pritesh Patel 13.50  650.00  8,775.00
Review and edits to Pre-Filing Report.
Review of multiple revisions of Affidavit and
updates to Report. Call with A&M re: revised
CF, communications. Review and sign-off on
CF reports. Review of revised DIP, IO. Calls
with counsel re: fees, CF.

08/09/2018 Adam Zeldin 11.25  400.00  4,500.00



Invoice No.: 20403178
Date: 08/24/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review/update several versions of Mointor's
pre-filing report. Review updated 13-week
cash flow and notes; correspond with A&M
re: same. Format cash flow for next day
filing. Review/update managements/monitors
report on cash flow.

08/09/2018 Eric Finley 4.50  300.00  1,350.00
Review materials, provide comments and
work with Richter team to summarize
financial tables and finalize Report. Review
employee and vendor correspondence
packages and provide comments.

08/10/2018 Soazig Bourgine 1.50  200.00  300.00
Website set up & postings, CCAA filings,
communication with Niwri Media for
Newspaper Ad.

08/10/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails and attachments.

08/10/2018 Pritesh Patel 3.80  650.00  2,470.00
Finalize Report. Prep and attendance in
Court for Initial Order. Call with A&M re: cash
flow reporting, info requests, revised CF.
Review of Form 1 and newspaper ad.
Correspondence with counsel re: revised IO,
service list. Responding to creditor inquiry.

08/10/2018 Adam Zeldin 6.30  400.00  2,520.00
Attend at court in connection with CCAA
application. Attend call with A&M re: cash
flow monitoring plan, next steps and the
proceedings generally. Review/update
newspaper notice to creditors and Form 1;
discuss same with Richter team. Prepare
Form 2.

08/13/2018 Soazig Bourgine 0.30  200.00  60.00
Emails to Niwri media re: Newspaper ad.

08/13/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.30  650.00  1,495.00
Calls with A. Zeldin re: creditor listing,
payment process, etc.  Review and sign-off
on newspaper advertisement.  File
administration.

08/13/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.70  400.00  1,880.00
Attend at Aralez. Attend
meetings/correspond  with Company
(Controller/Treasurer)/A&M re: CF
monitoring, preparing a creditors list and
other matters.

08/13/2018 Adam Zeldin 1.40  400.00  560.00
Review/Update Form 2 and compile
questions for Company re: same; discuss
same with Company. Prepare draft notice to
creditors.



Invoice No.: 20403178
Date: 08/24/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

08/14/2018 Soazig Bourgine 0.50  200.00  100.00
Email A. Zeldin re: Notice to Creditors,
website posting and e-filing.

08/14/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.00  795.00  1,590.00
Review of draft material, emails, call with P.
Patel.

08/14/2018 Pritesh Patel 7.50  650.00  4,875.00
Review payment request, including support
for all critical payments. Calls with A&M to
discuss payment request. Review of SPA.
Call with Torys re: critical payments and
SPA. Email to Bennett Jones on critical
payments. Calls with P. Van Eyk re: status.

08/14/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.30  400.00  920.00
Review schedule of planned cheque run for
the current week. Correspond with Richter
team re: same. Correspond with A&M re:
various matters concerning filing statutory
documents. Review proposed purchase of
product and correspond with the Company
re: same.

08/14/2018 Eric Finley 2.50  300.00  750.00
Review cheques provided by A&M re: first
cheque run and summarize findings. Discuss
internally with Richter team.

08/15/2018 Soazig Bourgine 0.60  200.00  120.00
Notice to Creditors, form 2.

08/15/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.75  795.00  1,391.25
Review of emails, review of draft material,
discussion with P. Patel, call with Torys.

08/15/2018 Pritesh Patel 4.50  650.00  2,925.00
Review revised payment request and calls
with A&M on same. Review of
correspondence re: prepayments for
inventory.  Review of bidding procedures
order.  Email to Deerfield re: critical
payments. Calls with P. Van Eyk re: fees and
status.

08/15/2018 Eric Finley 3.25  300.00  975.00
Call with A&M to review pre-filing payments
worksheet. Review worksheet before call.
Review invoices for pre-filing calls,
summarize samples findings and discuss
internally with Richter team. Summarize
findings for email to Deerfield.

08/16/2018 Carol O'Donnell 1.40  200.00  280.00
Prepare creditor list. Review of mailing.

08/16/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.00  795.00  2,385.00
Review of SPA, comments, review and
exchange of emails with P. Patel and Torys.



Invoice No.: 20403178
Date: 08/24/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

08/16/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.50  650.00  1,625.00
Correspondence with A&M/Company re:
payments.  Review and edits to Notice,
discussions with E. Finley re: creditor listing.
Finalize Form 2.  Review of draft CF
variance.

08/16/2018 Eric Finley 3.25  300.00  975.00
Review creditor listing provided by A&M.
Cross reference to AP payable, add relevant
parties summarize for internal purposes.
Send listing and outstanding to A&M for
review. Draft sample deposit letter, send to
A&M.

08/17/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.50  200.00  100.00
Amend creditor list. Review of emails for
mailing.

08/17/2018 Soazig Bourgine 3.30  200.00  660.00
Notice to creditors, emails, website posting,
e-filing, list of creditors.

08/17/2018 Pritesh Patel 3.20  650.00  2,080.00
Review of materials re: KEIP/KERP, updated
SPA, Bidding Procedures and comments to
counsel on same.  Call with Torys re:
KEIP/KERP.

08/17/2018 Eric Finley 2.75  300.00  825.00
Review/finalize creditor listing for posting to
Richter website. Review variance analysis
and cross reference to known payments.
Discuss with A&M. Various calls with A&M.
Discuss internally with Richter team.

08/19/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.20  795.00  954.00
Review of emails, documents, emails with
Torys and P. Patel.

Fees Total 220.80 $ 124,308.25

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount
08/17/2018 Disbursements $ 102.59

08/17/2018: Postage: Notice To Creditors Of
Intial Order

Disbursements Total $ 102.59



Invoice No.: 20403178
Date: 08/24/2018

Remittance Form
Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 124,410.84
Technology and Administrative Fees 6,215.41
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 16,981.41

Total Due CAD $ 147,607.66

Payment Options

Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank
Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Cheques Payable to: Richter Advisory Group Inc.
Send to: 181 Bay Street, Suite 3320, Bay Wellington Tower, Toronto ON  M5J 2T3

Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca



Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Date: 09/24/2018
Invoice No.: 20403295

Engagement No.: 2021281
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered to September 14, 2018 $ 91,702.00

Disbursements  6,630.42

Sub-Total 98,332.42
Technology and Administrative Fees 4,585.10
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 13,379.27

Total Due CAD $ 116,296.79



Invoice No.: 20403295
Date: 09/24/2018

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Zeldin 81.45 $ 400.00 $ 32,580.00
Carol O'Donnell 0.40  200.00  80.00
Cindy Michaud 0.30  200.00  60.00
Eric Finley 11.00  300.00  3,300.00
Paul Van Eyk 35.60  795.00  28,302.00
Pritesh Patel 41.20  650.00  26,780.00
Soazig Bourgine 3.00  200.00  600.00

172.95 $ 91,702.00
Disbursements

Disbursements $ 6,630.42

$ 6,630.42



Invoice No.: 20403295
Date: 09/24/2018

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

08/20/2018 Paul Van Eyk 0.50 $ 795.00 $ 397.50
Review of various emails.

08/20/2018 Pritesh Patel 0.50  650.00  325.00
Review of emails from Torys re Bid
Procedures and response on same.

08/21/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.30  200.00  60.00
Communications with creditors.

08/21/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.50  795.00  1,192.50
Call with Torys, Stikes and A&M on
KERP/KEIP, review of emails.

08/21/2018 Pritesh Patel 0.50  650.00  325.00
Responding to creditor inquiries re status of
proceedings.  Review of email from A&M re
Accuristix.

08/21/2018 Eric Finley 0.50  300.00  150.00
Review payment invoices, emails from L.
Benson re payment run and discuss with
Richter team.

08/22/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.75  795.00  2,981.25
Review of draft material, discussion with
Torys, email to A&M, discussion with A&M on
KEIP/KERP

08/22/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.00  650.00  1,300.00
Review of variance reporting.  Review of
disbursement requests from A&M and follow-
up with Deerfield for approval. Review of
emails and calls with P.van Eyk re KEIP.

08/22/2018 Eric Finley 2.00  300.00  600.00
Review variance analysis provided by A&M,
review employee expenses, call with L.
Benson re. same. Discuss with Richter team.

08/23/2018 Soazig Bourgine 1.00  200.00  200.00
Prepare affidavit of mailing.

08/23/2018 Paul Van Eyk 0.20  795.00  159.00
Review of emails.

08/23/2018 Pritesh Patel 1.50  650.00  975.00
Review of payment request for API and
response to A&M on same.  Discussion with
E.Finley re variance reporting.  Call with A&M
re API payments for prior week, KEIP and CF
forecast.

08/23/2018 Eric Finley 1.00  300.00  300.00
Email L. Benson re creditor listing. Review
API invoices, discuss variance analysis with
Richter team.

08/24/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails, update call with Torys.



Invoice No.: 20403295
Date: 09/24/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

08/24/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.20  650.00  1,430.00
Correspondence with D.Bish and P.van Eyk
re budget reforecast. Review of reforecast
and call with A&M on same.  Review of case
termination order.

08/24/2018 Eric Finley 1.00  300.00  300.00
Review updated cash flow model, compare
to previous version, discuss with Richter
team.

08/26/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.25  795.00  1,788.75
Drafting of First Report, review of emails and
draft motion material.

08/27/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.00  795.00  2,385.00
Review of draft material, drafting of First
Report.

08/27/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.60  400.00  1,440.00
Correspond with Richter team re: First
Report. Review precedent cross-border
protocols for purposes of First Report.
Correspond with A&M re: variance analysis,
cash flow and other matters.

08/28/2018 Soazig Bourgine 0.60  200.00  120.00
Service List posted on website and emailed
to OSB, email to E. Finley re return to sender
mail. Motion record of the Applicant emailed
to OSB and posted on website

08/28/2018 Paul Van Eyk 8.00  795.00  6,360.00
Drafting of First Report, review of draft
materials, call with Torys, call with
Stikemans, call with Richter team.

08/28/2018 Pritesh Patel 4.00  650.00  2,600.00
Calls and correspondence with Richter team
re pre-filing payments, KEIP, First Report,
sales process, next steps. Review of
September 5 motion materials.

08/28/2018 Adam Zeldin 6.60  400.00  2,640.00
Attend at Aralez. Correspond with
Aralez/A&M/Richter team re: payment of pre-
filing liabilities. Review information included
in data room. Respond to
creditor/shareholder enquiries.
Review/comment/update variance analysis
prepared by A&M.

08/28/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.25  400.00  1,300.00
Review updates to CF and discuss same
with A&M. Deal with various cash
disbursement matters, including
corresponding with Company/A&M,
reviewing supporting docs and approving
payment.

08/28/2018 Eric Finley 2.00  300.00  600.00



Invoice No.: 20403295
Date: 09/24/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Update cashflow appendices and variance
analysis for second report.

08/29/2018 Soazig Bourgine 0.20  200.00  40.00
Send Notice of CCAA to Kuehne + Nagel
Ltd.

08/29/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.00  795.00  2,385.00
Drafting of First Report, discussion with P.
Patel.

08/29/2018 Pritesh Patel 4.00  650.00  2,600.00
Correspondence with A.Zeldin re CF and
variance analysis. Review and edits to First
Report and circulate to Richter team for
internal review.

08/29/2018 Adam Zeldin 9.20  400.00  3,680.00
Review/update First Report; Review/update
variance analysis. Attend meeting at
Company re: sales and other matters.
Correspond with A&M re: various matters.
Attend call with A&M/Mapi. Richter team
meeting re: various matters. Summarize DIP
milestones.

08/29/2018 Eric Finley 2.75  300.00  825.00
Update First Report for cash flow for the
extension period and the variance analysis.
Discuss with Richter team, update figures
and various edits to report.

08/30/2018 Soazig Bourgine 0.30  200.00  60.00
Service List and E Service List posted on
website and emailed to OSB.

08/30/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.20  795.00  1,749.00
Finalize First Report, review of comments
from Torys and Stikeman, discussion with
Richter team on report and CF isses, review
of emails.

08/30/2018 Pritesh Patel 1.50  650.00  975.00
Review comments from Stikeman on First
Report. Finalize and sign First Report for
service. Review and edits to email for Mapi.

08/30/2018 Adam Zeldin 5.60  400.00  2,240.00
Attend at Aralez. Finalize cash flow for First
Report. Correspond with Richter team re:
same. Attend meeting with Aralez sales
team. Correspond with A&M re: variance
analysis, cash flow and other matters.
Prepare pre-filing payments summary.

08/30/2018 Eric Finley 0.75  300.00  225.00
Compile First Report and appendices and
PDF for service.

08/31/2018 Cindy Michaud 0.30  200.00  60.00



Invoice No.: 20403295
Date: 09/24/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Post First Report on web site and file by
email with OSB.

08/31/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.25  795.00  993.75
Emails with Torys, call with Torys, call with P.
Patel, review of emails.

08/31/2018 Pritesh Patel 1.50  650.00  975.00
Correspondence with Aralez re payment
requests. Call with P.van Eyk re UCC and
upcoming motion.

08/31/2018 Adam Zeldin 5.45  400.00  2,180.00
Attend call/correspond with A&M and Mapi.
Correspond with A&M re: various matters.
Correspond with Company re: various
matters. Review and prepare a summary of
interco balances. Review/draft response to
enquiries from creditors.

09/04/2018 Soazig Bourgine 0.20  200.00  40.00
Factum of the Applicant posted on website
and emailed to OSB.

09/04/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails, discussion with Torys,
prep for court.

09/04/2018 Pritesh Patel 4.20  650.00  2,730.00
Review of emails from counsel re UCC.
Review of interco summary, discussions with
A.Zeldin and emails to counsels on same.
Review of comments from UCC re Cross-
Border Protocol.  Review of CF variances.
Call with API re payments.

09/04/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.30  400.00  1,320.00
Attend calls with creditors. Review updated
variance analysis. Review daily banking
activity. Attend call with API's Treasurer and
corporate counsel re: banking/cash
disbursement and other matters.

09/04/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.80  400.00  1,920.00
Attend at Aralez. Prepare summary of
Intercompany balances and correspond with
the Company/Richter team re: same. Review
proposed pre-filing payments. Correspond
with A&M/Company re: same. Correspond
with Company re: various matters.

09/05/2018 Soazig Bourgine 0.50  200.00  100.00
Website posting & email to OSB (Amended
Initial Order, endorsement & Stay extension
order).

09/05/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.00  795.00  2,385.00
Attendance in court, review of material,
discussion with Torys.

09/05/2018 Pritesh Patel 3.00  650.00  1,950.00



Invoice No.: 20403295
Date: 09/24/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Preparation for and attendance in Court for
Stay Extension motion. Review of Mapi letter
and correspondence with A&M/Stikemans on
same. Email to Deerfield re pre-filing
payments.

09/05/2018 Adam Zeldin 5.60  400.00  2,240.00
Review amendments to Initial Order.
Correspond with A&M/Company re: various
matters. Review proposed payments to
vendors for current week cheque run and
discuss same with Company/A&M.

09/05/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.20  400.00  880.00
Review/comment on supplier letter to Mapi.
Correspond with A&M/Stikemans re: same.
Respond to enquiries from creditors. Review
other supplier letters sent to vendors.

09/06/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.10  200.00  20.00
Communications with creditors.

09/06/2018 Soazig Bourgine 0.20  200.00  40.00
Website posting.

09/06/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.50  795.00  1,192.50
Call with Torys on issues and Chapter 11
proceedings, review of emails.

09/06/2018 Pritesh Patel 4.50  650.00  2,925.00
Review of disbursement request and
discussions with A.Zeldin on same.  Call with
A.Zeldin and A&M re cash variances.  Email
to Deerfield re pre-filing payments.
Correspondence with Company re payments.
Calls with K.Esaw, A.Zeldin re Mapi.

09/06/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.15  400.00  860.00
Review two-week rolling variance analysis
and discuss same with A&M/Richter team.
Draft email to Deerfield requesting approval
to pay certain pre-filing payments.

09/06/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.10  400.00  1,240.00
Attend at Aralez. Correspond with J. Hall re:
supplier letter to Mapi and other matters.
Prepare summary of proposed
disbursements for the week and correspond
with Richter team/Aralez re: same/other
matters. Correspond with A&M re: various
matters.

09/07/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails, emails with A&M,
discussion with P. Patel.

09/07/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.00  650.00  1,300.00



Invoice No.: 20403295
Date: 09/24/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review of emails from D.Bish re status.
Discussions with A.Zeldin on creditor
inquiries and cash flows.  Responding to
inquiries from interested parties re status of
proceedings.  Correspondence with
Stikeman re claims procedure.

09/07/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.95  400.00  1,180.00
Correspond with Aralez re: payment of
certain pre-filing amounts, reviewing
employee expenses and other matters. Draft
email for vendors re: CCAA
proceedings/continuation of services. Begin
reviewing employee expenses.

09/10/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails, discussion with P. Patel,
review of documents.

09/10/2018 Pritesh Patel 3.20  650.00  2,080.00
Responding to creditor inquiries.  Call with
A.Zeldin re payments, correspondence with
Aralez on same.  Review of revised Bid
Procedures and comments to Torys on
same.  Update call with A&M.

09/10/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.50  400.00  1,400.00
Review employee expense claims (pre and
post-filing). Correspond with Aralez re: same.
Deal with pre-filing payment to Mapi
(regulatory consultant) and discuss same
with A&M/Richter team.

09/11/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.30  650.00  1,495.00
Correspondence and calls with A.Zeldin re
DHL.  Discussion with A.Zeldin re Mapi,
review of email to Deerfield and call on
response from Deerfield.

09/11/2018 Adam Zeldin 1.00  400.00  400.00
Correspond with Aralez re: Mapi/employee
expenses and other matters. Respond to
shareholder enquiries.

09/11/2018 Adam Zeldin 5.50  400.00  2,200.00
Review weekly variance reporting and
correspond with A&M/Richter team re: same.
Review pre-filing Mapi invoices. Review
employee expense claims. Prepare
analysis/email to Deerfield re: approval to
pay employee expenses/Mapi invoices.

09/11/2018 Eric Finley 1.00  300.00  300.00
Review invoices/ payments, discuss with
Richter team and summarize results.

09/12/2018 Pritesh Patel 0.30  650.00  195.00
Review of revised Mapi letter and
correpondence with Stikemans on same.

09/12/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.75  400.00  1,100.00



Invoice No.: 20403295
Date: 09/24/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review proposed payments
(inventory/regulatory/other opex) and prepare
summary of same/discuss same with Richter
team/Aralez. Review updated 13-wk CF and
discuss same with A&M. Correspond with
Bell Canada re: continuation of
internet/telephone service.

09/12/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.20  400.00  880.00
Attend at Aralez. Correspond with A&M re:
sales/collection variances for August.
Correspond with Company re: payment of
amounts owing to employees. Draft email to
vendors re: the CCAA
proceedings/continuation of services.

09/13/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.25  795.00  993.75
Review of emails, draft material, discussion
with team on CF.

09/13/2018 Pritesh Patel 3.50  650.00  2,275.00
Call with A.Zeldin re wire payments.  Review
of DIP amendment, SPA and schedules and
comments to counsel on same.  Calls with
A.Zeldin re Mapi reconciliation.  Responding
to inquiries from interested parties re status
of proceedings.

09/13/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.20  400.00  880.00
Attend at Aralez. Correspond with
Aralez/A&M re: various matters. Review bank
account details.

09/13/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.00  400.00  1,600.00
Deal with payment processing matters and
discuss same with Richter team. Review
revised pre-filing AP schedule. Correspond
with Aralez/A&M/Stikeman re: pre-filing
payment to Mapi.

09/14/2018 Paul Van Eyk 0.20  795.00  159.00
Review of emails.

09/14/2018 Pritesh Patel 0.50  650.00  325.00
Call with A&M re critical vendor payments
and discussion with A.Zeldin on same.

09/14/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.50  400.00  1,000.00
Review/update revised pre-filing AP
schedule. Correspond with Aralez re same,
other liabilities/creditors and current week
collections.

Fees Total 172.95 $ 91,702.00

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount
08/27/2018 Disbursements $ 6,630.42



Invoice No.: 20403295
Date: 09/24/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

08/27/2018: Niwri Invoice (Advertisement of
CCAA in Globe & Mail)

Disbursements Total $ 6,630.42



Invoice No.: 20403295
Date: 09/24/2018

Remittance Form
Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 98,332.42
Technology and Administrative Fees 4,585.10
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 13,379.27

Total Due CAD $ 116,296.79

Payment Options

Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank
Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Cheques Payable to: Richter Advisory Group Inc.
Send to: 181 Bay Street, Suite 3320, Bay Wellington Tower, Toronto ON  M5J 2T3

Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca



Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Date: 10/11/2018
Invoice No.: 20403358

Engagement No.: 2021281
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered to September 30, 2018 $ 61,014.00

Sub-Total 61,014.00
Technology and Administrative Fees 4,585.10
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 8,527.88

Total Due CAD $ 74,126.98



Invoice No.: 20403358
Date: 10/11/2018

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Zeldin 48.30 $ 400.00 $ 19,320.00
Carol O'Donnell 2.50  200.00  500.00
Eric Finley 1.75  300.00  525.00
Patrick Lareau 1.60  325.00  520.00
Paul Van Eyk 22.20  795.00  17,649.00
Pritesh Patel 34.40  650.00  22,360.00
Soazig Bourgine 0.70  200.00  140.00

111.45 $ 61,014.00



Invoice No.: 20403358
Date: 10/11/2018

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

09/17/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.75 $ 795.00 $ 1,391.25
Review of material, emails with Torys.

09/17/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.50  650.00  1,625.00
Review of revised SPA, Bid Procedures.  Call
with Torys re: Blexten.  Call with P. Van Eyk
re: break fee/expense reimbursement.

09/17/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.50  400.00  1,400.00
Attend at Aralez. Correspond with
A&M/Aralez re:
collections/disbursement/other matters.
Review summary of collection by customer.
Attend call with Bell Canada, a creditor.
Review CF variances and covenant test and
correspond with A&M re: same.

09/18/2018 Soazig Bourgine 0.20  200.00  40.00
Website update.

09/18/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.20  795.00  2,544.00
Review of correspondence from Torys on US
and CDN security opinions, review of emails,
discussion with Torys, discussion with P.
Patel on CF/Deerfield.

09/18/2018 Pritesh Patel 1.00  650.00  650.00
Emails with Stikeman/A&M re: Woodmont.
Call with Stikeman/A&M re: claims
procedure.

09/18/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.70  400.00  1,880.00
Review proposed payments for the week and
correspond with Aralez/A&M re: same. Begin
preparing summary of same. Correspond
with A&M re: CF/royalty payments/other
matters. Correspond with A&M/Aralez re:
cash flow variances.

09/19/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.50  795.00  1,987.50
Call with counsel to a creditor, discussion
with P. Patel, review of emails, review of
material.

09/19/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.50  650.00  1,625.00
Review and calls with A. Zeldin re: payment
requests, Depomed.  Call with counsel to
Depomed re: status of proceedings and sales
process.  Correspondence with A. Zeldin re:
Halo.

09/19/2018 Adam Zeldin 6.40  400.00  2,560.00
Summarize proposed payments for the week
(pre/post filing) and discuss same with
Aralez/Richter team. Review/comment on
supplier letter. Correspond with Aralez/A&M
re: same. Review Allergan royalty
agreement. Correspond with A&M re:
CF/other matters.



Invoice No.: 20403358
Date: 10/11/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

09/20/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails.

09/20/2018 Pritesh Patel 3.00  650.00  1,950.00
Review and edits to Halo letter.  Call with A.
Zeldin re: disbursements, receipts and other
issues.  Email to Deerfield re: approval on
critical payments.  Call with D. Bish re: claims
process and upcoming motion.

09/20/2018 Adam Zeldin 5.20  400.00  2,080.00
Review additional proposed disbursements
(employee exp/inventory/opex). Correspond
with Aralez re: same. Draft email to Deerfield
re: pre-filing payments/Allergan royalty.
Correspond with Aralez/A&M re: supplier
letter/other matters. Richter team meeting.

09/21/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.75  795.00  2,186.25
Review of emails, call with Torys on bidding
process and upcoming motion, discussion on
UCC comments, discussion with P. Patel on
CF.

09/21/2018 Pritesh Patel 1.70  650.00  1,105.00
Review of IQVIA letter and discussion with A.
Zeldin on same.  Review comments on Bid
Procedures.  Call with D. Bish re: upcoming
motion, UCC comments on Bid Procedures.

09/21/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.60  400.00  1,040.00
Correspond with A&M re: revised CF/other
matters. Draft supplier letter to IQVIA. Richter
team meeting. Respond to shareholder
enquiries. Payment processing matters.
Correspond with Aralez re: collections.

09/24/2018 Paul Van Eyk 4.00  795.00  3,180.00
Review of material on claims process, draft
affidavit, discussion with Torys, review of
emails from Torys, discussion/emails with P.
Patel.

09/24/2018 Pritesh Patel 1.20  650.00  780.00
Review of claims procedures order and
comments to Torys on same.

09/24/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.70  400.00  1,080.00
Correspond with Aralez re: board payroll,
supplier letter, proposed disbursements and
other matters. Review CF variances and
correspond with A&M re: same.

09/25/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.90  200.00  180.00
Discussions with P. Patel regarding claims
process. Review of forms. Communications
with Niwri regarding newspaper ad and time
constraints.

09/25/2018 Soazig Bourgine 0.50  200.00  100.00
Claims process: preparation of templates.



Invoice No.: 20403358
Date: 10/11/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

09/25/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.00  795.00  2,385.00
Review of emails, discussion with Torys,
emails to Richter team, discussion with P.
Patel on report.

09/25/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.50  650.00  1,625.00
Call with D. Bish re: claims procedures.
Review of claims schedules and discussion
on same with Richter team.  Call with D. Bish
re: Depomed.

09/25/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.70  400.00  1,080.00
Correspond with Aralez/A&M re: claims
process. Review/correspond with Aralez re:
updates to creditors list. Review other
liabilities for purposes of claims process.

09/26/2018 Patrick Lareau 0.80  325.00  260.00
Review proof of claim form and modification.
Discussion with C. O'Donnell.

09/26/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.70  200.00  140.00
Review of POC, instruction letter, notices of
dispute, disallowance.

09/26/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.00  795.00  1,590.00
Review of emails, call with Torys on o/s
matters, discussion with P. Patel, review of
material.

09/26/2018 Pritesh Patel 4.50  650.00  2,925.00
Review of draft affidavit and begin drafting
Second Report. Call with A. Zeldin re: CF.
Call with A&M re: SPA. Correspondence with
Stikemans re: claims process.

09/26/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.30  400.00  1,320.00
Review updated 13-wk CF and correspond
with A&M/Aralez re: same.
Review/correspond with Aralez re: proposed
disbursements (payroll/opex/inventory).
Correspond with Aralez/A&M re: claims
process.

09/26/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.70  400.00  1,880.00
Review draft SPA and correspond with A&M
re: same. Draft supplier letters.
Review/update proof of claim form and info
sheet re: claims procedure order.

09/27/2018 Patrick Lareau 0.80  325.00  260.00
Review Information sheet and POC.
Discussion with C. O'Donnell.

09/27/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.90  200.00  180.00
Review of documents, discussions with A.
Zeldin. Communications with Niwri Media.
Misc.

09/27/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails.



Invoice No.: 20403358
Date: 10/11/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

09/27/2018 Pritesh Patel 4.00  650.00  2,600.00
Continue drafting Second Report.  Review
and response to questions re: claims
process.

09/27/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.00  400.00  800.00
Attend call with Aralez re: Board member
payroll. Correspond with Aralez re: other
disbursements, claims procedure, other
matters. Review/approve payments.

09/27/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.30  400.00  1,720.00
Review/update proof of claim form, info
sheet, other notices re: claims procedure
order. Review/discuss same with Richter
team. Correspond with Stikemans re: claims
procedure (order and forms/notices).

09/28/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails, discussion with Torys, P.
Patel.

09/28/2018 Pritesh Patel 5.50  650.00  3,575.00
Continue drafting Second Report. Review of
revised motion materials/orders from
Stikemans. Call with A&M re: SPA.
Discussions with A. Zeldin re: CF and claims
process.  Correspondence with counsels re:
DIP Budget.

09/28/2018 Adam Zeldin 6.20  400.00  2,480.00
Review latest version of the Claims
Procedure Order. Correspond with Aralez re:
matters concerning the Claims Process.
Review Monitor's Second Report.
Correspond with A&M re: various matters.
Review latest version of 13-wk CF.

09/28/2018 Eric Finley 1.75  300.00  525.00
Prepare cash flow and variance analysis for
report. Discuss with Richter team.

09/30/2018 Pritesh Patel 6.00  650.00  3,900.00
Continue review of affidavit and drafting
Second Report.

Fees Total 111.45 $ 61,014.00



Invoice No.: 20403358
Date: 10/11/2018

Remittance Form
Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 61,014.00
Technology and Administrative Fees 4,585.10
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 8,527.88

Total Due CAD $ 74,126.98

Payment Options

Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank
Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Cheques Payable to: Richter Advisory Group Inc.
Send to: 181 Bay Street, Suite 3320, Bay Wellington Tower, Toronto ON  M5J 2T3

Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca



Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
Aralez Phamaceuticals Canada Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Date: 10/30/2018
Invoice No.: 20403407

Engagement No.: 2021281
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered October 15, 2018 $ 82,189.00

Disbursements  395.86

Sub-Total 82,584.86
Technology and Administrative Fees 4,109.45
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 11,270.26

Total Due CAD $ 97,964.57



Invoice No.: 20403407
Date: 10/30/2018

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Zeldin 51.00 $ 400.00 $ 20,400.00
Carol O'Donnell 0.50  200.00  100.00
Eric Finley 3.50  300.00  1,050.00
Nicole Fournier 1.00  200.00  200.00
Paul Van Eyk 34.70  795.00  27,586.50
Pritesh Patel 45.25  650.00  29,412.50
Soazig Bourgine 10.30  200.00  2,060.00
Steve Davis 4.60  300.00  1,380.00

150.85 $ 82,189.00
Disbursements

Disbursements $ 395.86

$ 395.86



Invoice No.: 20403407
Date: 10/30/2018

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

10/01/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.00 $ 795.00 $ 2,385.00
Review of emails, discussion with P. Patel on
report, review of emails from Torys, review of
emails and material from Stikemans, email to
A&M.

10/01/2018 Pritesh Patel 4.50  650.00  2,925.00
Continued review of SPA, disclosure letter
and drafting of court report. Correspondence
with Aralez re: claims process.
Correspondence with counsels re: DIP
Budget.

10/01/2018 Adam Zeldin 6.00  400.00  2,400.00
Review/approve disbursements. Correspond
with A&M/Aralez re: various matters. Attend
call with CRA re: HST. Update report
appendices. Review updated CF.
Review/update Second Report.

10/01/2018 Eric Finley 2.25  300.00  675.00
Update to cash flow, variance analysis,
supplemental cashflow reports. Discuss with
Richter team and L. Benson.

10/02/2018 Soazig Bourgine 0.30  200.00  60.00
Website posting (Motion), email to OSB.

10/02/2018 Paul Van Eyk 8.00  795.00  6,360.00
Review of KEIP/KERP documents,
discussion with Torys, review of emails,
review of draft report, discussion with P.
Patel.

10/02/2018 Pritesh Patel 6.20  650.00  4,030.00
Review of revised DIP Budget.  Review of
KEIP/KERP and call with Torys on same.
Review of CF sections and various edits to
court report.  Review of final affidavit.

10/02/2018 Adam Zeldin 7.10  400.00  2,840.00
Review updated CF and correspond with
A&M re: same and other matters. Review
terms of SPA and Disclosure Letter.
Review/update Second Report. Correspond
with P. Patel re: same. Correspond with
Aralez re: various matters.

10/02/2018 Eric Finley 1.25  300.00  375.00
Update cash flow for report with revised A&M
cashflow, supplemental cashflow reports,
discuss with Richter team.

10/03/2018 Soazig Bourgine 0.30  200.00  60.00
Website posting and email to OSB (updated
Service List).

10/03/2018 Paul Van Eyk 4.25  795.00  3,378.75



Invoice No.: 20403407
Date: 10/30/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

KEIP/KERP discussion with A&M, conf call
with counsel, company and A&M on
KEIP/KERP, review of draft report, review of
emails.

10/03/2018 Pritesh Patel 8.00  650.00  5,200.00
Circulate draft of court report to P. van Eyk
and Torys.  Update report based on
comments from Torys and call with D. Bish
on same.  Call with A&M re: KEIP/KERP.

10/03/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.80  400.00  1,520.00
Attend at Aralez. Correspond with
Aralez/A&M re: various matters. Review
current week cheque run with Aralez/A&M
and prepare summary of same.
Review/update Second Report. Correspond
with P. Patel re: same.

10/03/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.40  400.00  960.00
Review liabilities noted in Disclosure Letter
and correspond with P. Patel re: same.
Prepare summary of amounts owing to
Accuristix (a vendor) and discuss same with
Aralez. Prepare Second Report appendices.

10/04/2018 Soazig Bourgine 0.70  200.00  140.00
Email communication with Niwri Media,
emails to A. Zeldin/P. Patel, communication
with translation department.

10/04/2018 Paul Van Eyk 4.75  795.00  3,776.25
Review of revised report, edits to P. Patel,
call with Torys on o/s matters, review of
emails, discussion with A&M on working
capital and closing adjustments schedule,
review of KEIP material.

10/04/2018 Pritesh Patel 8.00  650.00  5,200.00
Discussions with A. Zeldin re: disbursement
request.  Email to Deerfield re: critical
payments.  Review of revised KEIP/KERP
term sheet.  Review of SPA schedules and
call with A&M re: adjustments.  Update and
circulate report to Stikeman.

10/04/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.50  400.00  1,400.00
Attend at Aralez. Prepare email to Deerfield
re: pre-filing payments. Review employee
expenses and correspond with Aralez re:
same. Prepare summary of pre-filing
payments to date. Review/update/correspond
re: same with A&M.

10/04/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.00  400.00  1,600.00



Invoice No.: 20403407
Date: 10/30/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Correspond with Stikemans re: claims
process. Correspond with P. Patel re: cheque
run. Correspond with Aralez/P. Patel re: draft
Blexten supplier/consent agreement. Review
variance analysis. Correspond with A&M re:
same.

10/05/2018 Soazig Bourgine 0.50  200.00  100.00
Emails to P. Patel, Niwri Media, notice
update, website posting, e-filing.

10/05/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.75  795.00  1,391.25
Review of edits to court report review of
emails from Stikemans, review of emails from
Torys.

10/05/2018 Pritesh Patel 3.75  650.00  2,437.50
Review comments from Torys and Stikemans
on court report. Compile appendices. Update
court report for comments from P. van Eyk.
Finalize and sign Second Report for service.
Review of call list and draft emails from
Moelis.

10/05/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.80  400.00  1,920.00
Review/update Second Report. Correspond
with P. Patel re: same. Attend call with API
payroll administrator re: board payroll.
Review analysis of same. Correspond with
Aralez re: various matters. Correspond with
A&M re: CF and other matters.

10/06/2018 Paul Van Eyk 0.50  795.00  397.50
Emails with Torys, review of emails.

10/08/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.00  795.00  1,590.00
Review of emails, review of correspondence
related to UCC, call with Torys.

10/08/2018 Pritesh Patel 0.50  650.00  325.00
Review and comment on UCC changes to
Bid Procedures.

10/09/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.10  200.00  20.00
Review newspaper ad forward to P. Patel.
Discussion with Niwri Media.

10/09/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.00  795.00  1,590.00
Review of UCC material, discussion with
Torys, discussions with P. Patel, review of
emails.

10/09/2018 Pritesh Patel 3.80  650.00  2,470.00
Calls and correspondence with counsel re:
revised Bid Procedures, Canadian Stalking
Horse Agreement, Bezalip. Discussions with
A. Zeldin re: proposed payments.

10/09/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.90  400.00  1,960.00



Invoice No.: 20403407
Date: 10/30/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Attend at Aralez. Review employee
expenses. Correspond with Aralez/P. Patel
re: same. Review other disbursements.
Review proposed Board payroll and
Correspond with Aralez re: same.
Correspond with P. Patel re: intercompany
balances and related matters.

10/10/2018 Nicole Fournier 1.00  200.00  200.00
Review of french translation of Claims
Process Notice.

10/10/2018 Soazig Bourgine 1.00  200.00  200.00
Factum & Affidavit emailed to OSB & posted
on website, review of French version of
Notice, request for translation.

10/10/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.25  795.00  2,583.75
Attendance in court, discussion with Torys,
review of affidavit and material sent by
Stikemans, discussion with P. Patel.

10/10/2018 Pritesh Patel 5.00  650.00  3,250.00
Preparation of interco analysis for Stikeman.
Discussions with counsel re: Bidding
Procedures, UCC objections, etc.
Preparation for and attendance in Court.
Review of emails from counsel re:
Therapure.

10/10/2018 Steve Davis 3.00  300.00  900.00
Reviewing creditor listing and populating
email addresses. Updating list for new email
and mailing addresses provided.
Summarizing missing items.

10/10/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.75  400.00  1,900.00
Correspond with Aralez/A&M/Richter team
re: Faes/Blexten inventory. Review and
update creditor list for claims process.
Review weekly variance report and discuss
same with A&M/P. Patel. Review payroll and
approve for payment; discuss same with
Aralez.

10/11/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.40  200.00  80.00
Update website.

10/11/2018 Soazig Bourgine 3.00  200.00  600.00
Emails with Niwri & P. Patel, preparation of
mailing, creditor list, labels. Website posting
of Orders, Endorsement, Instruction Letter,
POC and Notice Letter, email to OSB.

10/11/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.20  795.00  1,749.00
Call with B. O'Neill on interest in a certain
drug, discussion with Torys, review of emails.

10/11/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.50  650.00  1,625.00



Invoice No.: 20403407
Date: 10/30/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Calls with A. Zeldin re: payment requests,
Faes and Bezalip.  Discussion with P. van
Eyk re: sales process. Call with Stikeman re:
Faes and cross-border protocol.

10/11/2018 Steve Davis 1.60  300.00  480.00
Updating creditor list for email addresses and
making list of missing email addresses.
Testing completeness of creditor list.

10/11/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.55  400.00  1,420.00
Correspond with C. Anania/S. Subramanian
re: creditors for the claims process. Review
and update creditors list for claims process
and discuss same with Richter team. Review
comment on claims package forms.

10/11/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.35  400.00  1,340.00
Correspond with A&M/Aralez re:
Faes/Blexten inventory and other matters.
Richter team meeting. Review/approve
disbursements. Review bezalip
royalty/distribution agreement. Discuss same
with Aralez/P. Patel.

10/12/2018 Soazig Bourgine 3.00  200.00  600.00
Mailing to creditors, email to OSB, emails to
supplementary list, employees and creditors,
labels.

10/12/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.50  795.00  1,987.50
Discussion with B. O'Neill, calls with Torys,
review of emails, email to Torys, discussion
with P. Patel.

10/12/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.00  650.00  1,300.00
Review of emails and materials on Bezalip,
correspondence with D. Bish and P. van Eyk
on same.

10/12/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.85  400.00  1,140.00
Correspond with A&M re: payment of Blexten
inventory and cash flow impacts and other
matters. Review emails from/with Stikemans
re: extending the CF. Review/approve
disbursements. Correspond with Aralez/P.
Patel re: Uracyst.

10/15/2018 Soazig Bourgine 1.50  200.00  300.00
Affidavit of mailing, Mailing Lists.

10/15/2018 Paul Van Eyk 0.50  795.00  397.50
Review of emails from Stikeman and Torys.

10/15/2018 Pritesh Patel 1.00  650.00  650.00
Review and response to emails from
Stikemans and Torys re: sales process,
Bezalip, Dialfor.

Fees Total 150.85 $ 82,189.00



Invoice No.: 20403407
Date: 10/30/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount
10/12/2018 Disbursements $ 386.83

10/12/2018: Postage: Notice to Claimants for
the Claims Process

10/10/2018 Disbursements  9.03
10/10/2018: Taxi to Court (361 University)

Disbursements Total $ 395.86



Invoice No.: 20403407
Date: 10/30/2018

Remittance Form
Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
Aralez Phamaceuticals Canada Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 82,584.86
Technology and Administrative Fees 4,109.45
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 11,270.26

Total Due CAD $ 97,964.57

Payment Options

Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank
Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Cheques Payable to: Richter Advisory Group Inc.
Send to: 181 Bay Street, Suite 3320, Bay Wellington Tower, Toronto ON  M5J 2T3

Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca



Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Date: 11/14/2018
Invoice No.: 20403466

Engagement No.: 2021281
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered to October 31, 2018 $ 38,131.50

Disbursements  1,112.50

Sub-Total 39,244.00
Technology and Administrative Fees 1,906.58
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 5,349.58

Total Due CAD $ 46,500.16



Invoice No.: 20403466
Date: 11/14/2018

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Zeldin 18.45 $ 400.00 $ 7,380.00
Carol O'Donnell 0.10  200.00  20.00
Paul Van Eyk 10.20  795.00  8,109.00
Pritesh Patel 28.25  650.00  18,362.50
Soazig Bourgine 1.80  200.00  360.00
Steve Davis 13.00  300.00  3,900.00

71.80 $ 38,131.50
Disbursements

Disbursements $ 1,112.50

$ 1,112.50



Invoice No.: 20403466
Date: 11/14/2018

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

10/16/2018 Paul Van Eyk 0.50 $ 795.00 $ 397.50
Review of emails, call from Goodmans.

10/16/2018 Pritesh Patel 0.75  650.00  487.50
Review and consideration of payment
request from Aralez re: Blexten.  Question to
A&M, and review and comment on
responses.

10/17/2018 Steve Davis 2.50  300.00  750.00
Cheque approval - reviewing all
invoices/cheques with Cathy and Lauren.
Reviewing previous cheque run summary
and cash flow forecast.

10/18/2018 Soazig Bourgine 0.20  200.00  40.00
Affidavit emailed to OSB.

10/18/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails on cross-border protocol,
discussion with Torys.

10/18/2018 Pritesh Patel 3.00  650.00  1,950.00
Review of weekly disbursement request,
questions to A&M and review and comment
on responses. Discussion with S. Davis re:
payment request, CF and DIP variance
calculations.  Email to Deerfield re: critical
payments.

10/18/2018 Steve Davis 3.00  300.00  900.00
Preparing summary of cheques for Oct 19
cheque run. Discussions with P. Patel re:
pre-filing cheques and email
correspondences with L. Benson.

10/19/2018 Paul Van Eyk 0.75  795.00  596.25
Review of emails from Stikemans, Torys,
Richter.

10/19/2018 Pritesh Patel 1.50  650.00  975.00
Correspondence with A&M re: DHL.  Review
of emails on cross-border protocol.
Correspondence with Torys re: Third Report
and service.

10/21/2018 Pritesh Patel 4.50  650.00  2,925.00
Review of motion materials and drafting Third
Report of the Monitor.

10/22/2018 Soazig Bourgine 0.30  200.00  60.00
Email to OSB and website posting.

10/22/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.20  795.00  954.00
Call with P. Patel on Third report, review of
draft report.

10/22/2018 Pritesh Patel 4.50  650.00  2,925.00



Invoice No.: 20403466
Date: 11/14/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Continue drafting report. Discussion with S.
Davis on employee expenses. Review of CF
reporting for report and questions on same.
Update report based on comments from
Torys and Stikeman. Email to Deerfield re:
critical payments.

10/22/2018 Steve Davis 5.50  300.00  1,650.00
Reviewing T&E expense summary and
supporting expense reports and invoices.
Reviewing cash flow actuals up to Oct. 19th,
preparing summary of cash flows forecast-to-
actuals up to Oct. 19th.

10/23/2018 Soazig Bourgine 1.00  200.00  200.00
Website posting (motion, service list and
report), emails to OSB.

10/23/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails, discussion with P. Patel on
outstanding items including Therapure.

10/23/2018 Pritesh Patel 3.50  650.00  2,275.00
Finalize and sign Third Report.  Review of
wire requests and discussion with S. Davis
on same. Email and response to Aralez re:
questions on payments. Email to Deerfield
re: critical payments. Call with A&M re:
Therapure. Emails with Aralez re: DHL.

10/23/2018 Steve Davis 2.00  300.00  600.00
Reviewing supporting invoices re: Oct 23
wire payment request. Comparing to cash
flow forecast and discussions with P. Patel.

10/24/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails.

10/24/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.00  650.00  1,300.00
Review of DHL payment. Participation on call
with Aralez re: Therapure. Call with Stikeman
on same.

10/25/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.50  795.00  1,192.50
Review of emails from Torys, responding to
Torys, review of emails from US proceeding.

10/25/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.50  650.00  1,625.00
Attendance in Court re: approval of cross-
border protocol. Review of new payment
request re: Blexten and correspondence with
Aralez on same. Call with A&M to discuss
CF. Review and response on emails re:
Therapure.

10/26/2018 Soazig Bourgine 0.30  200.00  60.00
Website posting & email to OSB.

10/26/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.75  795.00  1,391.25
Review of emails and discussion with P.
Patel and A. Zeldin on cash flow, Therapure.



Invoice No.: 20403466
Date: 11/14/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

10/26/2018 Pritesh Patel 1.00  650.00  650.00
Calls with Company re: pre-filing payments
and Therapure. Call with potential interested
party re: Sales Process and email to Moelis
on same. Review of emails from counsel re:
Therapure.

10/26/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.60  400.00  1,040.00
Update meeting with P. Patel. Attend call
with Aralez/P. Patel re: Therapure. Review
correspondence re: payment of pre-filing
amounts to Faes, extending the CF.
Correspond with certain creditors re: the
claims process.

10/29/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.10  200.00  20.00
Review of proofs of claim, email to A. Zeldin.

10/29/2018 Pritesh Patel 0.50  650.00  325.00
Discussions with A. Zeldin re: cash flow,
Therapure.

10/29/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.10  400.00  840.00
Attend at Aralez. Review API and APCI
payroll. Correspond with A&M re: Therpaure,
CF and other matters. Review A&M analysis
re: Therpaure.

10/29/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.50  400.00  1,400.00
Review weekly variances. Review banking
details. Review claim filed by Nuvo. Discuss
same with Aralez/A&M/P. Patel. Respond to
shareholder enquiries.

10/30/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails from Torys, Richter.

10/30/2018 Pritesh Patel 0.50  650.00  325.00
Responding to inquiries from interested
parties re: sales process. Discussion with A.
Zeldin re: payment of professional fee
invoices.

10/30/2018 Adam Zeldin 5.00  400.00  2,000.00
Discusison with Aralez/P. Patel re: status of
HST filings. Review A&M fees. Review
updated CF and correspond with A&M re:
same.

10/31/2018 Paul Van Eyk 0.50  795.00  397.50
Review of various emails

10/31/2018 Pritesh Patel 4.00  650.00  2,600.00
Review of KEIP/KERP materials and drafting
of Monitor's Fourth Report. Discussion with
A. Zeldin re: Therapure and CF.

10/31/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.00  400.00  1,200.00



Invoice No.: 20403466
Date: 11/14/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review/Correspond with A&M re: CF.
Review current week cheque run;.
Correspond with P. Patel re: same and other
matters.

10/31/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.25  400.00  900.00
Prepare comparative analysis of professional
fees paid to amounts approved and discuss
same with A&M/P. Patel. Correspond with J.
Hall/A&M/P. Patel re: Therapure and Faes
consent.

Fees Total 71.80 $ 38,131.50

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount
10/16/2018 Disbursements $ 1,112.50

Translation of claims packages to French

Disbursements Total $ 1,112.50



Invoice No.: 20403466
Date: 11/14/2018

Remittance Form
Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 39,244.00
Technology and Administrative Fees 1,906.58
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 5,349.58

Total Due CAD $ 46,500.16

Payment Options

Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank
Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Cheques Payable to: Richter Advisory Group Inc.
Send to: 181 Bay Street, Suite 3320, Bay Wellington Tower, Toronto ON  M5J 2T3

Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca



Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Date: 11/23/2018
Invoice No.: 20403493

Engagement No.: 2021281
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered to November 15, 2018 $ 76,601.50

Disbursements  7,641.85

Sub-Total 84,243.35
Technology and Administrative Fees 3,831.78
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 11,449.77

Total Due CAD $ 99,524.90



Invoice No.: 20403493
Date: 11/23/2018

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Zeldin 45.95 $ 400.00 $ 18,380.00
Carol O'Donnell 1.90  200.00  380.00
Paul Van Eyk 23.70  795.00  18,841.50
Pritesh Patel 60.00  650.00  39,000.00

131.55 $ 76,601.50
Disbursements

Disbursements $ 7,641.85

$ 7,641.85



Invoice No.: 20403493
Date: 11/23/2018

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

11/01/2018 Paul Van Eyk 0.50 $ 795.00 $ 397.50
Review of emails.

11/01/2018 Pritesh Patel 4.00  650.00  2,600.00
Review of and call with A. Zeldin re:
disbursement request and Accuristix. Sales
Process update call with Moelis. Review of
revised Bezalip agreement and comments to
Torys on same. Call with CRA re: HST and
follow up with Company on same.

11/01/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.80  400.00  1,120.00
Attend at Aralez. Prepare cheque run
summary. Review supporting
documentation/correspond with Aralez re:
same. Prepare/Update summary of
payments to Accuristix. Corresond with C.
Anania re: proposed HST audit.

11/01/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.35  400.00  940.00
Review Ch. 11 claims package. Correspond
with Aralez/P. Patel re: same.
Review/download documents from Moelis
data room. Review/comment on deposit
letter. Correspond with J. Hall/P.
Patel/Stikemans re: Bezalip. Review of
materials re: same.

11/02/2018 Pritesh Patel 1.50  650.00  975.00
Review of information on Bezalip and call
with Stikeman and Aralez on same. Update
email to Torys and P. van Eyk.

11/02/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.65  400.00  1,060.00
Correspond with Aralez/A&M re: cheque run.
Attend call with Stikemans/Aralez re: Bezalip.
Email Rogers (creditor) re: amounts owing
and the proceedings generally. Review
proofs of claim filed. Review CF variance
analysis.

11/05/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails on KEIP, discussion with P.
Patel.

11/05/2018 Pritesh Patel 5.50  650.00  3,575.00
Review of Affidavit and comments to Torys
on same. Correspondence with Torys re:
Therapure. Calls with A. Zeldin re: payment
requests and email to Deerfield re: pre-filing
payments. Drafting Fourth Report.

11/05/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.50  400.00  1,400.00
Attend at Aralez. Respond by phone/email to
creditor enquires. Review draft Therapure
agreement and discuss same with P. Patel.
Correspond with A&M re: updated CF and
other matters.



Invoice No.: 20403493
Date: 11/23/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

11/05/2018 Adam Zeldin 1.50  400.00  600.00
Review cash flow variances and discuss
same with A&M. Draft email to Deerfield re:
pre-filing payments. Discussion with P. Patel
re: same, proposed stay extension motion
and other matters.

11/06/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.25  795.00  1,788.75
Review of initial affidavit and emails from
Torys and Stikemans, review attachments
from A&M, review UCC material.

11/06/2018 Pritesh Patel 3.50  650.00  2,275.00
Continue drafting Report, review KEIP
Motion filed in US.

11/06/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.75  400.00  1,100.00
Email supporting documents/summary to
Deerfield re: certain pre-filing payments.
Review/approve employee expenses.
Correspond with Aralez re: same. Calls with
A&M re: cash flow, Accuristix pre-filing
payments and other matters.

11/06/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.00  400.00  1,200.00
Prepare CF charts for Fourth Report.
Review/update managements/monitors
report on CF and CF notes. Review/approve
disbursements (rent/royalties) and discuss
same with A&M/Aralez.

11/07/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.25  795.00  1,788.75
Call on KEIP with A&M and Stikes/Torys, call
with Torys, review of KEIP changes and
affidavit.

11/07/2018 Pritesh Patel 5.00  650.00  3,250.00
Call with A&M, Stikeman and Torys to
discuss amendments to the KEIP. Review of
updated KEIP term sheet and call with K.
Esaw on same. Review of revised affidavit
and comments on same. Correspondence
with counsel re: CF/extension.

11/07/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.50  400.00  1,000.00
Correspond with Aralez re: disbursements.
Correspond with A&M/P. Patel re: updated
cash flow, KERP/KEIP and other matters.
Responding to enquiries from creditors.

11/08/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.20  795.00  954.00
Review of updated affidavit, material from
A&M, discussion with P. Patel.

11/08/2018 Pritesh Patel 7.50  650.00  4,875.00
Drafting Fourth Report and update for
amendments to KEIP. Review of materials on
Prime Clerk re: KEIP. Review of emails from
counsels re: Bezalip, Therapure, DIP CF,
UCC objection to KEIP.



Invoice No.: 20403493
Date: 11/23/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

11/08/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.00  400.00  800.00
Correspond with A&M re: cash flow,
KERP/KEIP and other matters. Email S.
Subramanian re: claims process. Correspond
with J. Hall re: Therapure, claims process
and other matters. Review email from L.
Bardelli re: proposed pre-filing payment.

11/09/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.25  795.00  993.75
Review of emails from Torys on APA, KEIP
and cross-border request of UCC.

11/09/2018 Pritesh Patel 4.00  650.00  2,600.00
Review of declarations posted on Prime
Clerk re: KEIP. Continue drafting Fourth
Report.

11/09/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.00  400.00  800.00
Correspond with V. Shurr re: claims
process/interco claims. Correspond with C.
Anania re: disbursements, claims process.
Review HST audit letter from CRA and
discuss same with C. Anania/P. Patel. Call
with A&M re: cash flow/stay extension and
KERP/KEIP.

11/09/2018 Adam Zeldin 0.50  400.00  200.00
Respond to creditor enquires. Review proof
of claim filed by CRA.

11/11/2018 Paul Van Eyk 0.25  795.00  198.75
Review of emails, discussion with Torys.

11/12/2018 Paul Van Eyk 5.00  795.00  3,975.00
Review of draft report, KEIP/KERP reviews;
review of court material; discussions with
Torys.

11/12/2018 Pritesh Patel 8.00  650.00  5,200.00
Correspondence with Torys re: examinations
in US proceedings. Continue drafting Fourth
Report, including updates based on
comments from P. van Eyk. Correspondence
with A&M re: KEIP. Review of CF results and
call with A. Zeldin re: same.

11/12/2018 Adam Zeldin 5.20  400.00  2,080.00
Review CF filed with KERP/KEIP motion and
compare same against actual results to date.
Discuss same with A&M/P. Patel. Review
proposed disbursements and discuss same
with C. Anania/A&M. Review proof of claim.

11/13/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.10  200.00  20.00
Review POC's, prepare claims register.

11/13/2018 Paul Van Eyk 6.00  795.00  4,770.00
Attendance at Torys to listen to US Court
UCC submissions, review of draft report,
edits to report, discussion with P. Patel.



Invoice No.: 20403493
Date: 11/23/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

11/13/2018 Pritesh Patel 8.00  650.00  5,200.00
Review of correspondence re: Blexten. Call
with A&M re: claims, KEIP. Call with C.
O'Donnell re: claims received. Finalize draft
Fourth Report and circulate to counsel for
comments. Revise and edit based on
comments, and circulate revised draft.

11/13/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.30  400.00  1,720.00
Attend at Aralez. Review/approve proposed
disbursements. Correspond with C. Anania
re: disbursements, HST audit, other matters.
Correspond with A&M re: CF, commissions,
intercompany balances other matters. Deal
with intercompany balance matters.

11/13/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.15  400.00  1,260.00
Review/summarize claims filed to date.
Review/comment on Fourth Report and
discuss same with P. Patel.

11/14/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.50  200.00  100.00
Post documents to website, email to OSB.

11/14/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.00  795.00  1,590.00
Review of material from UCC.

11/14/2018 Pritesh Patel 7.50  650.00  4,875.00
Continued revisions to Fourth Report based
on comments from Torys and Stikeman. Call
with Stikeman re: sealing and appendices.
Finalize and sign report, compile appendices
and circulate to counsel for service. Update
call with A&M.

11/14/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.15  400.00  860.00
Attend at Aralez. Summarize proposed
disbursement for current week cheque run.
Correspond with C. Anania re: Blexten
inventory payment. Attend call with V. Schurr
re: intercompany balances.

11/14/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.35  400.00  940.00
Prepare schedule of potential claims.
Discuss same with A&M/C. Anania.
Correspond with A&M re: working capital
adjustments, CF variances, other matters.

11/15/2018 Carol O'Donnell 1.30  200.00  260.00
Verify creditor mailings for A. Zeldin. Email A.
Zeldin. Post documents to website, email to
OSB. Send mailing by courier.

11/15/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.00  795.00  1,590.00
Review of material in prep for court.

11/15/2018 Pritesh Patel 5.50  650.00  3,575.00



Invoice No.: 20403493
Date: 11/23/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review of weekly disbursements, claims and
discussion with A. Zeldin on same.  Email to
Deerfield re: critical payments. Review of
UCC factum re: KEIP motion. Call with Torys
re: KEIP/KERP, UCC Factum and Bezalip.
Sales process update call with Moelis.

11/15/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.25  400.00  1,300.00
Discussion with P. Patel re: cheque run,
claims process matters. Correspond with
A&M/J. Hall re: certain creditors. Correspond
with Richter team re: claims process. Draft
email to Deerfield re: pre-filing payments.

Fees Total 131.55 $ 76,601.50

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount
10/16/2018 Disbursements $ 7,641.85

Niwri Media : Advertisement of Claims
Process in Globe & Mail.



Invoice No.: 20403493
Date: 11/23/2018

Remittance Form
Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 84,243.35
Technology and Administrative Fees 3,831.78
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 11,449.77

Total Due CAD $ 99,524.90

Payment Options

Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank
Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Cheques Payable to: Richter Advisory Group Inc.
Send to: 181 Bay Street, Suite 3320, Bay Wellington Tower, Toronto ON  M5J 2T3

Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca



Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Date: 12/14/2018
Invoice No.: 20403562

Engagement No.: 2021281
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered to November 30, 2018 $ 67,945.25

Sub-Total 67,945.25
Technology and Administrative Fees 3,394.26
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 9,274.13

Total Due CAD $ 80,613.64



Invoice No.: 20403562
Date: 12/14/2018

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Zeldin 64.00 $ 400.00 $ 25,600.00
Carol O'Donnell 3.30  200.00  660.00
Pascale Lareau 4.90  185.00  906.50
Paul Van Eyk 19.25  795.00  15,303.75
Pritesh Patel 38.50  650.00  25,025.00
Steve Davis 1.50  300.00  450.00

131.45 $ 67,945.25



Invoice No.: 20403562
Date: 12/14/2018

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

11/16/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.20 $ 200.00 $ 40.00
Email of Claims Procedure Notice to
additional creditors.

11/16/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.00  795.00  2,385.00
Attendance in court for KEIP/KERP motion,
discussion with Torys.

11/16/2018 Pritesh Patel 3.50  650.00  2,275.00
Preparation for and attendance in Court for
KEIP/KERP approval.

11/16/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.25  400.00  1,300.00
Correspond with Aralez re: Therapure, other
disbursements, claims process. Review
weekly CF variances. Correspond with A&M
re: CF variances. Review Therapure
agreement. Respond to enquiries from
shareholder. Review/approve disbursements.

11/19/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.20  200.00  40.00
Posted documents to website.

11/19/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails, discussion with P. Patel,
discussion with Torys.

11/19/2018 Pritesh Patel 0.30  650.00  195.00
Correspondence with Richter team re: claims
process.

11/19/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.80  400.00  1,920.00
Draft Sixth report re: Bezalip. Review draft
APA, Bezalip distribution agreements, other
documents/correspondence re: same.
Respond to shareholder enquires.
Correspond with A&M re: CF, employee
expenses and other matters. Attend to claims
process matters.

11/20/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails on Bezalip, and other
matters.

11/20/2018 Pritesh Patel 0.50  650.00  325.00
Review of updated claims register and
correspondence with Stikeman on same.

11/20/2018 Adam Zeldin 6.10  400.00  2,440.00
Review/update Sixth report re: Bezalip.
Review draft APA, Bezalip distribution
agreements, other documents in connection
with same. Update summary of claims filed to
date. Discuss same with P. Patel.

11/21/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.20  200.00  40.00
Discussion with A. Zeldin re: mailing, email
mail affidavit.

11/21/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00



Invoice No.: 20403562
Date: 12/14/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review of emails from Torys and Stikemans.
11/21/2018 Pritesh Patel 3.00  650.00  1,950.00

Emails with counsel re: claims filed to date.
Attending to calls from creditors (Jubliant,
former employee) re: claims process and
status of proceedings. Discussion with A.
Zeldin re: Bezalip, draft report and claims
process.

11/21/2018 Steve Davis 1.50  300.00  450.00
Reviewing T&E employee expenses for the
period Nov. 13 to Nov. 21, 2018.

11/21/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.10  400.00  1,640.00
Attend at Aralez. Correspond with A&M re:
cash flow matters, intercompany balances
and other matters. Review employee
expenses. Respond to shareholder enquiries.
Review/update Sixth report re: Bezalip.

11/21/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.60  400.00  1,040.00
Deal with claims process matters, including
attending several calls/responding to emails
with creditors re: filing proofs of claim.

11/22/2018 Carol O'Donnell 1.00  200.00  200.00
Email to Creditors re claims Procedure . Post
documents to website, email documents to
OSB.

11/22/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails.

11/22/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.00  650.00  1,300.00
Review of proposed payments and
discussion with A. Zeldin on same. Update
call with A&M re: intercompany claims,
claims process, sales process and cash
flows.

11/22/2018 Adam Zeldin 1.80  400.00  720.00
Attend to claims process matters.
Correspond with Aralez re: same. Review
proposed payments and correspond with C.
Anania/A&M re: same.

11/23/2018 Paul Van Eyk 0.50  795.00  397.50
Review of emails from Torys.

11/23/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.20  650.00  1,430.00
Call with Stikeman re: claims process, email
to counsel to Nuvo on same. Attending to
multiple calls from counsel to Jubliant re:
claims procedure. Correspondence with
Torys re: Bezalip report. Discussion with A.
Zeldin re: proposed wire payments.

11/23/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.25  400.00  1,700.00



Invoice No.: 20403562
Date: 12/14/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Attend to claims process matters, including
corresponding with J. Hall/C. Anania re:
same. Review/approve disbursements,
correspond with C. Anania/A&M re: same.
Correspond with A&M re: CF. Review weekly
variance analysis.

11/26/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.50  795.00  1,192.50
Review of emails, discussion with P. Patel.

11/26/2018 Pritesh Patel 3.00  650.00  1,950.00
Drafting of Fifth Report.  Review of offers
received.

11/26/2018 Adam Zeldin 6.10  400.00  2,440.00
Attend at Aralez. Review/update Sixth
Report. Correspond with J. Hall re: Bezalip,
claims process matters. Correspond with C.
Anania re proposed disbursements. Attend to
claims process matters. Respond to several
creditor inquires re claims process.

11/27/2018 Pascale Lareau 0.80  185.00  148.00
Enter Proofs of Claim.

11/27/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.10  200.00  20.00
Communications with Creditor, (Witmore).
Emails with A. Zedlin.

11/27/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.10  200.00  20.00
Email claims register. Discussion with P.
Patel re: Pierre Gauthier claim.

11/27/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.25  795.00  1,788.75
Calls with Torys and Goodmans, review of
emails from Torys and Stikemans, review of
material, comments on draft Fifth Report.

11/27/2018 Pritesh Patel 6.00  650.00  3,900.00
Review and comments on Affidavit. Continue
drafting Fifth Report. Review of claims
received and updates to Torys and
Stikemans re: claims process. Call with Torys
re: offers.

11/27/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.50  400.00  1,800.00
Attend at Aralez. Review proofs of claim.
Prepare summary of claims filed to date.
Discuss same with P. Patel. Correspond with
A&M re: CF, claims, other matters.
Review/update Sixth Report.

11/27/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.10  400.00  840.00
Review current week cheque run and
supporting documents and correspond with
C. Anania re: same. Correspond with C.
Berube re: proposed research grant. Attend
to several calls with creditors re: proof of
claims/claims process.

11/28/2018 Pascale Lareau 1.10  185.00  203.50



Invoice No.: 20403562
Date: 12/14/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Enter Proofs of Claim.
11/28/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.10  200.00  20.00

Prepare claims register and email to A.
Zeldin.

11/28/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.00  795.00  2,385.00
Review of emails from Torys and Stikemans,
review of Bezalip material, review of Adams
affidavit and comments to P. Patel / Torys.

11/28/2018 Pritesh Patel 7.00  650.00  4,550.00
Review of proposed payments, email to
Deerfield on same. Review claims and
update to Stikeman. Correspondence with
Torys re: scheduling matters, Bezalip.
Review and comment on updated affidavit.
Review of sales process materials, drafting
Fifth Report.

11/28/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.20  400.00  1,680.00
Attend at Aralez. Continue review  of current
week cheque run. Correspond with C.
Anania/J. Hall/A&M re: same.
Review/approve APCI/Board payroll.
Review/update claims filed summary and
correspond with P. Patel re: same.

11/28/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.90  400.00  1,560.00
Respond to creditors re: claims process.
Deal with other claims process matters. Draft
email to Deerfield re: proposed
disbursements. Review affidavit and
supplement re: Bezalip transaction, discuss
same with P. Patel.

11/29/2018 Pascale Lareau 1.30  185.00  240.50
Enter Proofs of Claim.

11/29/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.90  200.00  180.00
Send confirmations to Creditors who filed
claims. Prepare complete mailing lists.

11/29/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.00  795.00  2,385.00
Review of emails on Nuvo sales hearing,
review draft material, review emails and
material related to Bezalip.

11/29/2018 Pritesh Patel 6.00  650.00  3,900.00
Review of claims received. Review of
correspondence re: Bezalip; discussion with
A. Zeldin on same. Discussion with A. Zeldin
re: CF. Review of Termination Order, and
updating Fifth Report for same.

11/29/2018 Adam Zeldin 5.20  400.00  2,080.00
Correspond with C. Anania/A&M re:
proposed disbursements. Review updated
cash flow, correspond with A&M re: same.
Review/update Fifth Report for cash flow.



Invoice No.: 20403562
Date: 12/14/2018

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

11/29/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.90  400.00  1,960.00
Attend to claims process matters, correspond
with Aralez/P. Patel re: same. Review/update
claims filed summary. Review proofs of
claim. Respond to several creditor enquiries
re: claims process.

11/30/2018 Pascale Lareau 1.70  185.00  314.50
Enter Proofs of Claim. Verify all claims filed.

11/30/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.50  200.00  100.00
Post documents to website, email to OSB.

11/30/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.00  795.00  1,590.00
Review of draft Fifth Report; discussion with
P. Patel and A. Zeldin; review of court
material.

11/30/2018 Pritesh Patel 5.00  650.00  3,250.00
Review of final claims schedule and
discussion with A. Zeldin on same. Call with
Stikeman and Torys to discuss claims and
next steps. Drafting Fifth Report, review of
final version of affidavit and Order.

11/30/2018 Adam Zeldin 5.00  400.00  2,000.00
Review/update Fifth Report & appendices.
Review/update summary of claims filed.
Attend call with Torys/Stikemans/Richter
team re: claims filed and next steps in claims
process. Correspond with C. Anania re: HST
audit, cash matters, claims process matters.

11/30/2018 Adam Zeldin 1.20  400.00  480.00
Attend call with S. Subramanian re:
insurance and payment for same.
Correspond with A&M re: updated CF.Send
certain claims filed to Stikemans/Torys as
requested.

Fees Total 131.45 $ 67,945.25



Invoice No.: 20403562
Date: 12/14/2018

Remittance Form
Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 67,945.25
Technology and Administrative Fees 3,394.26
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 9,274.13

Total Due CAD $ 80,613.64

Payment Options

Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank
Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Cheques Payable to: Richter Advisory Group Inc.
Send to: 181 Bay Street, Suite 3320, Bay Wellington Tower, Toronto ON  M5J 2T3

Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca



Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Date: 01/09/2019
Invoice No.: 20403628

Engagement No.: 2021281
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered to December 31, 2018 $ 140,103.75

Sub-Total 140,103.75
Technology and Administrative Fees 7,005.19
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 19,124.16

Total Due CAD $ 166,233.10



Invoice No.: 20403628
Date: 01/09/2019

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Zeldin 89.75 $ 400.00 $ 35,900.00
Carol O'Donnell 4.50  200.00  900.00
Paul Van Eyk 45.25  795.00  35,973.75
Pritesh Patel 102.80  650.00  66,820.00
Steve Davis 1.70  300.00  510.00

244.00 $ 140,103.75



Invoice No.: 20403628
Date: 01/09/2019

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

12/01/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.50 $ 795.00 $ 2,782.50
Review of draft Fifth report, comments,
review of emails.

12/01/2018 Pritesh Patel 6.50  650.00  4,225.00
Finalize draft of Fifth Report and circulate to
A.Zeldin and P.van Eyk for comments.
Update for internal comments and circulate
to Torys for review.

12/01/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.90  400.00  1,160.00
Review/comment on Fifth Report.
Correspond with P. Patel re: same. Review
updated CF. Format for report purposes.
Attend call with A&M re: same, correspond
with P. Patel re: same.

12/02/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.50  650.00  1,625.00
Review of comments from Torys on Report,
and correspondence on same. Update and
circulate revised draft of Fifth Report.

12/02/2018 Adam Zeldin 1.00  400.00  400.00
Review/update Fifth Report. Correspond with
P. Patel re: same.

12/03/2018 Paul Van Eyk 4.50  795.00  3,577.50
Review of emails, documents, draft report
and edits from counsel.

12/03/2018 Pritesh Patel 8.00  650.00  5,200.00
Review and comments on letters re claims.
Correspondence with counsels re claims.
Review and update to report based on
comments from Stikeman.

12/03/2018 Adam Zeldin 7.20  400.00  2,880.00
Review/update Sixth Report. Review updated
affidavit in connection with same. Deal with
certain claims process matters, correspond
with P. Patel/A. Slavens re: same.
Update/assemble appendices for Fifth
Report.

12/03/2018 Adam Zeldin 0.80  400.00  320.00
Correspond with C. Anania/P. Patel re: HST
audit. Review letter from CRA re: proposed
assessment for HST.

12/04/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.70  200.00  140.00
Post documents to website and email to
OSB. Correct postings.

12/04/2018 Paul Van Eyk 5.00  795.00  3,975.00
Review of emails, attendance for US hearing,
calls/emails with Stikemans on closing
issues, emails from Nuvo's counsel,
discussion with P. Patel and Torys.

12/04/2018 Pritesh Patel 8.00  650.00  5,200.00



Invoice No.: 20403628
Date: 01/09/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Attendance at Torys for US Sale hearing.
Calls with Stikemans re Allergan. Review of
comments from Goodmans on Fifth Report.
Call with counsels re Claims. Call with Aralez
re landlord claims. Compile appendices,
finalize Fifth Report for service.

12/04/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.90  400.00  1,960.00
Review/update Sixth Report. Review latest
affidavit, confidential supplement for Sixth
Report. Respond to creditor enquiries re:
claims process. Deal with claims process
matters, Allergan claim and correspond with
J. Hall/P. Patel re: same.

12/04/2018 Adam Zeldin 1.80  400.00  720.00
Attend call with C. Freeland/S. Subramamian
re: landlord claim. Review API guarantee re:
same. Meeting with C. Anania/A&M re:
claims filed. Correspond with Allergan re:
proof of claim.

12/05/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.50  795.00  2,782.50
Review of email, court material, discussion
with Torys, discussion with P. Patel.

12/05/2018 Pritesh Patel 8.00  650.00  5,200.00
Responding to numerous emails, calls re
claims and termination order. Review of new
claim received. Review of draft affidavit re
Bezalip. Review of draft Sixth Report.

12/05/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.10  400.00  1,640.00
Attend at Aralez. Review landlord claim and
supporting agreements/guarantee. Attend
meeting with A&M/C. Anania re: claims filed.
Review correspondence from Stikemans re:
Allergan claim.

12/05/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.50  400.00  1,000.00
Review proof of claim filed by former
executive, discuss same with P. Patel. Deal
with other claims process matters.
Review/comment on claims analysis
schedule, correpsond with A&M/J. Hall/C.
Anania re: same. Discuss claims, Sixth
Report with P. Patel.

12/06/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.70  200.00  140.00
Post documents to website and email to
OSB.

12/06/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.50  795.00  2,782.50
Review of emails and documents from Torys
related to Bezalip APA.

12/06/2018 Pritesh Patel 8.00  650.00  5,200.00
Review of materials re Bezalip. Review and
edits to Sixth Report and discussion with A.
Zeldin on same.



Invoice No.: 20403628
Date: 01/09/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

12/06/2018 Adam Zeldin 6.20  400.00  2,480.00
Correspond with C. Anania/A&M/P. Patel re:
various claims process matters. Review
certain proofs of claim. Review/comment on
claims review summary. Review/update
Confidential Supplement to Sixth Report.
Correspond with A&M/P. Patel re:
disbursements/CF.

12/07/2018 Paul Van Eyk 5.50  795.00  4,372.50
Attendance at court; discussion with counsel;
review of emails. Review and comments on
Sixth Report.

12/07/2018 Pritesh Patel 8.00  650.00  5,200.00
Preparation for and attendance in Court for
approval and sale vesting order. Edits to
Sixth Report and circulate internally for
comments. Call with CRA re HST audit and
claim, letter to CRA on same. Email to
Deerfield re payment.

12/07/2018 Adam Zeldin 5.50  400.00  2,200.00
Review/update Sixth Report. Review/approve
disbursements, correspond with C.
Anania/A&M/P. Patel re: same. Update
summary of professional fees paid. Draft
email to Deerfield re: Moelis fees. Update
claims summary/tracker. Upload claims to
data room.

12/07/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.50  400.00  1,000.00
Attend call with A&M re: CF, estimated
variances, correspond with P. Patel re: same.
Review email from Stikemans re:
sources/uses analysis, correspond with P.
Patel re: same. Correspond with C. Anania
re: HST audit. Review emails/documents re:
same.

12/10/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.00  795.00  2,385.00
Review of emails and court material,
discussions with P. Patel and A. Zeldin.

12/10/2018 Pritesh Patel 8.00  650.00  5,200.00
Discussion with A&M re flow of funds,
reserve and claims analysis. Update and
circulate claims tracker. Finalize draft of Sixth
Report and circulate to Torys for comments.
Review and comments on Distribution Order.
Draft distribution section for Report.

12/10/2018 Steve Davis 1.00  300.00  300.00
T&E expenses Nov 27 to Dec 6 - reviewing
supporting documentation for sampled items.

12/10/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.00  400.00  1,600.00



Invoice No.: 20403628
Date: 01/09/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Attend at Aralez. Correspond with C. Anania
re: employee expenses, disbursements;
Review/update Sixth Report; Correspond
with A&M re: cf matters, disbursements.

12/11/2018 Carol O'Donnell 1.10  200.00  220.00
Post documents to website, email to OSB.

12/11/2018 Paul Van Eyk 3.25  795.00  2,583.75
Review of emails from Torys and Stikemans,
review of material, discussion with P. Patel.

12/11/2018 Pritesh Patel 8.00  650.00  5,200.00
Call with Stikemans re flow of funds.  Review
and update Sixth Report based on comments
from Stikemans. Finalize draft of Confidential
Supplement and circulate to Torys for
comment.

12/11/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.50  400.00  1,400.00
Correspond with A&M re: CF, variances,
proposed disbursements. Correspond with P.
Patel re: Sixth Report. Review/approve
payroll, other disbursements. Correspond
with C. Anania re: cheque run. Call/emails
with S. Subramanian re: proposed
disbursements.

12/12/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.50  200.00  100.00
Post documents to website, email to OSB.

12/12/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.00  795.00  1,590.00
Review of emails and material.

12/12/2018 Pritesh Patel 5.00  650.00  3,250.00
Discussions with A. Zeldin re payment
requests, cash flow variances. Update Sixth
Report based on comments from Intercept.
Finalize and sign Sixth Report and
Supplement for service.

12/12/2018 Steve Davis 0.70  300.00  210.00
Reviewing payment file register for Dec. 10.
Matching old cheques with replacement
cheques.

12/12/2018 Adam Zeldin 6.20  400.00  2,480.00
Attend at Aralez. Review current week
cheque run, including analysing
voided/reissued cheques. Correspond with J.
Hall/L. Berardelli/C. Anania/A&M re: same.
Correspond with A&M re: CF matters.

12/13/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.80  200.00  160.00
Post documents to report, repost motion for
distribution order and email to OSB.

12/13/2018 Paul Van Eyk 2.25  795.00  1,788.75
Review of emails, discussion with P. Patel,
claims call with Torys and Stikemans.

12/13/2018 Pritesh Patel 3.50  650.00  2,275.00



Invoice No.: 20403628
Date: 01/09/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Discussion with A. Zeldin re proposed
payments and cash flow. Call with Torys and
Stikemans re claims tracker.

12/13/2018 Adam Zeldin 5.90  400.00  2,360.00
Several calls/emails with C. Anania/A&M re:
cheque run/disbursements other CF matters.
Review/update cheque run summary and
comparative analysis re: voided/reissued
cheques. Review/approve other
disbursements, discuss same with A&M/P.
Patel/C. Anania.

12/14/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails.

12/14/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.50  650.00  1,625.00
Review of disbursement request and
discussions with A. Zeldin on same. Review
and response to emails re MOF, closing,
claims.

12/14/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.70  400.00  1,880.00
Several calls/emails with A&M/C. Anania re:
cheuqe run, CF matters. Discuss cheque run,
CF matters, claims matters with P. Patel.
Calls with Accuristix re: claim, withdrawal of
same. Review other disbursements, discuss
same with A&M/P. Patel.

12/14/2018 Adam Zeldin 1.30  400.00  520.00
Emails/calls with C. Berube/C. Anania re:
proposed disbursements. Discuss same with
P. Patel. Review email from Minitry of
Finance (Ontario) re: amounts owing,
correspond with J. Hall/C. Anania re: same.

12/17/2018 Paul Van Eyk 4.00  795.00  3,180.00
Attendance in court, review of material,
discussion with Torys, review of emails
related to closing.

12/17/2018 Pritesh Patel 6.50  650.00  4,225.00
Preparation for and attendance in Court for
approval of Bezalip transaction.  Call with
A&M and Stikemans re flow of funds and
closing estimates for Nuvo transaction.  Call
with counsel to Jubliant re claim.

12/17/2018 Adam Zeldin 4.00  400.00  1,600.00
Correspond with P. Patel re: amounts owing
to Ministry of Ontario, CF matters, closing
matters. Review prior week variances,
discuss same with A&M. Review draft
working capital analysis. Correspond with
A&M re: CF matters.

12/18/2018 Carol O'Donnell 0.70  200.00  140.00
Post documents to website, email to OSB.

12/18/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00



Invoice No.: 20403628
Date: 01/09/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review of emails on closing.
12/18/2018 Pritesh Patel 0.50  650.00  325.00

Arrange for execution of Monitor's Certificate
re Bezalip. Review of revised CRA claim and
update to Stikeman on same. Discussions
with A. Zeldin re cash flow.

12/18/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.90  400.00  1,160.00
Attend at Aralez. Calls/emails with A&M re:
CF matters, working capital; Review CRA's
amended proof of claim. Correspond with C.
Anania re: working capital, disbursements.
Review/update payables summary. Review
deposits/prepaids analysis.

12/19/2018 Paul Van Eyk 0.25  795.00  198.75
Review of emails.

12/19/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.00  650.00  1,300.00
Calls with A&M re status of Nuvo transaction
and closing estimates. Discussions with A.
Zeldin re variance analysis for KEIP,
proposed payments and CF. Follow-up call
with counsel to Jubliant re claim.

12/19/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.70  400.00  1,480.00
Attend at Aralez. Review KERP/KEIP
variance analysis, discuss same with A&M.
Correspond with A&M/C. Anania re: CF
matters, claims matters. Review/approve
payments. Review letter from CRA
confirming completion of audit.

12/20/2018 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails, discussion with P. Patel.

12/20/2018 Pritesh Patel 3.50  650.00  2,275.00
Updates to claims tracker.  Correspondence
with counsels and A&M on estimates for
working capital and reserve calculations re
Nuvo closing.

12/20/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.50  400.00  1,400.00
Attend at Aralez. Review current week
cheque run. Correspond with C. Anania/A&M
re: same. Emails/calls with C. Anania/A&M
re: CF matters. Prepare anaylsis of
professional fees paid, discuss same with P.
Patel. Respond to creditor inquiries.

12/21/2018 Paul Van Eyk 0.75  795.00  596.25
Review of certificates, review of emails,
admin.

12/21/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.50  650.00  1,625.00
Call with Goodmans re claims tracker.
Review of draft working capital and closing
estimates from A&M, and all-parties call to
discuss same. Review of CF and court
orders for preparation of reserve analysis.



Invoice No.: 20403628
Date: 01/09/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

12/21/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.00  400.00  1,200.00
Review/approve T&E expenses.
Review/approve current week cheque
run/wires, emails/calls with C.
Anania/A&M/P. Patel re: same. Emails/calls
with A&M re: CF matters, working capital,
closing matters. Review emails between J.
Hall/Stikemans re: MOF claim.

12/21/2018 Adam Zeldin 2.90  400.00  1,160.00
Review professional fees summary, discuss
same with A&M. Review latest adjusted
working capital anaylsis. Call with A&M re:
same. Discuss same with P. Patel.

12/24/2018 Paul Van Eyk 0.75  795.00  596.25
Review of emails.

12/24/2018 Pritesh Patel 3.50  650.00  2,275.00
Review and comments on Estimated Closing
calculation schedule. Review and comments
on draft Reserve calculations.
Correspondence with Torys re Closing
agenda and questions. Review and
discussion with A. Zeldin re payroll.

12/24/2018 Adam Zeldin 1.75  400.00  700.00
Review/approve payroll and board payroll.
Discuss same with P. Patel. Review latest
KERP/KIEP CF and calculations.

12/26/2018 Paul Van Eyk 0.50  795.00  397.50
Review of emails, discussion with P. Patel.

12/26/2018 Pritesh Patel 2.50  650.00  1,625.00
Numerous emails with Torys and Stikemans
re working capital and closing. Call with
P.van Eyk re KERP. Review and comment
on updated Reserve calculation.

12/27/2018 Pritesh Patel 4.00  650.00  2,600.00
Attending to emails from lawyers on working
capital and Reserve calculations, and call
with A&M on same. Call with A. Zeldin re API
forecasted expenses and KEIP calculations.

12/27/2018 Adam Zeldin 3.00  400.00  1,200.00
Review updated KEIP/KERP CF and KEIP
calculations. Emails with P. Patel re: same.
Attend call with A&M re: same. Review
holdback summary.

12/28/2018 Pritesh Patel 0.50  650.00  325.00
Review and comments on the flow of funds.
Review of correspondence from Torys re
Reserve.

12/30/2018 Pritesh Patel 0.50  650.00  325.00



Invoice No.: 20403628
Date: 01/09/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review of emails from Torys re closing.
Review and sign-off on flow of funds, closing
steps.

12/31/2018 Pritesh Patel 0.80  650.00  520.00
Attending to closing matters, coordinate
receipt of funds from Escrow Agent.

Fees Total 244.00 $ 140,103.75



Invoice No.: 20403628
Date: 01/09/2019

Remittance Form
Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 140,103.75
Technology and Administrative Fees 7,005.19
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 19,124.16

Total Due CAD $ 166,233.10

Payment Options

Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank
Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Cheques Payable to: Richter Advisory Group Inc.
Send to: 181 Bay Street, Suite 3320, Bay Wellington Tower, Toronto ON  M5J 2T3

Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca



Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Date: 01/30/2019
Invoice No.: 20403682

Engagement No.: 2021281
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered to January 15, 2019 $ 14,626.25

Sub-Total 14,626.25
Technology and Administrative Fees 731.31
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 1,996.48

Total Due CAD $ 17,354.04



Invoice No.: 20403682
Date: 01/30/2019

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Zeldin 11.25 $ 400.00 $ 4,500.00
Carol O'Donnell 1.20  200.00  240.00
Paul Van Eyk 4.75  795.00  3,776.25
Pritesh Patel 9.40  650.00  6,110.00

26.60 $ 14,626.25



Invoice No.: 20403682
Date: 01/30/2019

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

01/02/2019 Adam Zeldin 0.25 $ 400.00 $ 100.00
Emails with P. Patel/S. Dukesz re claims filed
by APCI employees.

01/03/2019 Carol O'Donnell 0.20  200.00  40.00
Open new US bank account.

01/03/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.00  650.00  650.00
Correspondence with Stikeman re employee
claims. Call with representative of S. Charles
re claim. Call and correspondence with
counsel to Jubliant re claims process. Return
message left by shareholder with respect to
status of CCAA proceedings.

01/04/2019 Pritesh Patel 0.20  650.00  130.00
Follow-up call with S. Charles re claim.

01/04/2019 Adam Zeldin 0.50  400.00  200.00
Review correspondence between P. Patel/C.
Anania re payment of KERP. Correspond
with J. Cuttler re Jubilant claim.

01/07/2019 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Discussion with P. Patel on working capital
adjustments, closing issues.

01/07/2019 Adam Zeldin 1.00  400.00  400.00
Emails with A&M re KERP/KEIP, updated
cash flow, closing working capital.

01/08/2019 Carol O'Donnell 1.00  200.00  200.00
Post documents to website and email to
CCAA, email to P. Patel regarding request
from CCAA for Form 3.

01/08/2019 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails.

01/08/2019 Pritesh Patel 2.50  650.00  1,625.00
Correspondence with Torys re stay extension
and next steps in proceedings. Discussions
with A. Zeldin re Reserve/Holdback.
Responding to inquiries from
creditors/shareholders re status of
proceedings. Correspondence with OSB re
Form 3.

01/08/2019 Adam Zeldin 1.80  400.00  720.00
Emails with A&M re distribution holdback,
updated cash flow; discuss same with P.
Patel. Respond to creditor enquiries.

01/09/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.75  795.00  596.25
Review of emails.

01/09/2019 Pritesh Patel 0.20  650.00  130.00
Review of email to Dunphy J. Responding to
inquiries from creditors re status of
proceedings.



Invoice No.: 20403682
Date: 01/30/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

01/09/2019 Adam Zeldin 0.50  400.00  200.00
Emails/calls with C. Anania re claims matters
and payment of KERP/KEIP.

01/10/2019 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails.

01/10/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.50  650.00  975.00
Discussion with A. Zeldin re funding request
from API. Call with A&M re KERP and
correspondence with Stikeman on same.
Review of KERP agreements.

01/10/2019 Adam Zeldin 2.20  400.00  880.00
Review payroll (including KERP amounts),
discuss same with P. Patel/C. Anania. Attend
call with C. Anania re working capital,
creditor matters. Correspond with A&M re
updated cash flow. Respond to credito
enquiries.

01/11/2019 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails on KEIP/KERP, discussion
with P. Patel.

01/11/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.00  650.00  650.00
Updates to claims tracker and circulate
update to Torys. Correspondence with
Stikemans re KERP.

01/11/2019 Adam Zeldin 2.00  400.00  800.00
Review correspondence between Richter
and Stikemans re KERP. Review/approve
payroll/KERP. Correspond with C. Anania re
same. Correspond with A&M re cash flow
matters.

01/14/2019 Pritesh Patel 2.50  650.00  1,625.00
Responding to inquiries from creditors re
status of proceedings. Review of outstanding
cheque listing from Goodmans and
discussion with APCI on same.
Correspondence with Stikeman re
outstanding cheque listing.

01/14/2019 Adam Zeldin 3.00  400.00  1,200.00
Review Dec 31 working capital analysis,
including o/s cheque list; attend call with P.
Patel/C. Anania re same. Respond to creditor
inquiries. Review updated cash flow;
emails/calls with A&M re same.

01/15/2019 Pritesh Patel 0.50  650.00  325.00
Correspondence with counsels re
outstanding cheque listing and claims.
Discussion with A. Zeldin re cash flow and
professional fee disbursements.

Fees Total 26.60 $ 14,626.25



Invoice No.: 20403682
Date: 01/30/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount



Invoice No.: 20403682
Date: 01/30/2019

Remittance Form
Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 14,626.25
Technology and Administrative Fees 731.31
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 1,996.48

Total Due CAD $ 17,354.04

Payment Options

Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank
Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Cheques Payable to: Richter Advisory Group Inc.
Send to: 181 Bay Street, Suite 3320, Bay Wellington Tower, Toronto ON  M5J 2T3

Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca



Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Date: 02/18/2019
Invoice No.: 20403748

Engagement No.: 2021281
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered to January 31, 2019 $ 49,203.25

Sub-Total 49,203.25
Technology and Administrative Fees 2,460.16
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 6,716.24

Total Due CAD $ 58,379.65



Invoice No.: 20403748
Date: 02/18/2019

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Zeldin 33.65 $ 400.00 $ 13,460.00
Carol O'Donnell 1.80  200.00  360.00
Paul Van Eyk 8.50  795.00  6,757.50
Pritesh Patel 11.20  650.00  7,280.00
Pritesh Patel 26.85  795.00  21,345.75

82.00 $ 49,203.25



Invoice No.: 20403748
Date: 02/18/2019

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

01/16/2019 Pritesh Patel 2.50 $ 650.00 $ 1,625.00
Call with Stikemans re outstanding cheques.
Call with A&M and APCI re NWC calculation
and accruals. Correspondence with
Stikemans re contemplated payments,
employee bonus claims.

01/16/2019 Adam Zeldin 1.80  400.00  720.00
Attend call with C. Anania re claims matters,
working capital. Emails with A&M re cash
flow. Review/approve proposed professional
fee payments, correspond with A&M re
same. Review updated cash flow forecast.

01/17/2019 Pritesh Patel 4.50  650.00  2,925.00
Call with Stikeman re employee claims. Call
with Goodmans re claims update and
outstanding cheque listing. Call with Bennett
Jones re claims and outstanding cheques.
Discussion with A. Zeldin re bonus
entitlements.

01/17/2019 Adam Zeldin 2.10  400.00  840.00
Correspond with C. Anania/A&M/P. Patel re
accrued bonuses, estimated working capital
calculation. Review cash flow variance
analysis.

01/18/2019 Pritesh Patel 4.20  650.00  2,730.00
Discussion with A. Zeldin re cash flow.
Review of letter from Allergan and
correspondence with Stikeman re Closing
reconciliation and adjustments. Drafting of
Seventh Report. Updates to claims tracker.

01/18/2019 Adam Zeldin 2.75  400.00  1,100.00
Review/comment on revised CF forecast,
correspond with A&M re same.

01/21/2019 Paul Van Eyk 1.25  795.00  993.75
Review of email. Discussion with P. Patel on
Report.

01/21/2019 Pritesh Patel 4.50  795.00  3,577.50
Continue drafting Seventh Report.  Review of
affidavit.

01/21/2019 Adam Zeldin 4.00  400.00  1,600.00
Review/update CF section of Seventh
Report, including formatting of revised CF
forecast and variance analysis. Calls/emails
with A&M re revised CF and variance
analysis. Emails with S. Subramanian re stay
extensions and his statutory requirements.

01/21/2019 Adam Zeldin 1.50  400.00  600.00



Invoice No.: 20403748
Date: 02/18/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Attend call with S. Dukesz re claims and
other matters in connection with stay
extension motion. Send update email to S.
Dukesz re claims statistics, distribution
holdback. Discuss same with P. Patel.
Respond to C. Anania re creditor enquiry.

01/22/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.25  795.00  198.75
Review of emails.

01/22/2019 Pritesh Patel 6.75  795.00  5,366.25
Call with Stikeman re affidavit. Discussions
with A. Zeldin re claims reconciliation and
email to Stikeman on same. Review and
response to Stikeman re shareholder claim.
Updates to claims tracker. Finalize draft of
Report and circulate to A. Zeldin.

01/22/2019 Adam Zeldin 5.75  400.00  2,300.00
Review/update Seventh Report.
Review/update/format cash flow and notes
thereto for Seventh Report. Several
calls/emails with A&M re updated cash flow.
Discuss claims matters with P. Patel.

01/23/2019 Paul Van Eyk 4.50  795.00  3,577.50
Review of draft report, edits, discussion with
P. Patel.

01/23/2019 Pritesh Patel 7.50  795.00  5,962.50
Call with A&M re Specified Amounts and
working capital. Call with Stikemans re
Allergan claim and Specified Amounts.
Update Report based on internal comments,
comments from Torys. Circulate draft to
Stikeman.

01/23/2019 Adam Zeldin 5.25  400.00  2,100.00
Review/comment on/update Seventh Report,
discuss same with P. Patel. Correspond with
A&M re cash flow and variance analysis.
Review/update/assemble appendices for
Seventh Report. Correspond with S.
Subramanian re cash flow.

01/24/2019 Carol O'Donnell 0.30  200.00  60.00
Post document to website.

01/24/2019 Paul Van Eyk 1.00  795.00  795.00
Review of emails, review of edits to report.

01/24/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.00  795.00  795.00
Update to report based on comments from
Stikeman.

01/24/2019 Adam Zeldin 1.00  400.00  400.00
Correspond with A&M/S. Subramanian re
notes to CF. Discuss same with P. Patel.
Review bank statements to confirm APCI
cash transferred on closing of Nuvo
transaction.



Invoice No.: 20403748
Date: 02/18/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

01/25/2019 Carol O'Donnell 0.40  200.00  80.00
Post documents to website and email to
OSB.

01/25/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.50  795.00  397.50
Review of emails.

01/25/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.30  795.00  1,033.50
Finalize, sign and compile report for service.

01/25/2019 Adam Zeldin 1.50  400.00  600.00
Correspond with C. Anania re creditor
enquiry. Review/approve API operating
expense payments, followup email to S.
Subramanian re same.

01/28/2019 Carol O'Donnell 0.50  200.00  100.00
Post documents to website and email to
CCAA,

01/28/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.50  795.00  397.50
Review of emails.

01/28/2019 Pritesh Patel 0.50  795.00  397.50
Call with Goodmans re claims review and
update.

01/29/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.50  795.00  397.50
Review of emails.

01/29/2019 Pritesh Patel 2.30  795.00  1,828.50
Review of email from Torys to shareholder re
status of proceedings. Correspondence with
Stikemans re upcoming motion. Review of
emails from Torys re former employee
claims. Discussion with A. Zeldin re API
disbursement request.

01/29/2019 Adam Zeldin 3.50  400.00  1,400.00
Review/approve board payroll,
transaction/prof. fees, discuss same with P.
Patel. Correspond with A&M re: transaction
fees, retaining API's transfer agent. Email to
Deerfield re: payment of transaction fees.
Review shareholder enquiry response email.

01/30/2019 Carol O'Donnell 0.20  200.00  40.00
Post document to website.

01/30/2019 Pritesh Patel 3.00  795.00  2,385.00
Preparation for and attendance in Court for
extension hearing. Call with creditor re claim.
Discussions with A. Zeldin re KEIP.

01/30/2019 Adam Zeldin 4.50  400.00  1,800.00
Calls/emails with A&M re: KEIP, HST,
professional fees, working capital, claims
process matters. Discuss same with P. Patel.
Review KEIP calculation and correspond with
A&M/P. Patel re: same. Review Chapter 11
court documents in connection with KEIP.



Invoice No.: 20403748
Date: 02/18/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

01/31/2019 Carol O'Donnell 0.40  200.00  80.00
Email and post to documents to website.

Fees Total 82.00 $ 49,203.25



Invoice No.: 20403748
Date: 02/18/2019

Remittance Form
Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 49,203.25
Technology and Administrative Fees 2,460.16
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 6,716.24

Total Due CAD $ 58,379.65

Payment Options

Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank
Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Cheques Payable to: Richter Advisory Group Inc.
Send to: 181 Bay Street, Suite 3320, Bay Wellington Tower, Toronto ON  M5J 2T3

Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca



Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Date: 03/07/2019
Invoice No.: 20403810

Engagement No.: 2021281
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered to February 15, 2019 $ 10,131.00

Sub-Total 10,131.00
Technology and Administrative Fees 1,186.75
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 1,471.31

Total Due CAD $ 12,789.06



Invoice No.: 20403810
Date: 03/07/2019

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Zeldin 13.80 $ 400.00 $ 5,520.00
Paul Van Eyk 1.20  795.00  954.00
Pritesh Patel 4.60  795.00  3,657.00

19.60 $ 10,131.00



Invoice No.: 20403810
Date: 03/07/2019

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

02/04/2019 Pritesh Patel 0.50 $ 795.00 $ 397.50
Discussion with A&M re KEIP and timing for
claims and working capital resolution.

02/04/2019 Adam Zeldin 1.00  400.00  400.00
Correspond with C. Anania re invoices
received from an Aralez customer. Email to
Aralez customer to coordinate payment of
amounts owing to Aralez and to advise of the
status of the proceedings.

02/05/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.50  795.00  397.50
Review of email from Torys.

02/05/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.50  795.00  1,192.50
Review of plan docs and correspondence
with Torys on same. Review of resolution on
severance claims. Review and comment on
letters re bonus claims. Correspondence with
Stikeman and A&M re NWC and accrued
expenses.

02/05/2019 Adam Zeldin 0.50  400.00  200.00
Correspond with C. Anania and Aralez
customer re payment of outstanding invoices.

02/06/2019 Adam Zeldin 3.00  400.00  1,200.00
Review revised KEIP cash flow and
supporting schedules. Attend call with A&M
re same. Discuss same with P. Patel.

02/07/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.20  795.00  159.00
Review of emails.

02/07/2019 Pritesh Patel 0.50  795.00  397.50
Discussions with A. Zeldin re KEIP
reimbursement to Aralez US.

02/07/2019 Adam Zeldin 3.00  400.00  1,200.00
Review cash flow and other schedules in
connection with KEIP and discuss same,
including payment, with A&M. Draft email to
Deerfield re KEIP payment. Emails with S.
Subramanian re paying the KEIP,
professional fees.

02/08/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.10  795.00  79.50
Review of emails.

02/08/2019 Adam Zeldin 2.00  400.00  800.00
Attend calls with CRA, a creditor, regarding
their claim against APCI. Discuss same with
P. Patel. Correspond with A&M/S.
Subramanian re KEIP payment, professional
fees, creditor enquiries.

02/11/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.20  795.00  159.00
Review of emails.

02/11/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.50  795.00  1,192.50



Invoice No.: 20403810
Date: 03/07/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review of letter to Jubliant and call with
Stikemans re employee claims. Call with
counsel to Jubliant. Update to claims tracker
and circulate to Torys. Circulate all D&O
claims to Stikeman.

02/13/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.10  795.00  79.50
Review of emails.

02/13/2019 Pritesh Patel 0.60  795.00  477.00
Claims update call with Goodmans. Call with
Stikemans re D&O claim. Review of
response from T. Gunderson.

02/15/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.10  795.00  79.50
Review of emails.

02/15/2019 Adam Zeldin 4.30  400.00  1,720.00
Review professional fees invoices. Prepare
summary of professional fees incurred to
date and compare against forecast, discuss
same with P. Patel. Email to A&M re same.
Review/respond to enquiry from Stikemans
re D&O claims, discuss same with P. Patel.

Fees Total 19.60 $ 10,131.00



Invoice No.: 20403810
Date: 03/07/2019

Remittance Form
Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 10,131.00
Technology and Administrative Fees 1,186.75
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 1,471.31

Total Due CAD $ 12,789.06

Payment Options

Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank
Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Cheques Payable to: Richter Advisory Group Inc.
Send to: 181 Bay Street, Suite 3320, Bay Wellington Tower, Toronto ON  M5J 2T3

Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca



Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Date: 04/05/2019
Invoice No.: 20403922

Engagement No.: 2021281
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered to March 31, 2019 $ 78,317.00

Sub-Total 78,317.00
Technology and Administrative Fees 4,425.10
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 10,756.47

Total Due CAD $ 93,498.57



Invoice No.: 20403922
Date: 04/05/2019

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Sherman 0.40 $ 795.00 $ 318.00
Adam Zeldin 84.70  400.00  33,880.00
Carol O'Donnell 1.60  200.00  320.00
Pascale Lareau 0.40  185.00  74.00
Paul Van Eyk 3.70  795.00  2,941.50
Pritesh Patel 51.30  795.00  40,783.50

142.10 $ 78,317.00



Invoice No.: 20403922
Date: 04/05/2019

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

02/19/2019 Adam Zeldin 1.00 $ 400.00 $ 400.00
Email to A&M re professional fees incurred
and forecast. Review/update summary re
same.

02/20/2019 Adam Zeldin 0.25  400.00  100.00
Respond to shareholder enquiry.

02/21/2019 Pritesh Patel 0.30  795.00  238.50
Review of releases re claims. Review of
email from Stikemans re Nuvo claim.

02/21/2019 Adam Zeldin 2.20  400.00  880.00
Review estimated holdback summary and CF
forecasts, discuss same with A&M.
Review/update professional fees summary.
Correspond with C. Anania/A&M re closing
working capital. Correspond with A&M re
claims matters.

02/22/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.10  795.00  79.50
Review of emails.

02/22/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.30  795.00  1,033.50
Review of Nuvo claim and discussion with S.
Dukez re release. Update to claims tracker
and circulate to group. Discussion with A.
Zeldin re current API cash position and
correspondence with Torys on same.

02/22/2019 Adam Zeldin 3.20  400.00  1,280.00
Correspond with Stikemans re claims
matters. Review AP listing in connection with
closing WC calculation, correspond with
A&M/C. Anania re same and other WC
issues. Correspond with A&M/S.
Subramanian re API cash balance, discuss
same with P. Patel.

02/25/2019 Adam Sherman 0.20  795.00  159.00
Review/approve bank rec. for January 2019.

02/25/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.50  795.00  1,192.50
Discussion with A. Zeldin re API cash and
Reserve. Prepare and circulate analysis to
A&M for comment. Correspondence with
Stikemans, Torys re Reserve.

02/25/2019 Adam Zeldin 2.75  400.00  1,100.00
Prepare reconciliation of API cash balance
since the Nuvo transaction closing, discuss
same with P. Patel. Correspond with A&M/S.
Subramanian re API cash. Review API
variance analysis and correspond with A&M
re same.

02/25/2019 Adam Zeldin 1.00  400.00  400.00



Invoice No.: 20403922
Date: 04/05/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review email to A&M re proposed interim
distribution to Deerfield, discuss same with P.
Patel. Email to S. Subramanian re interim
distribution and API operating cash need to
end of proceedings.

02/26/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.20  795.00  159.00
Review of emails.

02/26/2019 Pritesh Patel 3.00  795.00  2,385.00
Call with Stikeman, Torys, A&M re Reserve
and surplus funds.  Correspondence and call
with API re projected operating expenses.
Call with A&M re outstanding expenses.
Discussions with A.Zeldin re NWC review.

02/26/2019 Adam Zeldin 4.20  400.00  1,680.00
Attend at Aralez. Meet with C. Anania/A&M
re closing working capital. Review A&M's
analysis re same. Discuss same and related
matters with P. Patel. Email to S.
Subramanian re API's operating cash need,
dicuss same with P. Patel.

02/27/2019 Pritesh Patel 2.50  795.00  1,987.50
Review of NWC analysis and discussion with
A. Zeldin on same. Correspondence with
Torys re API, release of funds from Reserve.

02/27/2019 Adam Zeldin 3.75  400.00  1,500.00
Review Closing Working Capital analysis,
including as against target WC and estimated
WC, discuss same with P. Patel. Review
correspondence between P. Patel/S.
Subramanian re API's operating cash need.

02/28/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.00  795.00  795.00
Correspondence with API re Mapi invoice,
and review of Intercept APA on same.
Correspondence with A. Zeldin re working
capital analysis.

02/28/2019 Adam Zeldin 4.60  400.00  1,840.00
Attend at Aralez. Review Dec 31, 2018 AP
balance in connection with WC analysis.
Meeting with C. Anania re same. Correspond
with A&M re WC review. Discuss WC review
with P. Patel. Review proposed
disbursements and correspond with API
finance team re same.

03/01/2019 Pritesh Patel 2.50  795.00  1,987.50
Correspondence with Torys re distribution to
Deerfield. Correspondence with API to
confirm opex and surplus funds. Call with
A&M re working capital reconciliation and
estimated adjustment. Update call with A.
Zeldin. Email to Stikemans re Nuvo claim.

03/01/2019 Adam Zeldin 4.00  400.00  1,600.00



Invoice No.: 20403922
Date: 04/05/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Attend call with A&M re Closing WC, discuss
same with P. Patel. Email to C. Anania re
prepaid inventory included in WC. Review
supporting documents provided by C. Anania
re Accruals in Closing WC. Review current
week variance analysis revised budget.

03/04/2019 Pascale Lareau 0.40  185.00  74.00
Prepare bank reconciliation, pdf, update bank
reconciliation file and follow-up for signature,
filing document.

03/04/2019 Pritesh Patel 0.50  795.00  397.50
Correspondence with Torys re final
reconciliation and surplus funds in Reserve.

03/04/2019 Adam Zeldin 1.25  400.00  500.00
Correspond with C. Anania/Stikemans re
2018 Nuvo royalties. Correspond with A&M
re Closing WC.

03/05/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.50  795.00  1,192.50
Review of claim from MOHLTC and
discussions with Richter team.
Correspondence with Stikeman and Torys on
claim and next steps.

03/05/2019 Adam Zeldin 3.00  400.00  1,200.00
Review emails and deal with several claims
process matters, discuss same with Richter
team. Correspond with A&M/Wilkie re claims
process matters. Review updated trial
balance in connection with closing WC,
correspond with A&M re same.

03/06/2019 Pritesh Patel 2.00  795.00  1,590.00
Call with counsel to Nuvo re MOHLTC claim
and claims tracker. Correspondence with
A&M, Stikeman re surplus Reserve funds,
and approving release of same.

03/06/2019 Adam Zeldin 0.20  400.00  80.00
Respond to creditor enquiry.

03/07/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.00  795.00  795.00
Call and correspondence with counsel re
interco receivable and next steps. Discussion
with A. Zeldin re CF update.

03/07/2019 Adam Zeldin 1.20  400.00  480.00
Review updated trial balance in connection
with Closing WC analysis. Correspond with
A&M re same.

03/08/2019 Adam Zeldin 4.50  400.00  1,800.00
Review/update cash flow in connection with
Eighth Report. Correspond with A&M re
same. Correspond with S. Subramanian re
payment of regulatory consulting fees.

03/11/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.50  795.00  1,192.50



Invoice No.: 20403922
Date: 04/05/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review of updated claims tracker and
comments on same. Correspondence with A.
Zeldin re status of final reconciliation,
disbursement requests.

03/11/2019 Adam Zeldin 3.80  400.00  1,520.00
Review/approve post-filing payment. Review
email from Stikemans re claims matters,
review schedule summarizing status of
claims, discuss same with P. Patel.
Correspond with A&M re Closing WC
analysis, payment of the KEIP. Respond to
creditor enquiry.

03/11/2019 Adam Zeldin 2.20  400.00  880.00
Review email from A&M re KEIP payment.
Review final KEIP agreement in connection
with same. Draft email to and attend call with
S. Subramanian re payment of KEIP and
proposed asset sales, discuss same with P.
Patel.

03/12/2019 Pritesh Patel 3.00  795.00  2,385.00
Review of claim and correspondence from
counsel to Dragonfly. Claims update call with
Stikeman, circulate updated claims tracker to
group, and correspondence with Goodmans
on same. Discussion with A. Zeldin re CF
update.

03/12/2019 Adam Zeldin 2.30  400.00  920.00
Review/approve professional fees. Prepare
summary of professional fees approved,
discuss same with P. Patel.

03/13/2019 Pritesh Patel 3.50  795.00  2,782.50
Review and comment on D&O claim letter.
Drafting of Eighth Report.

03/13/2019 Adam Zeldin 4.50  400.00  1,800.00
Review/update cash flow for Eighth Report,
correspond with A&M and P. Patel re same.
Review weekly variance analysis, discuss
same with A&M. Correspond with P. Patel re
Closing WC.

03/14/2019 Pritesh Patel 3.00  795.00  2,385.00
Call with A&M re draft WC reconciliation.
Continue drafting Eighth Report and
discussion with A. Zeldin on same.

03/14/2019 Adam Zeldin 5.00  400.00  2,000.00
Draft sections for Eighth Report, discuss
same with P. Patel. Correspond with A&M re
updated CF. Review API's updated Closing
WC analysis, discuss same with P. Patel.

03/15/2019 Pritesh Patel 4.50  795.00  3,577.50



Invoice No.: 20403922
Date: 04/05/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review of draft affidavit and discussion with
A. Zeldin re report. Call with A&M re Moelis
fees. Discussion with A.Zeldin re Final
Adjustments from Nuvo and email to A&M on
same. Continue edits to Eighth Report.

03/15/2019 Adam Zeldin 6.25  400.00  2,500.00
Draft the Eighth Report to Court, discuss
same with P. Patel. Review Adams Affidavit
re stay extension motion. Review Nuvo's
Closing Date Statement, discuss same with
P. Patel. Review prof. fee invoices. Format
cash flow and charts for Eighth Report.

03/18/2019 Pritesh Patel 5.50  795.00  4,372.50
Discussion with A. Zeldin re cash flow and
disbursements. Finalize sections for report
and send to A. Zeldin. Calls and
correspondence with Torys, A&M re cash
flow and upcoming motion. Call with
Stikeman re affidavit, cash flow and timing for
service.

03/18/2019 Adam Zeldin 2.80  400.00  1,120.00
Correspond with S. Subramanian/S. Dukesz
re intercompany balances and stay extension
motion. Review interco balance matrix.
Correspond with S. Subramanian/A&M re
professional fees paid/budgeted. Review
email from S. Subramanian re board
compensation.

03/18/2019 Adam Zeldin 3.20  400.00  1,280.00
Correspond with S. Dukez re various matters
for stay extension motion. Review/update
Eighth Report. Review/comments on updates
to CF, discuss same with A&M/S.
Subramanian.

03/19/2019 Pritesh Patel 4.00  795.00  3,180.00
Review and edits to Report. Calls with A&M
re Moelis fees, review of Nuvo closing
statement. Discussion with A. Zeldin re
intercompany balances. Correspondence
with Dragonfly re claim.

03/19/2019 Adam Zeldin 5.30  400.00  2,120.00
Review Freeland Affidavit. Review updated
Interco balance matrix, discuss same with S.
Dukesz. Review/update Eighth Report,
discuss same with P. Patel.
Prepare/assemble charts and appendices for
Eighth Report. Review/approve professional
fees.

03/20/2019 Paul Van Eyk 3.00  795.00  2,385.00
Review of draft report, discussion with P.
Patel on edits.

03/20/2019 Adam Sherman 0.20  795.00  159.00



Invoice No.: 20403922
Date: 04/05/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review/approve February 2019 bank rec.
03/20/2019 Pritesh Patel 3.50  795.00  2,782.50

Review of comments from Torys on report.
Review and edits to updated report and send
to Stikemans for comments. Call with D. Bish
re Deerfield distribution request. Preparation
of updated Reserve analysis and discussion
with A. Zeldin on same.

03/20/2019 Adam Zeldin 4.20  400.00  1,680.00
Review comments from D. Bish re Eighth
Report, discuss same with P. Patel.
Review/update Eighth Report, compile
appendices. Correspond with P.
Patel/A&M/S. Subrmanian re CF and related
matters. Update Reserve analysis, discuss
same with P. Patel.

03/21/2019 Carol O'Donnell 0.70  200.00  140.00
Post documents to website and email to
OSB. Prepare documentation re API name
change at BMO.

03/21/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.30  795.00  1,033.50
Finalize, sign and compile report for service.
Call with A&M re working capital review.

03/25/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.10  795.00  79.50
Review of emails.

03/25/2019 Pritesh Patel 0.30  795.00  238.50
Correspondence with Stikeman and Torys re
Reserve analysis.

03/26/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.10  795.00  79.50
Review of emails.

03/26/2019 Pritesh Patel 0.60  795.00  477.00
Correspondence with Stikeman re Dragonfly
claim. Correspondence with Torys on
Deerfield requests re Reserve. Email to A&M
re proposed release.

03/26/2019 Adam Zeldin 1.75  400.00  700.00
Correspond with A&M re Closing WC review
and status thereof, discuss same with P.
Patel. Review/approve post-filing payments
for D&O insurance.

03/27/2019 Pritesh Patel 2.00  795.00  1,590.00
Review of working capital analysis from A&M
and discussion with A. Zeldin on same. Call
with A&M and counsels to review and
discussion analysis of Nuvo closing
statement.

03/27/2019 Adam Zeldin 1.35  400.00  540.00



Invoice No.: 20403922
Date: 04/05/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Correspond with P. Patel re D&O insurance.
Review correspondence with A&M re
additional distribution to Deerfield.
Review/approve post-filing payment. Review
prior week variance analysis.

03/27/2019 Adam Zeldin 3.70  400.00  1,480.00
Review A&M's WC Adjustment Analysis,
discuss same with P. Patel. Attend call with
API/A&M/Torys/Stikemans re Adjustment
Analysis.

03/28/2019 Carol O'Donnell 0.50  200.00  100.00
Post documents to website and email to
OSB.

03/28/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.10  795.00  79.50
Review of emails.

03/28/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.50  795.00  1,192.50
Preparation and attendance in Court for
Intercompany Transfer Order.

03/28/2019 Adam Zeldin 1.25  400.00  500.00
Review monthly board compensation, attend
call with API payroll clerk re same, discuss
same with P. Patel. Review signed order and
endorsement re stay extension.

03/29/2019 Carol O'Donnell 0.40  200.00  80.00
Post documents to website and email to
OSB.

03/29/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.10  795.00  79.50
Review of emails.

Fees Total 142.10 $ 78,317.00



Invoice No.: 20403922
Date: 04/05/2019

Remittance Form
Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 78,317.00
Technology and Administrative Fees 4,425.10
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 10,756.47

Total Due CAD $ 93,498.57

Payment Options

Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank
Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Cheques Payable to: Richter Advisory Group Inc.
Send to: 181 Bay Street, Suite 3320, Bay Wellington Tower, Toronto ON  M5J 2T3

Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca



Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Date: 04/25/2019
Invoice No.: 20403998

Engagement No.: 2021281
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered to April 15, 2019 $ 8,374.00

Sub-Total 8,374.00
Technology and Administrative Fees 418.70
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 1,143.05

Total Due CAD $ 9,935.75



Invoice No.: 20403998
Date: 04/25/2019

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Zeldin 4.85 $ 400.00 $ 1,940.00
Pascale Lareau 0.40  185.00  74.00
Paul Van Eyk 0.80  795.00  636.00
Pritesh Patel 7.20  795.00  5,724.00

13.25 $ 8,374.00



Invoice No.: 20403998
Date: 04/25/2019

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

04/01/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.10 $ 795.00 $ 79.50
Review of emails.

04/01/2019 Pritesh Patel 2.10  795.00  1,669.50
Call with A&M re status of claims for working
capital analysis. Review of updated draft of
NWC analysis from A&M.

04/02/2019 Pritesh Patel 2.20  795.00  1,749.00
All parties call to review revised analysis and
objection. Call with A&M re Moelis fees.
Responding to correspondence from
Stikeman re Nuvo claim.

04/02/2019 Adam Zeldin 0.25  400.00  100.00
Correspond with P. Patel re cash flow
matters.

04/03/2019 Pritesh Patel 0.60  795.00  477.00
Call and correspondence with A&M re Moelis
fees and priority charges. Discussion with A.
Zeldin on same.

04/03/2019 Adam Zeldin 1.10  400.00  440.00
Correspond with A&M/P. Patel re Moelis
fees. Review variance analysis, discuss
same with A&M.

04/04/2019 Pritesh Patel 0.30  795.00  238.50
Discussion with A. Zeldin re D&O claims.

04/04/2019 Adam Zeldin 0.50  400.00  200.00
Review D&O claims filed and correspond
with P. Patel re same.

04/05/2019 Pascale Lareau 0.40  185.00  74.00
Prepare bank reconciliation, pdf, update bank
reconciliation file and follow-up for signature,
filing document.

04/05/2019 Pritesh Patel 0.20  795.00  159.00
Responding to inquiries from creditor re
claims process.

04/05/2019 Adam Zeldin 2.00  400.00  800.00
Review/approve professional fees/other post-
filing disbursements, discuss same with P.
Patel. Respond to enquiry from sharheolder.
Correspond with S. Dukesz re claims
matters.

04/08/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.20  795.00  159.00
Review of emails.

04/08/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.10  795.00  874.50
Review of revised Moelis fee schedule and
call with A&M on same. Review of
correspondence from Stikeman re net
working capital and objection notice.

04/09/2019 Pritesh Patel 0.20  795.00  159.00



Invoice No.: 20403998
Date: 04/25/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review of emails from claimant re claim
against API.

04/10/2019 Adam Zeldin 1.00  400.00  400.00
Review/approve post-filing payments.
Review current week CF variance report.

04/12/2019 Paul Van Eyk 0.50  795.00  397.50
Review of emails.

04/15/2019 Pritesh Patel 0.50  795.00  397.50
Correspondence with counsels re timing for
termination motion.

Fees Total 13.25 $ 8,374.00



Invoice No.: 20403998
Date: 04/25/2019

Remittance Form
Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 8,374.00
Technology and Administrative Fees 418.70
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 1,143.05

Total Due CAD $ 9,935.75

Payment Options

Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank
Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Cheques Payable to: Richter Advisory Group Inc.
Send to: 181 Bay Street, Suite 3320, Bay Wellington Tower, Toronto ON  M5J 2T3

Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca



Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Date: 04/30/2019
Invoice No.: 20404019

Engagement No.: 2021281
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered to April 30, 2019 $ 22,682.00

Sub-Total 22,682.00
Technology and Administrative Fees 1,134.10
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 3,096.09

Total Due CAD $ 26,912.19



Invoice No.: 20404019
Date: 04/30/2019

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Zeldin 9.80 $ 400.00 $ 3,920.00
Pritesh Patel 23.60  795.00  18,762.00

33.40 $ 22,682.00



Invoice No.: 20404019
Date: 04/30/2019

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

04/16/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.50 $ 795.00 $ 1,192.50
Updates to claims tracker and circulate same
to Goodmans. Correspondence with
Goodmans re late filed claims. Call and
correspondence with Stikeman re upcoming
court hearing and status of D&O claims.

04/16/2019 Adam Zeldin 0.25  400.00  100.00
Review/approve post-filing payments,
discuss same with S. Subramanian/C.
Freeland.

04/17/2019 Pritesh Patel 0.50  795.00  397.50
Correspondence with counsels and A&M re
objection notice. Correspondence on
upcoming court attendance.

04/17/2019 Adam Zeldin 1.40  400.00  560.00
Review/approve post-filing professional fees.
Correspond with A&M re board
compensation. Review weekly variance
analysis.

04/18/2019 Pritesh Patel 2.50  795.00  1,987.50
Drafting of Ninth Report of the Monitor.

04/22/2019 Pritesh Patel 0.30  795.00  238.50
Discussion with A. Zeldin re BOD payments.

04/22/2019 Adam Zeldin 0.50  400.00  200.00
Correspond with S. Subramanian re board
compensation, discuss same with P. Patel.
Review cash revised cash flow.

04/23/2019 Adam Zeldin 0.25  400.00  100.00
Correspond with S. Subramanian re board
compensation, discuss same with P. Patel.

04/24/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.50  795.00  1,192.50
Review of Nuvo response and materials re
closing statement dispute. Call with A&M to
discuss Nuvo analysis.

04/25/2019 Pritesh Patel 1.30  795.00  1,033.50
Review of draft materials from Stikeman re
termination order motion.

04/26/2019 Pritesh Patel 5.50  795.00  4,372.50
Continue drafting Ninth Report. Call with
Stikeman, A&M and API to discuss Nuvo
response. Discussion with A. Zeldin re fee
affidavit, CF and Moelis fees. Call with Torys
re termination order and affidavit.

04/26/2019 Adam Zeldin 3.20  400.00  1,280.00



Invoice No.: 20404019
Date: 04/30/2019

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Prepare fee affidavit and exhibits thereto for
Ninth Report. Review/approve board
compensation. Discuss Ninth Report and
CCAA termination matters with P. Patel.
Draft email to Deerfield re transaction fees,
discuss same with P. Patel.

04/26/2019 Adam Zeldin 0.20  400.00  80.00
Draft email to S. Subramanian/C. Freeland re
CCAA termination motion and next steps in
the proceedings.

04/29/2019 Pritesh Patel 5.00  795.00  3,975.00
Call with API re termination order. Drafting of
Ninth Report. Call with A&M re working
capital reconciliation.

04/29/2019 Adam Zeldin 2.00  400.00  800.00
Attend call with S. Subramanian/C.
Freeland/P. Patel re CCAA termination
motion and next steps in proceedings.
Update exhibits to fee affidavit re Ninth
Report. Review/approve profesisonal fees.
Review/anaylze operating cash needed to
termination date.

04/30/2019 Pritesh Patel 5.50  795.00  4,372.50
Drafting Ninth Report. Discussion with A.
Zeldin re fee affidavit. Call with counsels re
Moelis fees and Charge and preparation of
analysis on same. Call with D. Bish re plan
for upcoming motion.

04/30/2019 Adam Zeldin 2.00  400.00  800.00
Draft email to S. Subramanian re remaining
costs to end of CCAA. Review/update fee
affidavit. Review email from S. Subramanian
re tax matters. Correspond with A&M re
previous week disbursements.

Fees Total 33.40 $ 22,682.00



Invoice No.: 20404019
Date: 04/30/2019

Remittance Form
Aralez Pharmaceuticals Inc.
7100 West Credit Avenue, Suite 101
Mississauga, ON L5N 0E4

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 22,682.00
Technology and Administrative Fees 1,134.10
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 3,096.09

Total Due CAD $ 26,912.19

Payment Options

Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank
Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Cheques Payable to: Richter Advisory Group Inc.
Send to: 181 Bay Street, Suite 3320, Bay Wellington Tower, Toronto ON  M5J 2T3

Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca



Appendix “E” 






























































































































































































































































