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I.  INTRODUCTION  

1. On January 23, 2020 (the “Filing Date”), the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the “Court”) issued 

an order (the “Initial Order”) granting SFP Canada Ltd. (“SFP Canada” or the “Company”) protection pursuant to the 

Companies’ Creditors Arrangement Act, R.S.C. 1985, c. C-36, as amended (the “CCAA”).  Pursuant to the Initial Order, 

Richter Advisory Group Inc. (“Richter”) was appointed as the Company’s Monitor (the “Monitor”).   

2. The Initial Order, inter alia, 

(a) granted a stay of proceedings in favour of the Company until January 31, 2020 (the “Stay Period”);  

(b) approved the engagement of Mackinac Partners, LLC (“Mackinac”) to provide the services of Michael Nowlan 

and Craig M. Boucher to act as co-chief restructuring officers (the “CROs” and each a “CRO”) of SFP Canada;  

(c) ordered that, except as specifically permitted in the Initial Order and until further Order of the Court, the Company 

shall make no payments, transfers or disbursements to, or on account of, any related parties; and 

(d) granted certain charges sought by SFP Canada. 

A copy of the Initial Order is attached hereto as Appendix “A”.  The proceedings commenced by SFP Canada under 

the CCAA are herein referred to as the “CCAA Proceedings”. 

3. On the Filing Date, SFP Canada’s U.S. parent company, Schurman Fine Papers (“SFP US”), and its subsidiary SFP 

Franchise Corporation (collectively, the “US Debtors”), commenced proceedings under Chapter 11 of the United States 

Bankruptcy Code (the “US Code”) in the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware (the “US Court”) 

in order to, among other things, pursue an orderly liquidation of the US Debtors’ retail stores in the United States (the 

“Chapter 11 Proceedings”). Collectively, the US Debtors and SFP Canada are referred to herein as the “Schurman 

Group”. 

4. As noted in the Monitor’s first report dated January 24, 2020 (the “First Report”), the Chapter 11 Proceedings and the 

CCAA Proceedings were preceded by the termination of commercial licensing, supply, marketing and other critical 

operating agreements that the Schurman Group had with American Greetings Corporation (“American Greetings”).  

Without the continued use of these agreements, including the trademarks required to operate the Schurman Group’s 

retail businesses, the Schurman Group concluded that it could no longer operate as a going concern and commenced 

the Chapter 11 Proceedings and the CCAA Proceedings to, among other things, pursue an orderly wind-down / 

liquidation of their retail stores in both the United States and Canada. In addition, as SFP Canada was entirely dependent 

on SFP US for operational, management, and administrative services, SFP Canada concluded that it could not continue 

as a going concern without ongoing support from SFP US. 
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5. On January 24, 2020, the Court issued an order (the “Liquidation Sale Approval Order”) which, among other things: 

(a) approved the consulting agreement (the “Consulting Agreement”) dated January 17, 2020 between SFP 

Canada and Schurman Retail Group, LLC, and a contractual joint venture comprised of Gordon Brothers Retail 

Partners, LLC and Hilco Merchant Resources, LLC (collectively, the “Original Consultant”), pursuant to which 

the Company engaged the Original Consultant to act as liquidation consultant to assist in liquidating the 

Company’s inventory (“Merchandise”), certain owned furniture, fixtures and equipment (“FF&E”) and certain 

other goods at the Schurman Group’s retail locations (the “Liquidation Sale”) in accordance with the sale 

guidelines appended to the Liquidation Sale Approval Order; and  

(b) authorized SFP Canada, with the assistance of the Original Consultant, to conduct the Liquidation Sale. 

A copy of the Liquidation Sale Approval Order is attached hereto as Appendix “B”. 

6. Also on January 24, 2020, the Original Consultant provided notice to the Schurman Group that it had assigned its rights, 

benefits and obligations under the Consulting Agreement relating to the Liquidation Sale in Canada to its Canadian 

affiliates, namely Gordon Brothers Canada ULC and Merchant Retail Solutions, ULC (collectively, the “Canadian 

Consultant”, and with the Original Consultant, the “Consultant”) effective as of January 17, 2020. 

7. On January 31, 2020, the Court issued an order (the “Amended and Restated Initial Order”) which, among other 

things, extended the Stay Period to March 31, 2020.  A copy of the Amended and Restated Initial Order is attached 

hereto as Appendix “C”.    

8. As noted in the Monitor’s third report dated March 27, 2020 (the “Third Report”), the significant developments in the 

Chapter 11 Proceedings since the date of the Amended and Restated Initial Order, included the following: 

(a) on February 14, 2020, the US Court granted final orders in respect of the US Debtors “first day” motions, including 

an order approving a Key Employee Retention Plan (“KERP”) that, among other things, provides for retention 

payments to be paid to certain key employees (the “KERP Employees” and each, a “KERP Employee”) at 

specific dates (depending on the nature of the specific KERP Employee’s role and tasks) (the “US KERP Order”). 

A copy of the US KERP Order is attached hereto as Appendix “D”;  

(b) on February 27, 2020, the US Court approved the sale of certain US retail leases and FF&E to Paper Source, 

Inc., which sale did not include any Canadian leases or assets; and 
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(c) on March 13, 2020, the US Court approved the sublease of the US Debtors’ headquarters and distribution centre 

to Fidelitone Order Fulfullment, LLC. 

9. On March 30, 2020, the Court issued an order (the “Canadian KERP Order”) approving an allocation to SFP Canada 

of 30% of the costs of the KERP (the “KERP Allocation”) and extending the Stay Period to June 30, 2020. The Canadian 

KERP Order prohibits SFP Canada from making any payments in respect of the KERP until further order of the Court. 

A copy of the Canadian KERP Order is attached hereto as Appendix “E”. 

10. This report is the Monitor’s fourth report (the “Fourth Report”) to this Court.  The First Report was filed with the Court 

to, among other things, support the Liquidation Sale Approval Order.  The Monitor’s second report dated January 30, 

2020 (the “Second Report”) was filed with the Court to, among other things, provide an update on the activities of SFP 

Canada and the Monitor since the issuance of the Initial Order and support the Company’s request for certain 

amendments to the Initial Order, including the extension of the Stay Period to March 31, 2020.  The Third Report was 

filed with the Court to, among other things, provide an update on the activities of SFP Canada and the Monitor since the 

Second Report, the Liquidation Sale and the Chapter 11 Proceedings, as well as to support the Company’s request for 

the KERP Allocation and to extend the Stay Period to June 30, 2020. Copies of the First Report, the Second Report and 

the Third Report, excluding appendices, are attached hereto as Appendix “F”, Appendix “G” and Appendix “H”, 

respectively. Copies of the First Report, the Second Report and the Third Report, including appendices, as well as Court 

and other materials pertaining to the CCAA Proceedings, are available on the Monitor’s website at 

http://www.richter.ca/insolvencycase/sfp-canada-ltd/  (the “Monitor’s Website”).      

II. PURPOSE OF REPORT 

11. The purpose of this Fourth Report is to provide information to the Court in respect of the following: 

(a) the activities of SFP Canada and the Monitor since the date of the Third Report; 

(b) an update on certain matters in connection with the CCAA Proceedings, including the Liquidation Sale, the 

American Greetings Security (as hereinafter defined) and the Chapter 11 Proceedings; 

(c) SFP Canada’s reported receipts and disbursements for the period from March 21, 2020 to June 19, 2020, 

including a comparison of reported to forecast results; 

(d) the accounts of the Monitor and its legal counsel, Stikeman Elliott LLP (“Stikeman”) from commencement of the 

proceedings up to and including June 22, 2020, and the estimated remaining fees and disbursements to the 

effective date of the termination of the CCAA Proceedings; and 

(e) SFP Canada’s motion for an order (the “Distribution and Termination Order”): 

http://www.richter.ca/insolvencycase/sfp-canada-ltd/
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i. authorizing and directing SFP Canada to make a payment to SFP US in the amount of US$85,200 (the 

“KERP Payment”) in accordance with the KERP Allocation and the Canadian KERP Order; 

ii. authorizing and directing SFP Canada to make a distribution to American Greetings in the amount of the 

American Greetings Distribution (as hereinafter defined) in respect of its secured claim against SFP 

Canada’s present and after-acquired property; 

iii. authorizing and directing SFP Canada to hold back from its cash on hand and pay to Richter, in its capacity 

as the proposed trustee in bankruptcy of SFP Canada, the Bankruptcy Reserve (as hereinafter defined); 

iv. extending the Stay Period (as defined in the Amended and Restated Initial Order) until the earlier of (a) 

August 14, 2020 and (b) the date upon which the Monitor serves a certificate on the Service List maintained 

by the Monitor in the CCAA Proceedings (the “Service List”) certifying that the Remaining Matters (as 

hereinafter defined) have been completed (the “Monitor’s Certificate”); 

v. approving the First Report, the Second Report, the Third Report and the Fourth Report, and the activities, 

actions and conduct of the Monitor set out therein; 

vi. approving the accounts of the Monitor and Stikeman, including the Remaining Fees and Disbursements (as 

hereinafter defined); 

vii. terminating the CCAA Proceedings upon service of the Monitor’s Certificate on the Service List; 

viii. authorizing SFP Canada to assign itself into bankruptcy; 

ix. terminating, releasing and discharging the Administration Charge and the Directors’ Charge (each as 

defined in the Amended and Restated Initial Order), effective upon service of the Monitor’s Certificate on 

the Service List;  

x. discharging Richter as Monitor, and releasing Richter from any and all liability that it now has, or may 

hereafter have, by reason of, or in any way arising out of, its acts or omissions as Monitor, save and except 

for any gross negligence or willful misconduct on the part of the Monitor, effective upon service of the 

Monitor’s Certificate on the Service List; 

xi. discharging Michael Nowlan and Craig M. Boucher as CROs, effective upon service of the Monitor’s 

Certificate on the Service List; and 
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xii. granting a release in favour of the Monitor, the CROs, and each of their counsel, legal counsel to SFP 

Canada, and each of their respective affiliates, officers, directors, partners, employees and agents, as 

applicable, effective upon service of the Monitor’s Certificate on the Service List. 

III. TERMS OF REFERENCE 

12. In preparing this Fourth Report, the Monitor has relied solely on information and documents provided by SFP Canada 

and its advisors, including unaudited financial information, and discussions with representatives of Mackinac, the CROs, 

and the Company’s legal counsel (collectively, the “Information”).  In accordance with industry practice, except as 

otherwise described in the Fourth Report, Richter has reviewed the Information for reasonableness, internal consistency, 

and use in the context in which it was provided.  However, Richter has not audited or otherwise attempted to verify the 

accuracy or completeness of the Information in a manner that would comply with Generally Accepted Auditing Standards 

(“GAAS”) pursuant to the Chartered Professional Accountant of Canada Handbook and, as such, Richter expresses no 

opinion or other form of assurance contemplated under GAAS in respect of the Information. 

13. The Monitor has prepared this Fourth Report in its capacity as a Court-appointed officer to support the approval of the 

Monitor’s activities and the other relief being sought.  Parties using this Fourth Report, other than for the purposes 

outlined herein, are cautioned that it may not be appropriate for their purposes, and consequently should not be used for 

any other purpose. 

14. Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein are as defined in the Company’s motion materials, including the affidavit 

of Craig M. Boucher, sworn June 23, 2020 (the “June 23 Boucher Affidavit”). This Fourth Report should be read in 

conjunction with the June 23 Boucher Affidavit, as certain information contained in the June 23 Boucher Affidavit has not 

been included herein in order to avoid unnecessary duplication.     

15. Unless otherwise noted, all monetary amounts contained in this Fourth Report are expressed in Canadian dollars. 

IV. THE ACTIVITIES OF SFP CANADA  

16. The activities of SFP Canada since the commencement of the CCAA Proceedings to March 27, 2020 are detailed in the 

Monitor’s Third Report.  Since the filing of the Monitor’s Third Report, the activities of SFP Canada have included: 

(a) responding to calls and enquiries from creditors and other stakeholders in connection with the CCAA Proceedings; 

(b) making any remaining payments owing to suppliers for goods and services received following the issuance of the 

Initial Order; 

(c) reporting receipts and disbursements; 
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(d) working with the Consultant, the Monitor and counsel for certain landlords regarding the Liquidation Sale, including 

with respect to determining the final reconciliation of the fees and reimbursable costs of the Consultant (the “Final 

Reconciliation”); and 

(e) consulting with the Monitor and its counsel on various matters in connection with the CCAA Proceedings. 

V. THE ACTIVITIES OF THE MONITOR  

17. Since the filing of the Third Report, the Monitor’s activities have included: 

(a) monitoring SFP Canada’s cash flows, including reporting variances to SFP Canada’s cash flow forecast;  

(b) corresponding with SFP Canada, Mackinac and the Company’s legal counsel on cash management and various 

other matters in connection with the CCAA Proceedings; 

(c) consulting with SFP Canada and the CROs regarding the Final Reconciliation and matters in connection with the 

Quebec Stores (as hereinafter defined and discussed);  

(d) corresponding with Stikeman in connection with various matters pertaining to the CCAA Proceedings;   

(e) responding to calls and enquiries from creditors and other stakeholders in connection with the CCAA Proceedings;  

(f) responding to enquiries from counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the “UCC”) appointed in 

the Chapter 11 Proceedings;  

(g) maintaining the Monitor’s Website, where copies of the orders granted and other relevant documents in respect 

of the CCAA Proceedings are available; 

(h) attending at Court in connection with the Canadian KERP Order; 

(i) keeping apprised of developments and other matters concerning the Chapter 11 Proceedings; 

(j) preparing this Fourth Report; and 

(k) dealing with other matters pertaining to the administration of the CCAA Proceedings. 
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VI. UPDATE ON CERTAIN MATTERS IN CONNECTION WITH THE CCAA PROCEEDINGS  

The Liquidation Sale 

18. As noted in the Third Report, the Liquidation Sale commenced on January 16, 2020 and concluded on February 29, 

2020, in accordance with the Liquidation Sale Approval Order and the Consulting Agreement. Each of SFP Canada’s 76 

retail store leases were terminated (and the premises vacated) on or before February 29, 2020, either by way of 

disclaimer or expiration of the lease.  

19. The net realizations from the Company’s Merchandise and FF&E during the Liquidation Sale totalled approximately $8.1 

million and $144,000, respectively (each excluding sales taxes).  

20. The terms of the Consulting Agreement provided that SFP Canada was responsible for all costs and expenses in 

connection with the Liquidation Sale, including certain Consultant-controlled costs for, primarily, advertising and 

supervision, which were subject to an agreed-upon budget. 

21. Since the commencement of the Liquidation Sale, the Consultant was paid its fees and reimbursable costs on a near-

weekly basis in accordance with the Consulting Agreement (other than amounts paid as part of the Final Reconciliation). 

As of the date of this Fourth Report, the Final Reconciliation has been completed and agreed to between SFP Canada 

and the Consultant and the final payment to the Consultant was made on or about April 5, 2020. In connection with the 

final payment, the unapplied portion of the total SFP Canada deposit (US$225,000) held by the Consultant was 

reimbursed to SFP US, on behalf of SFP Canada. The Monitor was provided with a copy of the Final Reconciliation and 

considers the Final Reconciliation to be reasonable in the circumstances. 

22. It is the Monitor’s understanding that, as SFP Canada was largely a vehicle through which the Schurman Group sold its 

products in Canada, SFP Canada’s assets, other than cash, were primarily limited to Merchandise and FF&E. As a 

result, following the conclusion of the Liquidation Sale, substantially all SFP Canada’s assets have been sold.   

Quebec Store Proceeds Not Subject to the American Greetings Security 

23. As noted in the Monitor’s First Report, on June 25, 2019, SFP Canada (along with certain related US entities, collectively, 

the “AG Borrowers”) and American Greetings entered into a security agreement, pursuant to which American Greetings 

was granted a continuing lien and security interest over the AG Borrowers’ present and after-acquired property (the 

“American Greetings Security”) to secure, among other things, the payment and performance of the Schurman Group’s 

obligations pursuant to various agreements between the Schurman Group and American Greetings (including with 

respect to purchase orders) (collectively, the “American Greetings Agreements”). 
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24. Also as noted in the First Report, the Monitor instructed Stikeman to review the American Greetings Security in the 

jurisdictions in which SFP Canada had retail operations in Canada. As noted in the Third Report, Stikeman provided the 

Monitor with legal opinions that concluded (subject to standard qualifications and limitations) that the American Greetings 

Security is valid in all provinces in which SFP Canada had retail operations except Quebec, and that the American 

Greetings Security is enforceable under Ohio law. 

25. Due to the American Greetings Security not being valid in Quebec, the proceeds realized from the Liquidation Sale at 

SFP Canada’s six (6) retail stores located in Quebec (the “Quebec Stores”) are not subject to the American Greetings 

Security. The proceeds are, therefore, available for distribution to SFP Canada’s unsecured creditors.  

26. The table below sets forth the calculation of net proceeds from the Liquidation Sale at the Quebec Stores (the “Quebec 

Net Proceeds”): 

   

27. As presented in the table above, the Quebec Net Proceeds total approximately $131,000. 

28. The calculation of the Quebec Net Proceeds takes into account: (a) costs directly attributable to the Quebec Stores, 

including payroll for the Quebec Stores’ employees, rent, store supplies, the Consultant’s supervision fees, the 

Consultant’s fees on the sale of Merchandise (1.75%) and FF&E (15%) at the Quebec Stores and inventory purchases; 

and (b) an allocation of certain administrative costs not directly attributable to any of SFP Canada’s retail stores 

Quebec Stores

Statement of Quebec Net Proceeds

(C$, in 000s; unaudited)

Gross proceeds

Merchandise sales 428

FF&E sales 6

Total gross proceeds 434

Expenses

Direct expenses

Payroll, rent, supplies 119

Consultant fees 50

Inventory purchases 35

Subtotal 204

Allocated Expenses

Professional fees 65

Shared services 21

Consultant costs 7

KERP Payment 6

Subtotal 99

Total expenses 303

Quebec Net Proceeds 131
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(collectively, the “Allocated Expenses”), including (i) pre- and post-filing professional fees of the Company’s Canadian 

counsel, the CROs, the Monitor and Stikeman in respect of work relating to the CCAA Proceedings, (ii) post-filing costs 

related to internal corporate services performed by SFP US personnel for the benefit of SFP Canada (including finance, 

executive, human resources, information technology, etc. that were historically charged to SFP Canada), (iii) certain 

Consultant expenses (merchandising, legal, etc.), and (iv) the KERP Payment.  

29. The Allocated Expenses represent bona fide costs incurred for the benefit of all SFP Canada’s retail stores calculated 

based on the Quebec Stores’ proportionate share of realizations from the Liquidation Sale. Accordingly, the Monitor is 

of the view that an allocation of such costs to the Quebec Stores is appropriate and reasonable.  

30. The Monitor notes that, as discussed in the Third Report, the internal corporate services costs referred to above were 

among those costs that SFP Canada paid through the funds transfer of approximately US$3 million by SFP Canada to 

SFP US on January 17, 2020. As discussed in the Third Report, in the Monitor’s view, the allocation of the foregoing 

costs to SFP Canada were not unreasonable.  

31. The Quebec Net Proceeds represent unencumbered funds not subject to the American Greetings Security.  An 

assessment of claims and distribution of the Quebec Net Proceeds to SFP Canada’s creditors is proposed to be 

addressed through subsequent bankruptcy proceedings, as discussed later in this Fourth Report.   

The Chapter 11 Proceedings  

32. As noted above, on January 23, 2020, the US Debtors commenced the Chapter 11 Proceedings to pursue an orderly 

wind-down / liquidation of their retail stores in the United States.  

33. As noted in the June 23 Boucher Affidavit, the significant developments in the Chapter 11 Proceedings since the filing 

of the Third Report, include the following:  

(a) on March 26, 2020, the US Court entered an order establishing bar dates and procedures for filing proofs of claim 

(this order does not apply to the claims of creditors against SFP Canada);  

(b) on April 14, 2020, the US Court entered an order approving the sale of certain furniture, fixtures and equipment 

located at the US Debtors’ headquarters; 

(c) on April 27, 2020, the US Court entered an order approving the sale of certain litigation claims of the US Debtors 

in a pending antitrust class action against Mastercard and Visa; 

(d) on May 13, 2020 and June 3, 2020, the US Court entered two separate orders approving the sale of certain 

intellectual property;  
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(e) on May 26, 2020, the US Court entered an order approving procedures for the sale and abandonment of certain 

miscellaneous assets of the US Debtors; and 

(f) the US Court has entered multiple orders to extend the period during which the UCC can assert a challenge with 

respect to the American Greetings’ security in the Chapter 11 Proceedings. This challenge period was most 

recently extended until 30 days after the earlier of (i) the entry of a final order denying a motion to approve the US 

Settlement Agreement (as hereinafter defined), (ii) the date of a final order converting the Chapter 11 Proceedings 

to cases under Chapter 7 of the US Code and (iii) the date on which the US Settlement Agreement becomes null 

and void as a result of the non-occurrence of any of the conditions provided in the US Settlement Agreement. 

34. The Monitor understands that the US Debtors expect to obtain confirmation of a plan in the Chapter 11 Proceedings 

during the extension of the Stay Period. In that regard, on June 3, 2020, the US Debtors filed a joint plan of liquidation 

(the “Joint Plan”) and a corresponding disclosure statement (the “Disclosure Statement”). On June 23, 2020, the US 

Debtors filed an amended Joint Plan (the “Amended Joint Plan”) and corresponding amended Disclosure Statement 

(the “Amended Disclosure Statement”) to incorporate the terms of the US Settlement Agreement. On June 24, 2020, 

the US Court entered an order granting, among other things, interim approval of the Amended Disclosure Statement, 

scheduling a hearing for final approval of the Amended Disclosure Statement and confirmation of the Amended Joint 

Plan, and approving the solicitation, notice and tabulation procedures related to solicitation of the Amended Joint Plan 

and the forms related thereto.  

35. On June 19, 2020, the US Debtors entered into a settlement agreement with American Greetings and the UCC (the “US 

Settlement Agreement”) to facilitate the confirmation and implementation of the Amended Joint Plan. According to the 

June 23 Boucher Affidavit, the parties to the US. Settlement Agreement have agreed, among other things, (i) to support 

confirmation of the Amended Joint Plan, (ii) that American Greetings, Clayton, Dubilier & Rice (“CD&R”), the controlling 

shareholder of American Greetings, and each of American Greetings’ and CD&R’s respective affiliates officers, directors, 

employees, shareholders, members, managers, partners, agents and each of their heirs, executors, successors and 

assigns (collectively, the “Released Parties”) will receive a release of all claims that the US Debtors or the UCC had, 

have, or may have against the Released Parties as of the date of the US Settlement Agreement, (iii) that American 

Greetings will waive recovery on its secured claims as well as any unsecured deficiency claims or other unsecured 

claims against the US Debtors, and (iv) that, to the extent that American Greetings receives a distribution from SFP 

Canada that exceeds $3.4 million, American Greetings will irrevocably assign to the US Debtors’ estate the lesser of (i) 

14.5833% of the portion of the distribution it receives from SFP Canada above US$3.4 million and (ii) US$175,000.  

36. The US Debtors are requesting that the combined hearing for final approval of the Amended Disclosure Statement and 

confirmation of the Amended Joint Plan be scheduled for August 10, 2020. 
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37. The Monitor understands that no relief is being sought in the Chapter 11 Proceedings with respect to SFP Canada.  

VII. CASH RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS FROM MARCH 21, 2020 TO JUNE 19, 2020  

38. As noted in the Third Report, SFP Canada, with the assistance of the Monitor, prepared a statement of its projected 

cash flows for the period March 21, 2020 to July 3, 2020 (the “March 21 Cash Flow Forecast”) which was filed with the 

Court in support of the Company’s motion returnable March 30, 2020 seeking, inter alia, an extension of the Stay Period 

to June 30, 2020.  

39. The Company has provided the Monitor with its cooperation and access to its books and records. The Monitor has 

implemented procedures for monitoring the Company’s receipts and disbursements on a weekly basis. The Monitor has 

also worked with the CROs to prepare a report comparing SFP Canada’s actual results to its prior projections, as detailed 

in the March 21 Cash Flow Forecast. 

40. A comparison of SFP Canada’s actual cash receipts and disbursements, as compared to the March 21 Cash Flow 

Forecast, for the period ending June 19, 2020 is summarized as follows: 

   

SFP Canada Ltd.

Cash Flow Variances

For the period March 21, 2020 to June 19, 2020

(in $CAD 000's)

Budget Actual Variance

Receipts

Canada Retail Receipts 0 0 0

Other Receipts 0 26 26

Total Receipts 0 26 26

Total Disbursements

Freight (71) 0 71

Rent & Utilities 0 (22) (22)

Store Expenses and Other (194) 0 194

Sales Tax Remittances (899) (385) 515

Professional Fees (1,675) (596) 1,079

Miscellaneous / Other (200) (28) 172

Total Disbursements (3,039) (1,031) 2,008

Net Cash Flow (3,039) (1,005) 2,034

Beginning Cash Balance 8,120 8,090 (30)

Net Cash Flow (3,039) (1,005) 2,034

Ending Cash Balance 5,081 7,085 2,004
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41. As reflected in the table above, SFP Canada reported a net cash outflow of approximately $1.0 million for the 13-week 

period ending June 19, 2020 and had a cash balance of approximately $7.1 million, as at June 19, 2020.  The actual 

cash balance is approximately $2.0 million higher than forecast. The favourable cash flow variance principally relates to:  

(a) timing differences attributed to the KERP Payment (included in Store Expenses and Other), which was forecasted 

to be paid in April 2020; and 

(b) permanent differences due to lower than projected freight, store operating expenses, wind-down costs, sales 

taxes and professional fees.  

VIII. THE KERP PAYMENT 

42. As detailed in the Third Report, the KERP was developed to ensure retention of the KERP Employees to assist with the 

orderly wind-down of the Schurman Group’s operations in both the United States and Canada. The KERP provided for 

twenty-eight (28) highly qualified and skilled personnel essential to the Schurman Group’s operations and wind-down / 

liquidation activities to receive retention payments totaling approximately US$284,000, with the amount of payments to 

individual KERP Employees ranging from US$1,920.00 to US$24,230.77. In order to receive payments pursuant to the 

KERP, the KERP Employees must have, among other things, remained employed by the US Debtors on the date their 

KERP entitlement becomes payable.  

43. On March 30, 2020, the Court issued the Canadian KERP Order, which approved the KERP Allocation but prohibited 

SFP Canada from paying any amounts in respect of the KERP until further order of the Court. Accordingly, in order to 

pay SFP Canada’s proportionate share of the KERP costs, SFP Canada is seeking the Court’s approval to pay the KERP 

Payment, which, for clarity, is to be paid to SFP US as a reimbursement for KERP payments made by SFP US in 

accordance with the US KERP Order. The Monitor supports SFP Canada’s request to pay the KERP Payment on the 

basis that the KERP Allocation is reasonable and appropriate, as SFP Canada benefitted, both during and after the 

Liquidation Sale, from the back-office functions performed / managed by Schurman Group employees based out of the 

United States.  In addition, since the issuance of the Canadian KERP Order, the Monitor is not aware of any opposition 

to either the KERP Allocation or the KERP Payment.  

IX. PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION TO AMERICAN GREETINGS  

44. As noted in the First Report, as at the Filing Date, American Greetings was owed approximately US$9.1 million from 

SFP Canada in respect of obligations owing under the American Greetings Agreements (the “American Greetings 

Obligations”). The Monitor understands that the quantum of the American Greetings Obligations as of the date of this 

Fourth Report remains substantially the same.  
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45. The Monitor understands that the American Greetings Obligations result from more than 28,000 invoices / transactions 

received / occurring over a period of approximately three (3) years. In order to validate the American Greetings 

Obligations, counsel to American Greetings provided the Monitor with a detailed list of the outstanding invoices and 

associated amounts in support thereof. Given the volume of invoices / transactions and the time required to compile and 

transmit them, copies of the invoices were not provided to the Monitor. However, in an effort to verify the documentation 

provided by American Greetings in support of the American Greetings Obligations in the absence of reviewing individual 

invoices, the Monitor performed analytical procedures, including comparing the invoice / transaction details to the books 

and records of SFP Canada. Based on its procedures, the Monitor confirmed that the documentation provided by 

American Greetings in support of the American Greetings Obligations was materially consistent with the Company’s 

records.  

46. As previously discussed, Stikeman provided the Monitor with legal opinions which conclude, subject to standard 

qualifications and limitations, that the American Greetings Security is valid in all provinces in which SFP Canada had 

retail operations, except Quebec, and is enforceable under Ohio law. 

47. SFP Canada is seeking an order of the Court authorizing and directing the Company to distribute to American Greetings 

(the “American Greetings Distribution”) all of SFP Canada’s cash less (a) the KERP Payment (b) the costs of winding 

up the CCAA Proceedings, including (i) filing any outstanding tax returns, including sales tax returns, (ii) the payment of 

any and all obligations properly incurred by SFP Canada since the Filing Date, and (iii) all amounts subject to the 

Administration Charge, (c) the Quebec Net Proceeds (which will be distributed through a subsequent bankruptcy), and 

(d) the Bankruptcy Reserve. The Monitor notes that based on the amount of the American Greetings Obligations and 

the amount of available cash currently held by SFP Canada, American Greetings will suffer a shortfall on its recovery. 

48. The Monitor is not aware of any formal objections in Canada regarding the validity, enforceability or priority of the 

American Greetings Security. The only objection that the Monitor is aware of with respect to the validity, enforceability 

or priority of the American Greetings Security in the United States has been settled pursuant to the US Settlement 

Agreement, which, among other things, provides for a mechanism to distribute proceeds realized by SFP Canada that 

would otherwise be payable to American Greetings, to certain creditors of the US Debtors. Subject to approval of this 

Court, the Company will distribute the American Greetings Distribution to American Greetings on account of its secured 

claim against SFP Canada’s present and after-acquired property and understands that American Greetings has agreed 

to subsequently distribute a portion of that distribution to the US Debtors’ estate in accordance with the US Settlement 

Agreement. In consideration of the foregoing, the Monitor supports the Company’s request to make the American 

Greetings Distribution.    
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X. DISCHARGE OF THE MONITOR AND TERMINATION OF THE CCAA PROCEEDINGS 

49. SFP Canada has no ongoing business operations and substantially all its assets were sold during the Liquidation Sale. 

Subject to completing certain administrative matters (the “Remaining Matters”), there is no longer any need for the 

CCAA Proceedings. A bankruptcy proceeding will allow for the efficient distribution of the Quebec Net Proceeds and an 

orderly wind-up of SFP Canada. 

50. SFP Canada is seeking approval of the Distribution and Termination Order, which provides for the termination of the 

CCAA Proceedings on serving the Monitor’s Certificate on the Service List and authorizes SFP Canada to file an 

assignment in bankruptcy immediately thereafter. Should the Court grant the requested relief, Richter has agreed to act 

as trustee in bankruptcy (the “Trustee”). The administration costs associated with the bankruptcy proceedings of SFP 

Canada will be funded by a payment to the Trustee of approximately $100,000 (plus HST) from SFP Canada’s cash on 

hand (the “Bankruptcy Reserve”). 

51. Upon serving the Monitor’s Certificate on the Service List, the Distribution and Termination Order also provides for, inter 

alia, the: 

(a) discharge of Richter as Monitor, and the release of Richter and its counsel, from any and all liability that it now 

has, or may hereafter have, by reason of, or in any way arising out of, its acts or omissions as Monitor, save and 

except for any gross negligence or willful misconduct on the part of the Monitor; 

(b) release of the directors and officers of SFP Canada, including the CROs, legal counsel to SFP Canada, and each 

of their respective affiliates, officers, directors, partners, employees and agents, as applicable, from any 

obligations and liabilities that they may have incurred since the commencement of the CCAA Proceedings, except 

to the extent that the obligation or liability was incurred as a result of gross negligence or willful misconduct; and 

(c) termination, release and discharge of the Administration Charge and the Directors’ Charge.  

XI. REQUEST FOR APPROVAL OF FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS 

52. The Monitor and Stikeman have maintained detailed records of their professional fees and disbursements prior to and 

since the Monitor’s appointment. In accordance with the Amended and Restated Initial Order, the Monitor is seeking the 

approval of its fees and disbursements for the period from January 6, 2020 to June 22, 2020 (the “Richter Fee Period”) 

and those of Stikeman from January 15, 2020, to June 22, 2020 (the “Stikeman Fee Period”) in connection with the 

performance of their duties in these CCAA Proceedings.  

53. The total fees and disbursements of the Monitor during the Richter Fee Period amount to $350,230.50, together with 

disbursements in the amount of $23,325.59, both excluding sales taxes (collectively, the “Richter Accounts”). These 



  

15 

 

amounts represent professional fees and disbursements not yet approved by the Court.  Attached hereto as Appendix 

“I” is the affidavit of Adam Sherman in respect of the Richter Accounts. 

54. The total fees and disbursements of Stikeman during the Stikeman Fee Period amount to $150,608.30, together with 

disbursements in the amount of $679.22, both excluding sales taxes (collectively, the “Stikeman Accounts”).  These 

amounts represent professional fees and disbursements not yet approved by the Court.  Attached hereto as Appendix 

“J” is the affidavit of Ashley Taylor in respect of the Stikeman Accounts.   

55. The Monitor has reviewed the Stikeman Accounts and confirms that the services reflected therein have been duly 

authorized and duly rendered and that, in the Monitor’s opinion, the charges are reasonable. 

56. On the assumption that there are no delays, disputes or unforeseen developments in connection with these proceedings, 

including the within motion and the performance of the Remaining Matters, the Monitor has estimated fees and 

disbursements in the amount of $75,000, excluding applicable taxes (the “Remaining Fees and Disbursements”), for 

services that have been provided or will be provided for the period from June 23, 2020 to the date of the Monitor’s 

Certificate, as follows: 

(a) Richter - $50,000; and 

(b) Stikeman - $25,000. 

57. The above estimates take into consideration the reasonable professional and legal fees required to prepare the Fourth 

Report, participate in the within motion, and complete the Remaining Matters up to the effective date of discharge.  If the 

actual Remaining Fees and Disbursements are less than the above estimates, no further Court approval of fees is 

required.  If the actual Remaining Fees and Disbursements exceed the estimates, the Monitor will seek the consent of 

SFP Canada to pay same, without further Order of the Court. 

58. The fees and disbursements of the Monitor and its counsel, including the Remaining Fees and Disbursements, have 

been reviewed by SFP Canada and the CROs.  The Monitor has been advised that SFP Canada and the CROs do not 

oppose these fees and disbursements.   

XII. MONITOR’S CONCLUSIONS AND RECOMMENDATIONS 

59. For the reasons set out in this Fourth Report, the Monitor is of the view that the relief requested by SFP Canada is both 

appropriate and reasonable and the Monitor therefore recommends that this Court approve the relief set out in paragraph 

11(e) herein.   
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All of which is respectfully submitted on this 25th day of June, 2020. 

 
Richter Advisory Group Inc. 
in its capacity as Monitor of  
SFP Canada Ltd. 
and not in its personal capacity 
 
 

     
___________________________________   ______________________________ 
Adam Sherman, MBA, CIRP, LIT    Pritesh Patel, MBA, CFA, CIRP, LIT 
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ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE

COMMERCIAL LIST

THE HONOURABLE MR. THURSDAY, THE 23RD

JUSTICE HAINEY DAY OF JANUARY, 2O2O

IN THE MATTER OF THE COMPANIES' CREDITORS
ARRANGEMENT ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. C-36, AS AMENDED

AND IN THE MATTER OF A PLAN OF COMPROMISE OR
ARRANGEMENT OF SFP CANADA LTD. (the "Applicant")

INITIAL ORDER

THIS APPLICATION, made by the Applicant, pursuant to the Companies' Creditors

Arrangement Act, R.S.C. 1985, c. C-36, as amended (the "CCAA") was heard this day at330

University Avenue, Toronto, Ontario.

ON READING the affidavit of Craig M. Boucher sworn January 23, 2020 and the

Exhibits thereto (the "Boucher Affidavit"), and on being advised that the secured creditors who

are likely to be affected by the charges created herein were given notice, and on hearing the

submissions of counsel for the Applicant and Richter Advisory Group Inc. ("Richter"), in its

capacify as proposed monitor of the Applicant, and on reading the consent of Richter to act as the

monitor (the "Monitor"),

)

)

)
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SERVICE 

1. THIS COURT ORDERS that the time for service of the Notice of Application and the 

Application Record is hereby abridged and validated so that this Application is properly 

returnable today and hereby dispenses with further service thereof. 

APPLICATION 

2. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that the Applicant is a company to which 

the CCAA applies. 

POSSESSION OF PROPERTY AND OPERATIONS 

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Applicant shall remain in possession and control of its 

current and future assets, undertakings and properties of every nature and kind whatsoever, and 

. wherever situate including all proceeds thereof (the "Property"). Subject to further Order of this 

Court, the Applicant shall continue to carry on business in a manner consistent with the 

preservation of the value of its business (the "Business") and Property. The Applicant is 

authorized and empowered to continue to retain and employ the employees, advisors, 

consultants, agents, experts, appraisers, valuators, brokers, accountants, counsel and such other 

persons ( collectively "Assistants") currently retained or employed by it, with liberty to retain 

such further Assistants as it deems reasonably necessary or desirable in the ordinary course of 

business or for the carrying out of the terms of this Order. 

4. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Applicant shall be entitled to continue to use the 

central cash management system currently in place as described in the Boucher Affidavit or, with 

the prior consent of the Monitor, replace it with another substantially similar central cash 

management system (the "Cash Management System") and that any present or future bank 

providing the Cash Management System shall not be under any obligation whatsoever to inquire 

into the propriety, validity or legality of any transfer, payment, collection or other action taken 

under the Cash Management System, or as to the use or application by the Applicant of funds 

transferred, paid, collected or otherwise dealt with in the Cash Management System, shall be 

entitled to provide the Cash Management System without any liability in respect thereof to any 

Person ( as hereinafter defined) otp.er than the Applicant, pursuant to the terms of the 

documentation applicable to the Cash Management System, and shall be, in its capacity as 
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provider of the Cash Management System, an unaffected creditor under any plan of compromise

or arangement filed under the CCAA with regard to any claims or expenses it may suffer or

incur in connection with the provision of the Cash Management System.

5. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Applicant shall be entitled but not required to pay the

following expenses whether incurred prior to, on or after the date of this Order:

(a) all outstanding and future wages, salaries, employee and pension benefits, vacation

pay and expenses payable on or after the date of this Order, in each case incurred in

the ordinary course of business and consistent with existing compensation policies

an<i an'angements;

(b) the fees and disbursements of any Assistants retained or employed by the Applicant

in respect ofthese proceedings, at their standard rates and charges; and

(c) with the consent of the Monitor, amounts owing for goods or services actually

supplied to the Applicant prior to the date of this Order by third party suppliers or

service providers up to a maximum aggregate amount of $100,000, if in the opinion

of the Applicant the supplier or service provider is critical to the Orderly Wind-down

(as hereinafter defined).

6. THIS COURT ORDERS that, except as otherwise provided to the contrary herein, the

Applicant shall be entitled but not required to pay all reasonable expenses incurred by the

Applicant in carrying on the Business in the ordinary course during the Orderly Wind-down after

this Order, and in carrying out the provisions of this Order, which expenses shall include,

without limitation:

(a) all expenses and capital expenditures reasonably necessary for the preservation ofthe

Property or the Business including, without limitation, payments on account of

insurance (including directors and officers insurance), maintenance and security

services; and

payment for goods or services actually supplied to the Applicant following the date of

this Order.

(b)
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7. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Applicant shall remit, in accordance with legal

requirements, or pay:

(a) any statutory deemed trust amounts in favour of the Crown in right of Canada or of

any Province thereof or any other taxation authority which are required to be

deducted from employees' wages, including, without limitation, amounts in respect of

(i) employment insurance, (ii) Canada Pension Plan, (iii) Quebec Pension Plan, and

(iv) income taxes;

(b) all goods and services or other applicable sales taxes (collectively, "Sales Taxes")

required to be remitted by the Applicant in connection with the sale of goods and

services by the Applicant, but only where such Sales Taxes are accrued or collected

after the date of this Order, or where such Sales Taxes were accrued or collected prior

to the date of this Order but not required to be remitted until on or after the date of

this Order, and

(c) any amount payable to the Crown in right of Canada or of any Province thereof or

any political subdivision thereof or any other taxation authority in respect of

municipal realty, municipal business or other taxes, assessments or levies of any

nature or kind which are entitled at law to be paid in priority to claims of secured

creditors and which are attributable to or in respect of the carrying on of the Business

by the Applicant.

8. THIS COURT ORDERS that, except as specifically permitted herein, the Applicant is

hereby directed, until further Order of this Court: (a) to make no payments of principal, interest

thereon or otherwise on account of amounts owing by the Applicant to any of its creditors as of

this date; (b) to make no payments, transfers or disbursements to, or on account of any related

party to the Applicant, including Schurman Fine Papers and SFP Franchise Corporation; (c) to

grant no security interests, trusts, liens, charges or encumbrances upon or in respect of any of its

Property; and (d) to not grant credit or incur liabilities except in the ordinary course of the

Business.
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ORDERLY WIND.DOWN

9. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Applicant shall, subject to such requirements as are

imposed by the CCAA, have the right to terminate the employment of such of its employees or

temporarily lay off such of its employees as the Applicant deems appropriate and proceed with

an orderly wind-down of the Business (the "Orderly Wind-down").

REAL PROPERTY LEASES

10. THIS COURT ORDERS that, until areal property lease is disclaimed or resiliated in

accordance with the CCAA, the Applicant shall pay all amounts constituting rent or payable as

rent under real property leases (including, for greater certainty, common area maintenance

charges, utilities and realty taxes and any other amounts payable to the landlord under the lease,

but for greater certainty, excluding accelerated rent or penalties, fees or other charges arising as a

result of the insolvency of the Applicant or the making of this Order) or as otherwise may be

negotiated between the Applicant and the landlord from time to time ("Rent"), for the period

commencing from and including the date of this Order, twice-monthly in equal payments on the

first and fifteenth day of each month, in advance (but not in arrears). On the date of the first of

such payments, any Rent relating to the period commencing from and including the date of this

Order shall also be paid.

11. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Applicant shall provide each of the relevant landlords

with notice of the Applicant's intention to remove any fixtures from any leased premises at least

seven (7) days prior to the date of the intended removal. The relevant landlord shall be entitled to

have a representative present in the leased premises to observe such removal and, if the landlord

disputes the Applicant's entitlement to remove any such fixture under the provisions of the lease,

such fixture shall remain on the premises and shall be dealt with as agreed between any

applicable secured creditors, such landlord and the Applicant, or by further Order of this Court

upon application by the Applicant on at least two (2) days' notice to such landlord and any such

secured creditors. If the Applicant disclaims or resiliates the lease governing such leased

premises in accordance with Section 32 of the CCAA, it shall not be required to pay Rent under

such lease pending resolution of any such dispute (other than Rent payable for the notice period

provided for in Section 32(5) of the CCAA), and the disclaimer or resiliation of the lease shall be

without prejudice to the Applicant's claim to the fixtures in dispute.
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NO PROCEEDINGS AGAINST THE APPLICANT OR THE PROPERTY

12. THIS COURT ORDERS that until and including January 31,2020, or such later date as

this Court may order (the "Stay Period"), no proceeding or enforcement process in any court or

tribunal (each, a "Proceeding") shall be commenced or continued against or in respect of the

Applicant or the Monitor, or their respective employees and representatives acting in such

capacities, or affecting the Business or the Property, except with the written consent of the

Applicant and the Monitor, or with leave of this Court, and any and all Proceedings currently

under way against or in respect of the Applicant, or its employees or representatives acting in

such capacities, or affecting the Business or the Property are hereby stayed and suspended

pending further Order of this Court.

NO EXERCISE OF'RIGHTS OR REMEDIES

13. THIS COURT ORDERS that during the Stay Period, all rights and remedies of any

individual, hrm, corporation, governmental body or agency, or any other entities (all of the

foregoing, collectively being "Persons" and each being a "Person") against or in respect of the

Applicant or the Monitor, or their respective employees and representatives acting in such

capacities, or affecting the Business or the Property, are hereby stayed and suspended except

with the written consent of the Applicant and the Monitor, or leave of this Court, provided that

nothing in this Order shall (a) empower the Applicant to carry on any business which the

Applicant is not lawfully entitled to carry on, (b) affect such investigations, actions, suits or

proceedings by a regulatory body as are permitted by Section 1 1.1 of the CCAA, (c) prevent the

filing of any registration to preserve or perfect a security interest, or (d) prevent the registration

of a claim for lien.

NO INTERFERENCE \ilITH RIGHTS

14. THIS COURT ORDERS that during the Stay Period, no Person shall discontinue, fail to

honour, alter, interfere with, repudiate, terminate or cease to perform any right, renewal right,

contract, agreement, lease, sublease, licence or permit in favour of or held by the Applicant,

except with the written consent of the Applicant and the Monitor, or leave of this Court.
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CONTINUATION OF' SERVICES

15. THIS COURT ORDERS that during the Stay Period, all Persons having oral or written

agreements with the Applicant or statutory or regulatory mandates for the supply of goods andlor

services, including without limitation all trademark license and other intellectual property,

computer software, communication and other data services, centralized banking services, payroll

and benefit services, insurance, freight services, transportation services, customs clearing,

warehouse and logistics services, utility or other services to the Business or the Applicant, are

hereby restrained until further Order of this Court from discontinuing, altering, interfering with

or terminating the supply or license of such goods, services, trademarks or other intellectual

property as may be required by the Applicant, and that the Applicant shall be entitled to the

continued use of the trademarks and other intellectual property currently licensed to, used or

owned by the Applicant (including Papyrus and Carlton Cards / Cartes Carlton) and of its

premises, telephone numbers, facsimile numbers, internet addresses and domain names, provided

in each case, that the normal prices or charges for all such goods or services received after the

date of this Order are paid by the Applicant in accordance with normal payment practices of the

Applicant or such other practices as may be agreed upon by the supplier or service provider and

each of the Applicant and the Monitor, or as may be ordered by this Court.

NON.DEROGATION OF RIGHTS

16. THIS COURT ORDERS that, notwithstanding anything else in this Order, no Person

shall be prohibited from requiring immediate payment for goods, services, use of leased or

licensed property or other valuable consideration provided on or after the date of this Order, nor

shall any Person be under any obligation on or after the date of this Order to advance or re-

advance any monies or otherwise extend any credit to the Applicant. Nothing in this Order shall

derogate from the rights conferred and obligations imposed by the CCAA.

PROCEEDINGS AGAINST DIRECTORS AND OFFICERS

17. THIS COURT ORDERS that during the Stay Period, and except as permitted by

subsection 11.03(2) of the CCAA, no Proceeding may be commenced or continued against any

of the former, current or future directors or off,rcers of the Applicant with respect to any claim

against the directors or officers that arose before the date hereof and that relates to any
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obligations of the Applicant whereby the directors or officers are alleged under any law to be

liable in their capacity as directors or officers for the payment or performance of such

obligations.

DIRECTORS' AND OFFICERS' INDEMNIX'ICATION AND CHARGE

18. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Applicant shall indemniff its directors and officers

against obligations and liabilities that they may incur as directors or officers of the Applicant

after the commencement of the within proceedings, except to the extent that, with respect to any

officer or director, the obligation or liability was incurred as a result of the director's or officer's

gross negligence or wilful misconduct.

19. THIS COURT ORDERS that the directors and ofhcers of the Applicant shall be entitled

to the benefit of and are hereby granted a charge (the "Directors' Charge") on the Property,

which charge shall not exceed an aggregate amount of $1,000,000, as security for the indemnity

provided in paragraph 18 of this Order. The Directors' Charge shall have the priority set out in

paragraphs 30 and 32 hereof.

20. THIS COURT ORDERS that, notwithstanding any language in any applicable

insurance policy to the contrary, (a) no insurer shall be entitled to be subrogated to or claim the

benefit of the Directors' Charge, and (b) the Applicant's directors and offtcers shall only be

entitled to the beneht of the Directors' Charge to the extent that they do not have coverage under

any directors' and officers' insurance policy, or to the extent that such coverage is insuffrcient to

pay amounts indemnified in accordance with paragraph 18 of this Order.

APPOINTMENT OF MONITOR

2L THIS COURT ORDERS that Richter is hereby appointed pursuant to the CCAA as the

Monitor, an officer of this Court, to monitor the business and financial affairs of the Applicant

with the powers and obligations set out in the CCAA or set forth herein and that the Applicant

and its shareholders, offrcers, directors, and Assistants shall advise the Monitor of all material

steps taken by the Applicant pursuant to this Order, and shall co-operate fully with the Monitor

in the exercise of its powers and discharge of its obligations and provide the Monitor with the

assistance that is necessary to enable the Monitor to adequately carry out the Monitor's

functions.
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22. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Monitor, in addition to its prescribed rights and

obligations under the CCAA, is hereby directed and empowered to:

(a) monitor and review the Applicant's receipts and disbursements;

(b) monitor the Orderly Wind-down of the Business and operations of the Applicant,

including any liquation that may be approved;

(c) report to this Court at such times and intervals as the Monitor may deem appropriate

with respect to matters relating to the Property, the Business, the Orderly Wind-down

and such other matters as may be relevant to the proceedings herein;

(d) advise the Applicant in its preparation of the Applicant's cash flow statements;

(e) have full and complete access to the Property, including the premises, books, records,

data, including data in electronic form, and other financial documents of the

Applicant, to the extent that is necessary to adequately assess the Applicant's

business and financial affairs or to perform its duties arising under this Order;

(Ð be at tiberty to engage independent legal counsel or such other persons as the Monitor

deems necessary or advisable respecting the exercise of its powers and performance

of its obligations under this Order; and

(g) perform such other duties as are required by this Order or by this Court from time to

time.

23. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Monitor shall not take possession of the Property and

shall take no part whatsoever in the management or supervision of the management of the

Business and shall not, by fulfilling its obligations hereunder, be deemed to have taken or

maintained possession or control of the Business or Property, or any part thereof.

24. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Monitor shall provide any creditor of the Applicant

with information provided by the Applicant in response to reasonable requests for information

made in writing by such creditor addressed to the Monitor. The Monitor shall not have any

responsibility or liability with respect to the information disseminated by it pursuant to this

paragraph. In the case of information that the Monitor has been advised by the Applicant is
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confidential, the Monitor shall not provide such information to creditors unless otherwise

directed by this Court or on such terms as the Monitor and the Applicant may agree.

25. THIS COURT ORDERS that, in addition to the rights and protections afforded the

Monitor under the CCAA or as an officer of this Court, the Monitor shall incur no liability or

obligation as a result of its appointment or the carrying out of the provisions of this Order, save

and except for any gross negligence or wilful misconduct on its part. Nothing in this Order shall

derogate from the protections afforded the Monitor by the CCAA or any applicable legislation.

26. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Monitor, counsel to the Monitor and counsel to the

Applicarìt shall be paid their reasonable fees and disbursements, in each case at their standard

rates and charges, whether incurred prior to, on or subsequent to the date of this Order, by the

Applicant as part of the costs of these proceedings. The Applicant is hereby authorized and

directed to pay the accounts of the Monitor, counsel to the Monitor and counsel to the Applicant

on a weekly basis or on such terms as such parties may agree and, in addition, the Applicant is

hereby authorized to pay to the Monitor, counsel to the Monitor and counsel to the Applicant,

retainers, nunc pro tunc, to be held by them as security for payment of their respective fees and

disbursements outstanding from time to time.

27. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Monitor and its legal counsel shall pass their accounts

from time to time, and for this purpose the accounts of the Monitor and its legal counsel are

hereby referred to a judge of the Commercial List of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice.

28. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Monitor, counsel to the Monitor, counsel to the

Applicant and the CROs (as hereinafter defined), shall be entitled to the benefit of and are hereby

granted a charge (the "Administration Charge") on the Property, which charge shall not exceed

an aggregate amount of $400,000 as security for their professional fees and disbursements

incurred at their standard rates and charges of the Monitor and such counsel, both before and

after the making of this Order, and the CROs. The Administration Charge shall have the priority

set out inparagraphs 30 and32 hereof.
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APPOINTMENT OF' CO.CHIEF RESTRUCTURING OF'FICERS

29. THIS COURT ORDERS that:

(a) the engagement letter in the form attached as Exhibit "K" to the Boucher Affidavit

(the "CRO Engagement Letter"), pursuant to which Mackinac Partners, LLC shall

provide the services of Michael Nowlan and Craig M. Boucher to act as co-chief

restructuring off,rcers of the Applicant (collectively, the "CROS" and each a "CRO"),

the execution of CRO Engagement Letter by the Applicant, nunc pro tunc, and the

appointment of the CROs as co-chief restructuring officers of the Applicant pursuant

to the terms thereot are hereby approved, including, without limitation, with respect

to the payment of the fees and expenses contemplated thereby and incurred by the

CROs in providing services to the Applicant;

(b) the CROs shall be responsible for performing the functions and obligations set out in

the CRO Engagement Letter for the benefit of the Applicant and shall provide timely

updates to the Monitor in respect of such functions and obligations;

(c) the CROs shall not be deemed to be a director, de facto director or employee of the

Applicant;

(d) nothing in this Order shall be construed as resulting in either CRO being an employer,

successor employer, a responsible person, operator or person with apparent authority

within the meaning of any statute, regulation or rule of law, or equity for any purpose

whatsoever;

(e) the CROs shall not have any liability with respect to any losses, claims, damages or

liabilities, of any nature or kind, to any Person from and after the date of this Order

except to the extent such losses, claims, damages or liabilities result from the gross

negligence or wilful misconduct on the part of the CROs; and

no action or other proceeding shall be commenced directly, or by way of

counterclaim, third party claim or otherwise, against or in respect of either of the

CROs and all rights and remedies of any Person against or in respect of each of the

CROs are hereby stayed and suspended, except with the written consent of the

(Ð
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applicable CRO or with leave of this Court on notice to the Applicant, the Monitor

and the applicable CRO. Notice of any such motion seeking leave of this Court shall

be served upon the Applicant, the Monitor and the applicable CRO at least seven

(7) days prior to the return date of any such motion for leave.

VALIDITY AND PRIORITY OF'CHARGES CREATED BY THIS ORDER

30. THIS COURT ORDERS that the priorities of the Administration Charge and the

Directors' Charge, as among them, shall be as follows:

First - Administration Charge (to the maximum amount of $400,000); and

Second - Directors' Charge (to the maximum amount of $1,000,000).

31. THIS COURT ORDERS that the filing, registration or perfection of the Administration

Charge or the Directors' Charge (collectively, the "Charges") shall not be required, and that the

Charges shall be valid and enforceable for all pu{poses, including as against any right, title or

interest filed, registered, recorded or perfected subsequent to the Charges coming into existence,

notwithstanding any such failure to file, register, record or perfect.

32. THIS COURT ORDERS that each of the Charges shall constitute a charge on the

Property and such Charges shall rank in priority to all other security interests, trusts, liens,

charges and encumbrances, claims of secured creditors, statutory or otherwise (collectively,

"Encumbrances") in favour of any Person.

33. THIS COURT ORDERS that except as otherwise expressly provided for herein, or as

may be approved by this Court, the Applicant shall not grant any Encumbrances over any

Property that rank in priority to, or pari passu with, any of the Charges unless the Applicant also

obtains the prior written consent of the Monitor and the beneficiaries of the Charges, or further

Order of this Court.

34. THIS COURT ORDERS that any Charge created by this Order over leases of real

property in Canada shall only be a Charge in the Applicant's interest in such real property leases.
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SERVICE AND NOTICE 

35. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Monitor shall (a) without delay, publish in the Globe 

& Mail a notice containing the information prescribed under the CCAA, and (b) within five days 

after the date of.this Order, (i) make this Order publicly available in the manner prescribed under 

the CCAA, (ii) send, or cause to be sent, in the prescribed manner, a notice to every known 

creditor who has a claim against the Applicant of more than $1,000, and (iii) prepare a list 

showing the names and addresses of those creditors and the estimated amounts of those claims, 

and make it publicly available in the prescribed manner, all in accordance with Section 23(1)(a) 

of the CCAA and the regulations made thereunder. 

· 36. THIS· COURT ORDERS that any employee of the Applicant who is sent a notice of 

termination of employment shall be deemed to have received such notice by no later than 8:00 

· a.m. Eastern Standard/Daylight Time on the fourth day following the date any such notice is 

sent, if such notice is sent by ordinary mail, expedited parcel or registered mail to the 

individual's address as reflected in the Applicant's books and records; provided, however, that 

(a) any notice of termination of employment that is provided to an employee of the Applicant in 

person at one of the Applicant's stores shall be deemed to have been received on the date of such 

delivery notwithstanding- the mailing of any notices of termination of employment, and (b) any 

notice of termination of employment that is sent to an employee of the Applicant by electronic 

message to the individual's email address as last shown in the Applicant's books and records 

shall be deemed to have been received 24 hours after the time such electronic message was sent, 

notwithstanding the mailing of any notices of termination of employment. 

37. THIS COURT ORDERS that the E-Service Protocol of the Commercial List (the 

"Protocol") is approved and adopted by reference herein and, in this proceeding, the service of 

documents made in accordance with the Protocol (which can be found on the Commercial List 

website at http:/ /www.ontariocourts.ca// scj/practice/practice-directions/toronto/ eservice­

commercial/) shall be valid and effective service._ Subject to Rule 17.05 this Order shall 

constitute an order for substituted service pursuant to Rule 16.04 of the Rules of Civil Procedure. 

Subject to Rule 3.0l(d) of the Rules of Civil Procedure and paragraph 21 of the Protocol, service 

of documents in accordance with the Protocol will be effective on transmission. This Court 
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further orders that a Case Website shall be established in accordance with the Protocol with the

following URL : https ://www.richter. cali nso lvencycase/sfp-canada-ltd/.

38. THIS COURT ORDERS that if the service or distribution of documents in accordance

with the Protocol is not practicable, the Applicant and the Monitor are at liberty to serve or

distribute this Order, any other materials and orders in these proceedings, any notices or other

correspondence, by forwarding true copies thereof by prepaid ordinary mail, courier, personal

delivery or facsimile transmission to the Applicant's creditors or other interested parties at their

respective addresses as last shown on the records of the Applicant and that any such service or

distribution by courier, personal delivery or facsimile transmission shall be deemed to be

received on the next business day following the date of forwarding thereof, or if sent by ordinary

mail, on the third business day after mailing.

39. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Applicant and the Monitor and their respective

counsel are at liberty to serve or distribute this Order, any other materials and orders as may be

reasonably required in these proceedings, including any notices, or other correspondence, by

forwarding true copies thereof by electronic message to the Applicant's creditors or other

interested parties and their advisors. For greater certainty, any such distribution or service shall

be deemed to be in satisfaction of a legal or judicial obligation, and notice requirements within

the meaning of clause 3(c) of the Electronic Commerce Protection Regulations, Reg. 81000-2-

17s (SOR/DORS).

SEALING

40. THIS COURT ORDERS that Confidential Appendix "A" to the Boucher Affidavit shall

be and is hereby sealed, kept confidential and shall not form part ofthe public record.

GENERAL

4L THIS COURT ORDERS that the Applicant or the Monitor may from time to time apply

to this Court to amend, vary or supplement this Order or for advice and directions in the

discharge of their respective powers and duties hereunder.
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42. THIS COURT ORDERS that nothing in this Order shall prevent the Monitor from

acting as an interim receiver, a receiver, a receiver and manager, or a trustee in bankruptcy of the

Applicant, the Business or the Property.

43. THIS COURT HEREBY REQUESTS the aid and recognition of any court, tribunal,

regulatory or administrative body having jurisdiction in Canada or in the United States, to give

effect to this Order and to assist the Applicant, the Monitor and their respective agents in

carrying out the terms of this Order. All courts, tribunals, regulatory and administrative bodies

are hereby respectfully requested to make such orders and to provide such assistance to the

Applicant and to the Monitor, as an offlrcer of this Court, as may be necessary or desirable to give

effect to this Order, to grant representative status to the Monitor in any foreign proceeding, or to

assist the Applicant and the Monitor and their respective agents in carrying out the terms of this

Order.

44. TI{IS COURT ORDERS that each of the Applicant and the Monitor be at liberty and is

hereby authorized and empowered to apply to any court, tribunal, regulatory or administrative

body, wherever located, for the recognition of this Order and for assistance in carrying out the

terms of this Order, and that the Monitor is authorized and empowered to act as a representative

in respect of the within proceedings for the purpose of having these proceedings recognized in a

j urisdiction outside Canada.

45. THIS COURT ORDERS that this Order and all of its provisions are effective as of

12:01 a.m. Eastern Standard/Daylight Time on the date of this Order.

r^
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{1270.002-W0059988.2} 

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE 

In re: 

SFP FRANCHISE CORPORATION, et al.,1 

Debtors. 

Chapter 11 

Case No. 20-10134 (JTD)    

(Jointly Administered) 

Ref Nos. 101 & 102

ORDER AUTHORIZING IMPLEMENTATION OF KEY EMPLOYEE 
RETENTION PLAN AND KEY EMPLOYEE INCENTIVE PLAN 

Upon the Motion of the Debtors for Entry of an Order Authorizing Implementation of Key 

Employee Retention Plan (the “Motion”)2 and upon the First Day Declaration; and the Court 

having jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334 and the Amended 

Standing Order of Reference from the United States District Court for the District of Delaware 

dated February 29, 2012; and the Court having found that this Motion is a core proceeding 

pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2) and the Court may enter an order consistent with Article III of 

the United States Constitution; and the Court having found that venue of this proceeding and this 

Motion in this District is proper pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409; and it appearing that 

sufficient notice of the Motion has been given; and it appearing that there is good and sufficient 

cause for the relief set forth in this Order and that the relief set forth in this Order is in the best 

interests of the Debtors’ estates; and the Court having determined that, based on the evidence 

submitted at the hearing on the Motion, none of the Key Employees are “insiders” of the 

Debtors, as that term is defined in section 101(31) of the Bankruptcy Code; it is hereby 

1 The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal tax 
identification number, are: SFP Franchise Corporation (6248); and Schurman Fine Papers (1409).  The 
location of the Debtors’ principal place of business is 300 Oak Bluff Lane, Goodlettsville, Tennessee 
37072.  
2
 Capitalized terms not defined herein shall have the same meaning as ascribed to them in the Motion. 

Case 20-10134-JTD    Doc 204    Filed 02/14/20    Page 1 of 2



1. ORDERED that the Motion is GRANTED as set forth herein; and it is further 

2. ORDERED that the KERP is approved in its entirety and the Debtors are 

authorized to implement the KERP in their discretion; and it is further 

3. ORDERED that the Debtors are hereby authorized, but not directed, to make 

payments to the Key Employees listed on Exhibit 1 to the Motion, in amounts not to exceed 

those set forth on Exhibit 1 for each Key Employee, pursuant to the KERP, as applicable and the 

authorization to make such payments shall not create any obligation on the part of the Debtors to 

make payments under the KERP unless the participants meet the necessary conditions 

thereunder; and it is further 

4. ORDERED that all amounts earned and payable under the KERP shall have 

administrative expense priority under Bankruptcy Code sections 503(b) and 507(a)(2); and it is 

further  

5. ORDERED that the terms and conditions of this Order shall be immediately 

effective and enforceable upon entry; and it is further   

6. ORDERED that the Debtors are authorized to take all actions necessary to 

effectuate the relief granted pursuant to this Order in accordance with the Motion; and it is 

further 

7. ORDERED that the Court retains jurisdiction with respect to all matters arising 

from or related to the implementation of this Order. 

 
 

JOHN T. DORSEY 
UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY JUDGEDated: February 14th, 2020 

Wilmington, Delaware

Case 20-10134-JTD    Doc 204    Filed 02/14/20    Page 2 of 2
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^_X]X^]!^a!^cWTa!U^a\!^U!PbbdaP]RT!R^]cT\_[PcTS!d]STa!?88J!X]!aTb_TRc!^U!cWT!A]U^a\PcX^]*!

4* ;P_XcP[XiTS!cTa\b!]^c!^cWTafXbT!STUX]TS!WTaTX]!PaT!Pb!STUX]TS!X]!cWT!;^\_P]hmb \^cX^]!\PcTaXP[b(!X]R[dSX]V!cWT!PUUXSPeXc!

^U!;aPXV!D*!9^dRWTa(!bf^a]!BP]dPah!.5(!.,.,!&cWT!g@O[bO_f!-4!7\bQVS_!6TTWROcWah'!UX[TS!X]!bd__^ac!^U!cWT ;^\_P]hmb 

\^cX^]! U^a! P__a^eP[! ^U! cWT! _a^_^bTS! 8\T]STS! P]S! ITbcPcTS! A]XcXP[! FaSTa*! KWXb! JTR^]S! IT_^ac! bW^d[S! QT! aTPS! X]!

R^]Yd]RcX^]!fXcW!cWT!BP]dPah!.5!9^dRWTa!8UUXSPeXc(!Pb!RTacPX]!X]U^a\PcX^]!R^]cPX]TS!X]!cWT!BP]dPah!.5!9^dRWTa!8UUXSPeXc!

WPb!]^c!QTT]!X]R[dSTS!WTaTX]!X]!^aSTa!c^!Pe^XS!d]]TRTbbPah!Sd_[XRPcX^]*!!

5* L][Tbb!^cWTafXbT!]^cTS(!P[[!\^]TcPah!P\^d]cb!R^]cPX]TS!X]!cWXb!JTR^]S!IT_^ac!PaT!Tg_aTbbTS!X]!;P]PSXP]!S^[[Pab*!
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?K*!I>;!68I?K?I?;H!D<!H<E!86C696!H?C8;!I>;!?HHJ6C8;!D<!I>;!?C?I?6A!DG9;G!

-,* JX]RT!cWT!SPcT!^U!cWT!A]XcXP[!FaSTa(!cWT!PRcXeXcXTb!^U!J>G!;P]PSP!WPeT!X]R[dSTS6!

&P' R^aaTb_^]SX]V fXcW cWT ;^\_P]hmb T\_[^hTTb aTVPaSX]V cWT ;;88 Ga^RTTSX]Vb( X]R[dSX]V XbbdX]V cTa\X]PcX^] 

[TccTab!c^!P[[!^U!J>G ;P]PSPmb T\_[^hTTb _a^eXSX]V f^aZX]V ]^cXRT ̂ U cTa\X]PcX^] &^a PSeP]RT ]^cXRT ̂ U cTa\X]PcX^] 

c^!cW^bT!T\_[^hTTb!^]![TPeT'7!!

&Q' aTb_^]SX]V!c^!RP[[b!P]S!T]`dXaXTb!Ua^\!RaTSXc^ab!P]S!̂ cWTa!bcPZTW^[STab!X]!R^]]TRcX^]!fXcW!cWT!;;88!Ga^RTTSX]Vb7!

&R' \PZX]V!_Ph\T]cb!c^!bd__[XTab!U^a!V^^Sb!P]S!bTaeXRTb!aTRTXeTS!U^[[^fX]V!cWT!XbbdP]RT!^U!cWT!A]XcXP[!FaSTa7!

&S' R^\\d]XRPcX]V!fXcW!cWT!;P]PSXP]!;^]bd[cP]c!&Pb!WTaTX]PUcTa!STUX]TS'!P]S!R^d]bT[!U^a!RTacPX]![P]S[^aSb!aTVPaSX]V!

cWT!CX`dXSPcX^]!JP[T7!P]S!

&T' R^]bd[cX]V!fXcW!cWT!D^]Xc^a!P]S!Xcb!R^d]bT[!^]!ePaX^db!\PccTab!X]!R^]]TRcX^]!fXcW!cWT!;;88!Ga^RTTSX]Vb*!

K*!I>;!68I?K?I?;H!D<!I>;!BDC?IDG!H?C8;!I>;!?HHJ6C8;!D<!I>;!?C?I?6A!DG9;G!

--* JX]RT cWT SPcT ̂ U cWT A]XcXP[ FaSTa( cWT D^]Xc^amb PRcXeXcXTb WPeT X]R[dSTS6!

&P' PaaP]VX]V!U^a!]^cXRT!^U! cWT!;;88!Ga^RTTSX]Vb!c^!QT!_dQ[XbWTS! X]! cWT! BP]dPah!.5(!.,.,!P]S!>TQadPah!1(!.,.,!

TSXcX^]b!^U!cWT!?[^QT!%!DPX[(!Pb!aT`dXaTS!_dabdP]c!c^!cWT!A]XcXP[!FaSTa7!

&Q' bT]SX]V!P!]^cXRT(!fXcWX]!1!SPhb!^U!cWT!XbbdP]RT!^U!cWT!A]XcXP[!FaSTa(!^U!cWT!;;88!Ga^RTTSX]Vb!c^!P[[!Z]^f]!RaTSXc^ab!

^U!J>G!;P]PSP7!

&R' UX[X]V!_aTbRaXQTS!S^Rd\T]cb!fXcW!cWT!FUUXRT!^U!cWT!Jd_TaX]cT]ST]c!^U!9P]Zad_cRh!_dabdP]c!c^!cWT!;;887!

&S' TbcPQ[XbWX]V!P!fTQbXcT!Pc!Wcc_6++fff*aXRWcTa*RP+X]b^[eT]RhRPbT+bU_)RP]PSP)[cS+(!fWTaT!P[[!\PcTaXP[b!UX[TS!fXcW!cWT!

;^dac(!P]S!P[[!^aSTab!\PST!Qh!cWT!;^dac!X]!R^]]TRcX^]!fXcW!cWT!;;88!Ga^RTTSX]Vb(!PaT!PePX[PQ[T!X]!T[TRca^]XR!

U^a\7!

&T' PaaP]VX]V! U^a! P! c^[[)UaTT! W^c[X]T! cWa^dVW!fWXRW! cWT!;^\_P]hmb! RaTSXc^ab! ^a! ^cWTa! X]cTaTbcTS! _PacXTb! RP]!\PZT!

T]`dXaTb!aT[PcTS!c^!cWT!;;88!Ga^RTTSX]Vb7!

&U' X\_[T\T]cX]V _a^RTSdaTb U^a cWT \^]Xc^aX]V ^U J>G ;P]PSPmb RPbW U[^fb P]S U^a ^]V^X]V aT_^acX]V ^U ePaXP]RTb 

c^ J>G ;P]PSPmb ;PbW!>[^f!>^aTRPbc!&Pb!WTaTX]PUcTa!STUX]TS'7!
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&V' R^aaTb_^]SX]V P]S R^\\d]XRPcX]V fXcW J>G ;P]PSP( DPRZX]PR P]S cWT ;^\_P]hmb [TVP[ R^d]bT[! ^]! RPbW!

\P]PVT\T]c!P]S!ePaX^db!^cWTa!\PccTab!X]!R^]]TRcX^]!fXcW!cWT!;;88!Ga^RTTSX]Vb7!

&W' R^\\d]XRPcX]V!fXcW!R^d]bT[!U^a!RTacPX]![P]S[^aSb!aTVPaSX]V!cWT!;^]bd[cX]V!8VaTT\T]c(!cWT!JP[T!?dXST[X]Tb!P]S!

cWT!CX`dXSPcX^]!JP[T7!!

&X' R^\\d]XRPcX^]!fXcW!Xcb![TVP[!R^d]bT[(!JcXZT\P]!=[[X^cc!CCG!&gHaWXSZO[h'(!X]!R^]]TRcX^]!fXcW!Xcb!^]V^X]V!aTeXTf!^U!

cWT!eP[XSXch!P]S!T]U^aRTPQX[Xch!^U!cWT!bTRdaXch!VaP]cTS!Qh!J>G!;P]PSP!X]!UPe^da!^U!8\TaXRP]!?aTTcX]Vb!;^a_^aPcX^]!

P]S!^cWTa!\PccTab!X]!R^]]TRcX^]!fXcW!cWT!;;88!Ga^RTTSX]Vb7!!!

&Y' aTb_^]SX]V!c^!RP[[b!P]S!T]`dXaXTb!Ua^\!RaTSXc^ab!P]S!̂ cWTa!bcPZTW^[STab!X]!R^]]TRcX^]!fXcW!cWT!;;88!Ga^RTTSX]Vb7!

&Z' PccT]SX]V!Pc!;^dac!X]!R^]]TRcX^]!fXcW!cWT!CX`dXSPcX^]!JP[T!8__a^eP[!FaSTa7!P]S!

&[' _aT_PaX]V!cWXb!JTR^]S!IT_^ac*!

-.* A]!PSSXcX^]!c^!cWT!PQ^eT(!Pb!]^cTS!X]!cWT!>Xabc!IT_^ac(!^]!BP]dPah!-3(!.,.,(!J>G!;P]PSP!caP]bUTaaTS!LJ<$/!\X[[X^]!&cWT!

g<b[R` I_O[`TS_h'!c^!Xcb!LJ!_PaT]c!R^\_P]h(!JRWda\P]!>X]T!GP_Tab!&gH<E JHh(!P]S!c^VTcWTa!fXcW!Xcb!bdQbXSXPaXTb(!

X]R[dSX]V!J>G!;P]PSP(!cWT!gHQVb_ZO[ =_\b]h'(!^]!PRR^d]c!^U!&X'!aT_Ph\T]c!U^a!RTacPX]!R^bcb!_aTeX^db[h!_PXS!Qh!J>G!

LJ!U^a!cWT!QT]TUXc!^U!J>G!;P]PSP!P]S!&XX'!_aT_Ph\T]c!^U!RTacPX]!R^bcb!c^!QT!_PXS!Qh!J>G!LJ!U^a!cWT!QT]TUXc!J>G!;P]PSP!

SdaX]V!cWT!;;88!Ga^RTTSX]Vb*!!8UcTa!QTR^\X]V!PfPaT!^U!cWT!>d]Sb!KaP]bUTa(!cWT!D^]Xc^a!R^]cPRcTS!cWT!;IFb!c^!aT`dTbc!

cWPc!P[[!PePX[PQ[T!X]U^a\PcX^]!P]S!S^Rd\T]cPcX^]!bd__^acX]V!cWT!>d]Sb!KaP]bUTa!QT!_a^eXSTS!c^!cWT!D^]Xc^a*!!KWT!D^]Xc^a!

]^cTb!cWPc!cWT!A]XcXP[!FaSTa!_a^eXSTS!cWPc!J>G!;P]PSP!f^d[S!]^c!\PZT!P]h!UdacWTa!_Ph\T]cb!c^(!^a!^]!PRR^d]c!^U(!P]h!

aT[PcTS!_Pach!d]cX[!UdacWTa!FaSTa!^U!cWT!;^dac*!

-/* JdQbT`dT]c!c^!cWT!XbbdP]RT!̂ U!cWT!A]XcXP[!FaSTa(!R^d]bT[!U^a!P!RaTSXc^a!R^]cPRcTS!JcXZT\P]!c^(!P\^]V!̂ cWTa!cWX]Vb(!aT`dTbc!

PSSXcX^]P[!X]U^a\PcX^]!X]!R^]]TRcX^]!fXcW!cWT!>d]Sb!KaP]bUTa(!X]R[dSX]V!cWT!bcT_b!cPZT]!c^!TUUTRc!cWT!>d]Sb!KaP]bUTa(!Pb!

fT[[!Pb!cWT!eXTfb!^U!Q^cW!cWT!D^]Xc^a!P]S!J>G!;P]PSP!Pb!c^!cWT!Q^]P!UXSTb!^U!cWT!>d]Sb!KaP]bUTa*!

-0* 8b!Pc!cWT!SPcT!^U!cWXb!JTR^]S!IT_^ac(!cWT!D^]Xc^a!Xb!]^c!X]!P!_^bXcX^]!c^!aT_^ac!UdacWTa!^]!cWT!>d]Sb!KaP]bUTa!j!cWT!D^]Xc^a!

fX[[!aT_^ac!QPRZ!c^!cWXb!;^dac!^]!cWXb!\PccTa!U^[[^fX]V!Xcb!aTeXTf!P]S!TgP\X]PcX^]!^U!cWT!X]U^a\PcX^]!P]S!S^Rd\T]cPcX^]!c^!

QT!_a^eXSTS!Qh!J>G!;P]PSP!P]S+^a!cWT!;IFb*!!!!!!!

!
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K?*!I>;!A?FJ?96I?DC!H6A;!

-1* 8b!]^cTS!X]!cWT!>Xabc!IT_^ac(!J>G!;P]PSP!WPb!STcTa\X]TS!cWPc!Xc!Xb!X]!cWT!QTbc!X]cTaTbc!^U!P[[!bcPZTW^[STab!c^!R^\_[TcT!

cWT!CX`dXSPcX^]!JP[T*!!!

-2* 8b!]^cTS!X]!cWT!BP]dPah!.5!9^dRWTa!8UUXSPeXc(!cWT!;^]bd[cP]c!_a^eXSTS!]^cXRT!c^!cWT!JRWda\P]!?a^d_!cWPc!Xc!WPS!PbbXV]TS!

Xcb!aXVWcb(!QT]TUXcb!P]S!̂ Q[XVPcX^]b!d]STa!cWT!;^]bd[cX]V!8VaTT\T]c!aT[PcX]V!c^!cWT!CX`dXSPcX^]!JP[T!X]!;P]PSP!c^!;P]PSXP]!

PUUX[XPcTb(! ]P\T[h! ?^aS^]! 9a^cWTab! ;P]PSP! LC;! P]S! DTaRWP]c! ITcPX[! J^[dcX^]b(! LC;! &R^[[TRcXeT[h(! cWT! g8O[ORWO[ 

8\[`bYaO[ah'!TUUTRcXeT!Pb!^U!BP]dPah!-3(!.,.,*!!8b!P!aTbd[c(!cWT!;P]PSXP]!;^]bd[cP]c!fX[[!QT!_TaU^a\X]V!P[[!cWT!bTaeXRTb!

c^!QT!_TaU^a\TS!Qh!cWT!;^]bd[cP]c!X]!R^]]TRcX^]!fXcW!cWT!CX`dXSPcX^]!JP[T!X]!;P]PSP*!

-3* KWT!JRWda\P]!?a^d_!Tg_TRcb!cWPc!cWT!CX`dXSPcX^]!JP[T!fX[[!QT!R^]R[dSTS!Qh!>TQadPah!.5(!.,.,*!

K??*!I>;!6B;C9;9!6C9!G;HI6I;9!?C?I?6A!DG9;G!!

-4* KWT!A]XcXP[!FaSTa!_a^eXSTS!U^a!cWT!JcPh!GTaX^S!c^!Tg_XaT!^]!BP]dPah!/-(!.,.,!P]S!bdRW!UdacWTa!aT[XTU!STcTa\X]TS!c^!QT!

aTPb^]PQ[h ]TRTbbPah U^a J>Gmb R^]cX]dTS ^_TaPcX^]b SdaX]V cWT X]XcXP[ JcPh GTaX^S*!J>G!;P]PSP!Xb!]^f!bTTZX]V!cWT!

_a^_^bTS!8\T]STS!P]S!ITbcPcTS!A]XcXP[!FaSTa(!fWXRW!R^]cT\_[PcTb!P]!TgcT]bX^]!^U!cWT!JcPh!GTaX^S!c^!DPaRW!/-(!.,.,!

P]S!RTacPX]!^cWTa!aT[XTU(!X]R[dSX]V(!15;-8!)31)(!cWT!U^[[^fX]V6!

&P' PdcW^aXiPcX^]!c^!UX[T!P!_[P]!^U!R^\_a^\XbT!^a!PaaP]VT\T]c!&cWT!#EYO[#'7!!

&Q' P__a^eP[!c^!_Ta\P]T]c[h!^a!cT\_^aPaX[h!RTPbT(!S^f]bXiT!^a!bWdc!S^f]!P]h!^U!Xcb!QdbX]Tbb!^a!^_TaPcX^]b(!P]S!c^!

SXb_^bT!^U!aTSd]SP]c!^a!]^])\PcTaXP[!PbbTcb!]^c!TgRTTSX]V!$-,,(,,,!X]!P]h!^]T!caP]bPRcX^]!^a!$1,,(,,,!X]!cWT!

PVVaTVPcT7!

&R' bPUTVdPaSb(!X]!UPe^da!^U!Q^cW!cWT!D^]Xc^a!P]S!cWT!;IFb(!X]!aTb_TRc!^U!P]h!_a^_Tach!^U!J>G!;P]PSP!cWPc!\Ph!QT!

T]eXa^]\T]cP[[h!R^]cP\X]PcTS7!P]S!

&S' PSSXcX^]P[!_a^cTRcX^]b!X]!R^]]TRcX^]!fXcW!cWT!RWPaVTb!VaP]cTS!_dabdP]c!c^!cWT!A]XcXP[!FaSTa*!

-5* 8b!]^cTS!X]!cWT!>Xabc!IT_^ac(!J>G!;P]PSP(!fXcW!cWT!PbbXbcP]RT!^U!cWT!D^]Xc^a(!_aT_PaTS!P!bcPcT\T]c!^U!Xcb!_a^YTRcTS!RPbW!

U[^fb!U^a!cWT!_TaX^S!BP]dPah!-4(!.,.,!c^!8_aX[!-3(!.,.,!&cWT!k8O`V!<Y\d!<\_SQO`al'(!P!R^_h!^U!fWXRW!Xb!PccPRWTS!WTaTc^!

Pb!6]]S[RWe!g9h!P]S!Xb!bd\\PaXiTS!QT[^f6!
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!

.,* KWT!;PbW!>[^f!>^aTRPbc!X]SXRPcTb!cWPc!J>G!;P]PSP!fX[[!WPeT!bdUUXRXT]c![X`dXSXch!c^!Ud]S!Q^cW!^_TaPcX]V!R^bcb!Pb!_Pac!^U!

cWT!CX`dXSPcX^]!JP[T!P]S!cWT!R^bcb!^U!cWT!;;88!Ga^RTTSX]Vb!SdaX]V!cWT!TgcT]bX^]!^U!cWT!JcPh!GTaX^S!c^!DPaRW!/-(!.,.,(!

XU!VaP]cTS*!!

.-* NWX[T Xc Xb c^^ TPa[h c^ STcTa\X]T fWTcWTa P eXPQ[T G[P] fX[[ QT _aTbT]cTS Qh J>G ;P]PSP c^ Xcb RaTSXc^ab( X] cWT D^]Xc^amb 

eXTf( cWT ;^\_P]hmb aT`dTbc U^a P]!TgcT]bX^]!^U!cWT!JcPh!GTaX^S!c^!DPaRW!/-(!.,.,!Xb!P__a^_aXPcT!X]!cWT!RXaRd\bcP]RTb!

U^a!cWT!U^[[^fX]V!aTPb^]b6!

&P' J>G!;P]PSP!WPb!PRcTS!P]S!R^]cX]dTb!c^!PRc!X]!V^^S!UPXcW!P]S!fXcW!SdT!SX[XVT]RT!X]!cPZX]V!bcT_b!c^!\^]TcXiT!Xcb!

PbbTcb!U^a!cWT!QT]TUXc!^U!Xcb!bcPZTW^[STab7!

&Q' cWT!TgcT]bX^]!fX[[!P[[^f!U^a!cWT!R^\_[TcX^]!^U!cWT!CX`dXSPcX^]!JP[T!P]S!_Ta\Xc!J>G!;P]PSP(!X]!R^]bd[cPcX^]!fXcW!

^cWTa!bcPZTW^[STab(!bdUUXRXT]c!cX\T!c^!aT_^ac!c^!cWXb!;^dac!PRR^aSX]V[h7!P]S!

&R' cWT!TgcT]bX^]!bW^d[S!]^c!_aTYdSXRT!P]h!Va^d_!^U!RaTSXc^ab(!Pb!J>G!;P]PSP!Xb!_a^YTRcTS!c^!WPeT!bdUUXRXT]c!Ud]Sb!c^!

_Ph!_^bc)UX[X]V!bTaeXRTb!P]S!bd__[XTb(!Pb!R^]cT\_[PcTS!Qh!cWT!;PbW!>[^f!>^aTRPbc*!

H<E!8O[ORO!AaR

8O`V!<Y\d!<\_SQO`a

<_\Z!@O[bO_f!,3(!-+-+!a\!6]_WY!,2(!-+-+

&869$(!W[!ZWYYW\[`5!b[ObRWaSR'

,.!LSSX!I\aOY

GSQSW]a`

;P]PSP!ITcPX[!ITRTX_cb 5*5!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

I\aOY!GSQSW]a` 4*4$!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

9W`Pb_`SZS[a`

>aTXVWc &,*.'$!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

IT]c!%!LcX[XcXTb &-*.'!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

Jc^aT!=g_T]bTb!P]S!FcWTa &,*/'!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

GPha^[[!%!9T]TUXcb &-*1'!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

CX`dXSXPcX^]!>TT!%!=g_T]bTb &,*1'!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

JP[Tb!KPg!IT\XccP]RTb &.*-'!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

Ga^UTbbX^]P[!>TTb &.*/'!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

DXbRT[[P]T^db+FcWTa &,*.'!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

I\aOY!9W`Pb_`SZS[a` &3*/'$!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

CSa!8O`V!<Y\d ,*0$!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

D]S[W[U!8O`V!7OYO[QS /*,$!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

ETc!;PbW!>[^f -*1!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

;[RW[U!8O`V!7OYO[QS 0*1$!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!
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K???*!BDC?IDGiH!8DC8AJH?DCH!6C9!G;8DBB;C96I?DCH!

..* >^a!cWT!aTPb^]b!bTc!^dc!X]!cWXb!JTR^]S!IT_^ac(!cWT!D^]Xc^a!Xb!^U!cWT!eXTf!cWPc!cWT!aT[XTU!aT`dTbcTS!Qh!J>G!;P]PSP!Xb!Q^cW!

P__a^_aXPcT!P]S!aTPb^]PQ[T!P]S!cWT!D^]Xc^a!cWTaTU^aT!aTR^\\T]Sb!cWPc!cWXb!;^dac!P__a^eT!cWT!_a^_^bTS!8\T]STS!P]S!

ITbcPcTS!A]XcXP[!FaSTa*!!!

!

8[[!^U!fWXRW!Xb!aTb_TRcUd[[h!bdQ\XccTS!^]!cWXb!/,cW!SPh!^U!BP]dPah(!.,.,*!

!
GWQVaS_!6RcW`\_f!=_\b]!?[Q*!
W[!Wa`!QO]OQWaf!O`!B\[Wa\_!\T!!
H<E!8O[ORO!AaR*!
O[R![\a!W[!Wa`!]S_`\[OY!QO]OQWaf!
!
!

! ! ! ! !
OOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOO! ! ! OOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOO!
6ROZ!HVS_ZO[(!B76(!8?GE(!A?I! ! ! ! E_WaS`V!EOaSY(!B76(!8<6(!8?GE(!A?I!
!
!
!
!
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I.  INTRODUCTION  

1. On January 23, 2020 (the “Filing Date”), the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the “Court”) issued 

an order (the “Initial Order”) granting SFP Canada Ltd. (“SFP Canada” or the “Company”) protection pursuant to the 

Companies’ Creditors Arrangement Act, R.S.C. 1985, c. C-36, as amended (the “CCAA”).  Pursuant to the Initial Order, 

Richter Advisory Group Inc. (“Richter”) was appointed as the Company’s Monitor (the “Monitor”).   

2. The Initial Order, inter alia, 

(a) granted a stay of proceedings in favour of the Company until January 31, 2020 (the “Stay Period”);  

(b) approved the engagement of Mackinac Partners, LLC (“Mackinac”) to provide the services of Michael Nowlan 

and Craig M. Boucher to act as co-chief restructuring officers (the “CROs” and each a “CRO”) of SFP Canada;  

(c) ordered that, except as specifically permitted in the Initial Order and until further Order of the Court, the Company 

shall make no payments, transfers or disbursements to, or on account of, any related parties; and 

(d) granted certain charges sought by SFP Canada. 

A copy of the Initial Order is attached hereto as Appendix “A”.  The proceedings commenced by SFP Canada under 

the CCAA are herein referred to as the “CCAA Proceedings”. 

3. On the Filing Date, SFP Canada’s U.S. parent company, Schurman Fine Papers (“SFP US”, and together with its 

subsidiaries, including SFP Canada, the “Schurman Group”) commenced voluntary reorganization proceedings (the 

“Chapter 11 Proceedings”) in the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware (the “US Court”) under 

Chapter 11 of the United States Bankruptcy Code in order to, among other things, pursue an orderly liquidation of the 

Schurman Group’s retail stores in the United States. 

4. As noted in the Monitor’s first report dated January 24, 2020 (the “First Report”), the Chapter 11 Proceedings and the 

CCAA Proceedings were preceded by the termination of commercial licensing, supply, marketing and other critical 

operating agreements that the Schurman Group had with American Greetings Corporation (“American Greetings”).  

Without the continued use of these agreements, including the trademarks required to operate the Schurman Group’s 

retail businesses, the Schurman Group concluded that it could no longer operate as a going concern and commenced 

the Chapter 11 Proceedings and the CCAA Proceedings to, among other things, pursue an orderly wind-down / 

liquidation of their retail stores in both the United States and Canada. 
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5. On January 24, 2020, the Court issued an order (the “Liquidation Sale Approval Order”) which, among other things: 

(a) approved the consulting agreement (the “Consulting Agreement”) dated January 17, 2020 between SFP 

Canada and Schurman Retail Group, LLC, and a contractual joint venture comprised of Gordon Brothers Retail 

Partners, LLC and Hilco Merchant Resources, LLC (collectively, the “Original Consultant”), pursuant to which 

the Company engaged the Original Consultant to act as liquidation consultant to assist in liquidating the 

Company’s inventory (“Merchandise”), certain owned furniture, fixtures and equipment (“FF&E”) and certain 

other goods at the Schurman Group’s retail locations (the “Liquidation Sale”) in accordance with the sale 

guidelines (the “Sale Guidelines”) appended to the Liquidation Sale Approval Order; and  

(b) authorized SFP Canada, with the assistance of the Original Consultant, to conduct the Liquidation Sale. 

A copy of the Liquidation Sale Approval Order is attached hereto as Appendix “B”. 

6. Also on January 24, 2020, the Original Consultant provided notice to the Schurman Group that it had assigned its rights, 

benefits and obligations under the Consulting Agreement relating to the Liquidation Sale in Canada to its Canadian 

affiliates, namely Gordon Brothers Canada ULC and Merchant Retail Solutions, ULC (collectively, the “Canadian 

Consultant”, and with the Original Consultant, the “Consultant”) effective as of January 17, 2020. 

7. On January 31, 2020, the Court issued an order (the “Amended and Restated Initial Order”) which, among other things, 

extended the Stay Period to March 31, 2020.  A copy of the Amended and Restated Initial Order is attached hereto as 

Appendix “C”.    

8. This report is the Monitor’s third report (the “Third Report”) to this Court.  The Monitor’s First Report was filed with the 

Court, inter alia, in support of the Liquidation Sale Approval Order.  The Monitor’s second report dated January 30, 2020 

(the “Second Report”) was filed with the Court to, among other things, provide an update on the activities of SFP 

Canada and the Monitor since the issuance of the Initial Order and support the Company’s request for certain 

amendments to the Initial Order, including the extension of the Stay Period to March 31, 2020.  Copies of the First Report 

and the Second Report, excluding appendices, are attached hereto as Appendix “D” and Appendix “E”, respectively.       
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II. PURPOSE OF REPORT 

9. The purpose of this Third Report is to provide information to the Court in respect of the following: 

(a) the activities of SFP Canada and the Monitor since the date of the Second Report; 

(b) the status of the Liquidation Sale; 

(c) the status of the Chapter 11 Proceedings; 

(d) SFP Canada’s reported receipts and disbursements for the period from January 18, 2020 to March 20, 2020, 

including a comparison of reported to forecast results; 

(e) SFP Canada’s request for an extension of the Stay Period to June 30, 2020, including the Company’s extended 

cash flow forecast for the period March 21, 2020 to July 3, 2020 (the “Extended Cash Flow Forecast”); and 

(f) the Monitor’s recommendation that this Court make an order, as requested by SFP Canada, extending the Stay 

Period to June 30, 2020. 

III. TERMS OF REFERENCE 

10. In preparing this Third Report, the Monitor has relied solely on information and documents provided by SFP Canada and 

its advisors, including unaudited financial information, and discussions with representatives of Mackinac, the CROs, and 

the Company’s legal counsel (collectively, the “Information”).  In accordance with industry practice, except as otherwise 

described in the Third Report, Richter has reviewed the Information for reasonableness, internal consistency, and use 

in the context in which it was provided.  However, Richter has not audited or otherwise attempted to verify the accuracy 

or completeness of the Information in a manner that would comply with Generally Accepted Auditing Standards 

(“GAAS”) pursuant to the Chartered Professional Accountant of Canada Handbook and, as such, Richter expresses no 

opinion or other form of assurance contemplated under GAAS in respect of the Information. 

11. Future oriented financial information reported on or relied upon in preparing this Third Report is based on SFP Canada’s 

assumptions regarding future events; actual results achieved may vary from the information presented even if the 

hypothetical assumptions occur and these variations may be material.  Accordingly, the Monitor expresses no 

assurances as to whether the projections will be achieved.  
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12. Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein are as defined in the Company’s motion materials, including the affidavit 

of Craig M. Boucher, sworn March 26, 2020 (the “March 26 Boucher Affidavit”). This Third Report should be read in 

conjunction with the March 26 Boucher Affidavit, as certain information contained in the March 26 Boucher Affidavit has 

not been included herein in order to avoid unnecessary duplication.  

13. Unless otherwise noted, all monetary amounts contained in this Third Report are expressed in Canadian dollars. 

IV. THE ACTIVITIES OF SFP CANADA  

14. The activities of SFP Canada since the commencement of the CCAA Proceedings to January 30, 2020 are detailed in 

the Monitor’s Second Report.  Since the filing of the Monitor’s Second Report, the activities of SFP Canada have 

included: 

(a) responding to calls and enquiries from creditors and other stakeholders in connection with the CCAA Proceedings; 

(b) making payments to suppliers for goods and services received following the issuance of the Initial Order; 

(c) reporting receipts and disbursements; 

(d) communicating with the Consultant, the Monitor and counsel for certain landlords regarding the Liquidation Sale; 

(e) consulting with the Monitor regarding SFP Canada’s proposed disclaimer of certain retail leases effective at or 

around the conclusion of the Liquidation Sale (discussed further below); 

(f) consulting with the Monitor in connection with the preparation of the Extended Cash Flow Forecast; 

(g) consulting with the Monitor in connection with SFP Canada’s proportionate sharing of certain retention payments 

for certain key Schurman Group employees, as approved and provided for in the Chapter 11 Proceedings (the 

“KERP”); 

(h) corresponding and communicating with the Monitor in connection with SFP Canada’s transfer of USD$3 million 

(the “Funds Transfer”) to SFP US on January 17, 2020; and 

(i)  consulting with the Monitor and its counsel on various matters in connection with the CCAA Proceedings. 
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V. THE ACTIVITIES OF THE MONITOR  

15. The activities of the Monitor from the commencement of the CCAA Proceedings to January 30, 2020 are detailed in the 

Monitor’s Second Report.  Since the filing of the Monitor’s Second Report, the Monitor’s activities have included: 

(a) monitoring SFP Canada’s cash flows, including the reporting of variances to SFP Canada’s cash flow forecast;  

(b) reviewing daily status reports prepared by the Consultant, comprising sales, inventory and other information in 

connection with the Liquidation Sale; 

(c) corresponding with SFP Canada, Mackinac and the Company’s legal counsel on cash management and various 

other matters in connection with the CCAA Proceedings; 

(d) consulting with SFP Canada and the CROs regarding the KERP (discussed further below);  

(e) corresponding with counsel for certain landlords regarding the Consulting Agreement, the Sale Guidelines and 

the Liquidation Sale;  

(f) consulting with SFP Canada and its advisors with respect to the disclaimer of certain retail leases; 

(g) corresponding with Stikeman Elliott LLP (“Stikeman”), the Monitor’s independent legal counsel, in connection 

with its review of the security granted by SFP Canada in favour of American Greetings and other matters 

pertaining to the CCAA Proceedings;   

(h) corresponding and communicating with the CROs in connection with the Funds Transfer (discussed further 

below); 

(i) responding to calls and enquiries from creditors and other stakeholders in connection with the CCAA Proceedings;  

(j) maintaining the Monitor’s website at http://www.richter.ca/insolvencycase/sfp-canada-ltd/ where copies of the 

orders granted and other relevant documents in respect of SFP Canada’s CCAA Proceedings have been made 

available; 

(k) preparing this Third Report; and 

(l) other matters pertaining to the administration of SFP Canada’s CCAA Proceedings. 

 

 

http://www.richter.ca/insolvencycase/sfp-canada-ltd/
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The KERP 

16. Given the condensed timetable to complete the Liquidation Sale, the Schurman Group considered it critical to retain 

certain key employees (the “KERP Employees” and each, a “KERP Employee”) to assist with the orderly wind-down 

of the Schurman Group’s operations in both the United States and Canada.  The Schurman Group further believed that 

additional incentives were required to ensure the KERP Employees continued their employment during the Chapter 11 

Proceedings and CCAA Proceedings generally. 

17. To ensure retention of the KERP Employees through the completion of the Schurman Group’s Chapter 11 Proceedings 

(and the CCAA Proceedings), SFP US developed, and sought the US Court’s approval of, the KERP.  The KERP 

provides for twenty-eight (28) highly qualified and skilled personnel essential to the Schurman Group’s operations and 

wind-down / liquidation activities to receive retention payments totaling approximately USD$284,000, with the value of 

payments ranging from USD$1,920.00 to USD$24,230.77 per KERP Employee. 

18. The KERP provides for retention payments to be paid to each of the KERP Employees at specific dates (depending on 

the nature of the specific KERP Employee’s role and tasks).  In order to receive payments pursuant to the KERP, among 

other things, the KERP Employees must remain employed by the US Debtors (as defined below) on the date their KERP 

entitlement becomes payable.  

19. On February 14, 2020, the US Court approved the KERP (the “KERP Approval Order”).  A copy of the KERP Approval 

Order as well as the motion materials filed in support thereof are attached hereto as Appendix “F”. 

20. As noted in the Monitor’s First Report, the Schurman Group is a highly integrated business managed out of the United 

States where the Schurman Group maintained its head office and where all material decisions regarding business related 

matters were made. In addition, all of SFP Canada’s back office functions, including finance / accounting, human 

resources, information technology and logistics, among others, are performed or managed by Schurman Group 

employees based out of the United States.  

21. In consideration of the foregoing, the Company is seeking an order from this Court to allocate 30% of the KERP to SFP 

Canada based on the historical sales mix between the United States and Canada and the results of the Liquidation Sale. 

The Monitor is supportive of the allocation of the KERP to SFP Canada on the basis that the employees included in the 

KERP comprise individuals involved in back-office functions such as finance / accounting, human resources, information 

technology, etc., that performed critical functions in support of both SFP Canada and SFP US (such as processing 

payroll, payment of payables, IT support for stores, etc.) throughout the Liquidation Sale.  In the event this Court 

approves the allocation of the KERP to Canada, the Monitor understands that the Company will seek an order for SFP 

Canada to distribute its portion of the KERP at a later date. 
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The Funds Transfer 

22. As reported in the Monitor’s First Report, on January 17, 2020, SFP Canada executed the Funds Transfer to SFP US.  

According to the CROs, the Funds Transfer was made on account of (a) repayment for certain costs previously paid by 

SFP US for the benefit of SFP Canada, and (b) prepayment of certain costs to be paid by SFP US for the benefit of SFP 

Canada during the CCAA Proceedings. 

23. After becoming aware of the Funds Transfer, the Monitor contacted the CROs to request that information and 

documentation supporting the Funds Transfer be provided to the Monitor.  In addition, as noted in the Monitor’s Second 

Report, counsel for certain creditors of SFP Canada have contacted the Monitor and its counsel to, among other things, 

request additional information in connection with the Funds Transfer, including the views of both the Monitor and SFP 

Canada as to the bona fides of the Funds Transfer. 

24. The Monitor notes that the Amended and Restated Initial Order provides that, except as expressly permitted therein, 

SFP Canada shall not make any further payments to, or on account of, any related party until further Order of the Court. 

As of the date of this Third Report, the Monitor is not aware of any payments made by SFP Canada to any related party 

since the Filing Date. 

25. The Monitor has reviewed various documents and other information (the “Documents”) provided by the CROs in 

support of the Funds Transfer and communicated extensively with the CROs and SFP Canada’s legal counsel, Osler 

Hoskin & Harcourt LLP (“Osler”), in connection with both the Documents and the Funds Transfer.  

26. Based on its review of the Documents and its discussions with the CROs and Osler, the Monitor understands that SFP 

Canada has historically paid funds to SFP US in consideration of, among other things, certain shared services provided 

by SFP US personnel for the benefit of SFP Canada.  A schedule summarizing the historical payments from SFP Canada 

to SFP US during the period from November to February (the “Period”) for the fiscal years 2018, 2019 and 2020 (the 

Company’s fiscal year is from February to January) is set out below (please note that the amounts are reported in 

Canadian dollars):  

 

(in 000s; $CAN)

Month FY 2018 FY 2019 FY 2020

November -                      1,750              -                      

December 6,000              4,500              2,000              

January -                      -                      3,959              

February 1,500              3,000              -                      

Total 7,500              9,250              5,959              
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27. As set out in the above schedule, SFP Canada paid approximately CAN$7.5 million and CAN$9.3 million to SFP US 

during the Period for fiscal 2018 and fiscal 2019, respectively.  Including the Funds Transfer, the amount paid by SFP 

Canada to SFP US during the Period in fiscal 2020 was approximately CAN$6.0 million. 

28. In response to the Monitor’s request for information / documentation to support the Funds Transfer, the CROs prepared 

a schedule detailing the expense categories that the Funds Transfer was meant to address, which is summarized below 

(please note that the amounts set forth below are in US dollars and represent the expense amounts allocated to SFP 

Canada): 

 

29. Based on its communications with SFP Canada and the CROs, the Monitor notes the following in connection with the 

Documents provided in support of the Funds Transfer: 

(a) Pre-filing Fees Paid for the Benefit of SFP Canada: 

The amount noted (USD$530,000) represents pre-filing professional fees paid by SFP US on behalf of SFP 

Canada to Mackinac, Osler, Proskauer Rose LLP (SFP Canada’s US counsel (“Proskauer”)), the Monitor and 

Stikeman.   

The pre-filing fees paid by SFP US on behalf of SFP Canada in respect of Osler, the Monitor and Stikeman have 

been allocated 100% to SFP Canada.  The pre-filing fees paid to Mackinac and Proskauer have been allocated 

40% to SFP Canada. The Monitor has been advised that these fees relate to activities undertaken in support of 

the Schurman Group’s pursuit of a third party interested in acquiring the Schurman Group’s business in both the 

US and Canada. The CRO advised the Monitor that the Mackinac and Proskauer pre-filing fees paid for the benefit 

of SFP Canada related to a global transaction for the entire Schurman Group. While time was not tracked 

specifically to each entity, both SFP Canada and SFP US would have benefited equally had a deal been 

consummated.  

 

 

(in 000s; $USD)

Expense Category Amount

Pre-Filing Professional Fees Paid for the Benefit of SFP Canada 530           

Shared Service Costs Historically Charged to SFP Canada (for the period December 2019 -  March 2020) 600           

Consultant Expense Escrow 225           

Inventory / Inventory Related Costs 947           

Pre-Filing Shared Service Costs not Historically Charged to SFP Canada 1,123       

Total 3,425       
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(b) Shared Service Costs Historically Charged to SFP Canada (for the period December 2019 – March 2020): 

The amount noted (USD$600,000) represents an allocation of the costs for the internal corporate services 

performed by SFP US personnel for the benefit of SFP Canada, including activities related to the finance, 

executive, human resources, real estate and information technology functions (the “Corporate Shared 

Services”) for the period December 2019 to March 2020.    

The Monitor has been advised that the amount allocated covers the months of December 2019, January 2020, 

February 2020 and March 2020.  The Monitor further understands that the amount allocated for both December 

2019 and January 2020 (USD$180,0000/month) is based on the average monthly amount recorded in the 

Schurman Group’s financial statements for corporate shared services for the ten-month period ending November 

30, 2019.  The amount allocated for both February 2020 and March 2020 (USD$120,000/month) took into 

consideration that SFP Canada’s need for the Corporate Shared Services would be reduced and ultimately 

eliminated as the Company completed the Liquidation Sale and the wind-down of its business activities. 

SFP Canada’s financial statements for the fiscal 2019 year report an average monthly expense for the Corporate 

Shared Services comparable with above estimates.  

(c) Consultant Expense Escrow: 

Pursuant to the terms of the Consulting Agreement, SFP US paid the Consultant USD$500,000 (the “Special 

Purpose Payment”) to be held by the Consultant, as security for the obligations of the Schurman Group under 

the Consultant Agreement until the final settlement of the Consultant’s fees and reimbursable costs has been 

completed.    

The Monitor has been advised by the CROs that, following discussions between the Schurman Group and the 

Consultant, an additional US$250,000 was paid by SFP US to the Consultant, as a supplement to the Special 

Purpose Payment, to account for, among other things, higher than anticipated legal fees in Canada.  

The amount noted (USD$225,000) represents a 30% allocation of the aggregate Special Purpose Payment to 

SFP Canada.  The Monitor understands that the 30% allocation is based on SFP Canada’s portion of total 

Schurman Group sales for the 10-month period ending November 30, 2019. 

(d) Inventory and Inventory Related Costs: 

The amount noted (USD$947,000) represents (i) approximately US$710,000 of inventory (at cost) transferred 

from SFP US to SFP Canada subsequent to the Filing Date for inclusion in the Liquidation Sale, and (ii) 

approximately USD$237,000 in freight costs associated with the inventory transfers.  
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(e) Pre-Filing Shared Service Costs not Historically Charged to SFP Canada: 

The amount noted (USD$1,123,000) represents a 30% allocation of the costs for certain shared services 

performed by SFP US personnel for the benefit of SFP Canada, including marketing, customer service, 

merchandising, and logistics (collectively, the “Other Shared Services”). 

The Monitor understands that, historically, the Schurman Group has not charged SFP Canada for the Other 

Shared Services.    

30. Based on its review of the Documents provided and its discussions with the CROs and Osler, the Monitor is satisfied 

that the allocation of expenses to SFP Canada in respect of the: (a) Pre-Filing Professional Fees Paid for the Benefit of 

SFP Canada; (b) Shared Service Costs Historically Charged to SFP Canada (for the period December 2019 to March 

2020); (c) Consultant Expense Escrow; and (d) Inventory and related costs, summarized above, is not unreasonable. 

Based on its review of the Documents provided and its discussions with the CROs and Osler to date, the Monitor is not 

satisfied that the allocation of the Other Shared Services to SFP Canada is appropriate, as SFP Canada was not 

historically charged for these services. 

31. The Funds Transfer was USD$3.0 million. The aggregate of the allocated costs, other than in respect of the Other Shared 

Services, is USD$2.3 million. In light of the result of the security review discussed below, which could result in a 

significant portion of the proceeds of the Liquidation Sale being paid to American Greetings, whether or not the allocation 

of the Other Shared Services to SFP Canada can be justified may be a moot point.  

The Security Review 

32. As noted in the Monitor’s First Report, as at November 30, 2020 (the most recent date for which financial information is 

available), SFP Canada had liabilities totaling approximately USD$11.8 million, including approximately USD$9.1 million 

owing to American Greetings. 

33. As also noted in the Monitor’s First Report, on June 25, 2019, SFP Canada (along with certain related US entities, 

collectively, the “AG Borrowers”) and American Greetings entered into a security agreement  (the “American 

Greetings Security”), pursuant to which American Greetings was granted a continuing lien and security interest over 

the AG Borrowers’ present and after-acquired property to secure, among other things, the payment and performance of 

the Schurman Group’s obligations pursuant to various agreements between the Schurman Group and American 

Greetings (including with respect to purchase orders). 

34. The Monitor understands that prior to entering into the American Greetings Security, American Greetings supplied goods 

and services to the Schurman Group on an unsecured basis. 
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35. As noted in the Monitor’s First Report, the Monitor instructed Stikeman to review the American Greetings Security in the 

jurisdictions in which SFP Canada had retail operations. Stikeman has provided the Monitor with legal opinions in respect 

of the Provinces of Ontario, British Columbia and Alberta, and agent opinions from Ohio counsel (the American Greetings 

Security is governed by Ohio law) and local counsel in Saskatchewan, Manitoba, Nova Scotia and Newfoundland and 

Labrador, which conclude, subject to standard qualifications and limitations, that the American Greetings Security is valid 

in all provinces in which SFP Canada had retail operations, except Quebec, and enforceable under Ohio law. 

VI. THE LIQUIDATION SALE  

36. The Liquidation Sale commenced on January 16, 2020 in each of SFP Canada’s 76 retail stores and concluded on 

February 29, 2020, in accordance with the Consulting Agreement (the “Liquidation Termination Date”). 

37. SFP Canada, with the approval of the Monitor, sent disclaimer notices to its landlords disclaiming all its retail store leases 

effective February 29, 2020. The Monitor understands that the leases of certain retail stores may have expired, according 

to their terms, prior to the Liquidation Termination Date. 

38. The Monitor understands that at the start of the Liquidation Sale, the Company had Merchandise with a cost value of 

approximately $5.2 million (retail value of approximately $27.9 million). The Monitor further understands, based on 

information provided by the Consultant, that the net realizations from the Company’s Merchandise during the Liquidation 

Sale totalled approximately $8.1 million (excluding an applicable sales taxes). In accordance with the Consulting 

Agreement, the Consultant also assisted SFP Canada in selling certain owned FF&E located at the Closing Stores for a 

fee of 15% of gross proceeds realized therefrom. The Monitor understands that approximately $144,000 (excluding any 

applicable sales tax) was realized from the sale of SFP Canada’s FF&E. 

39. The terms of the Consulting Agreement provided that SFP Canada was responsible for all costs and expenses in 

connection with the Liquidation Sale, including certain Consultant-controlled costs for, primarily, advertising and 

supervision, which were subject to an agreed-upon budget.  

40. Since the commencement of the Liquidation Sale, the Consultant has been paid its fees and reimbursable costs on a 

near-weekly basis. In aggregate, as of the date of this Third Report, the Company has paid to the Consultant 

approximately $465,000 in connection with its fees and reimbursable expenses in accordance with the Consulting 

Agreement. As at the date of this Third Report and as noted in the March 26 Boucher Affidavit, the final settlement of 

the Consultant’s fees and reimbursable costs is in the process of being completed.    
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VII. THE CHAPTER 11 PROCEEDINGS  

41. As noted above, on January 23, 2020, SFP US and SFP Franchise Corporation (collectively, the “US Debtors”) 

commenced the Chapter 11 Proceedings to pursue an orderly wind-down / liquidation of their retail stores in the United 

States. 

42. As noted in the March 26 Boucher Affidavit, the significant developments in the Chapter 11 Proceedings since the filing 

of the Monitor’s Second Report, include the following: 

(a) on February 14, 2020, the US Court granted final orders in respect of the US Debtors “first day” motions (and / 

including the KERP Approval Order); 

(b) on February 27, 2020, the US Court approved the sale of certain US retail leases and FF&E to Paper Source, 

Inc., which sale did not include any Canadian leases or assets; and 

(c) on March 13, 2020, the US Court approved the sublease of the US Debtors’ headquarters and distribution centre 

to Fidelitone Order Fulfullment, LLC. 

43. As also noted in the March 26 Boucher Affidavit, the US Debtors have filed various motions that they expect will be heard 

by the US Court during the extension of the Stay Period, if granted, including (a) a motion to set deadlines and procedures 

for filing proofs of claim that will be heard on March 30, 2020, and (b) a motion seeking approval of the sale of certain 

intellectual property assets that will be heard on April 30, 2020. 

44. The Monitor understands that no relief is being sought in the Chapter 11 Proceedings with respect to SFP Canada and, 

similarly, no relief is being sought in the CCAA Proceedings with respect to SFP US, save and except for the provisions 

in the Initial Order restricting transfers to related parties by SFP Canada and providing for SFP Canada’s continued use 

of trademarks.   

VIII. CASH RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS FROM JANUARY 18, 2020 TO MARCH 20, 2020  

45. As noted in the Monitor’s First Report, SFP Canada, with the assistance of the Monitor, prepared a statement of its 

projected cash flows for the period January 18, 2020 to April 17, 2020 (the “Initial Cash Flow Forecast”) which was 

filed with the Court in support of the Company’s application for the Initial Order and the Liquidation Sale Approval Order.  

46. The Company has provided the Monitor with its cooperation and access to its books and records.  The Monitor has 

implemented procedures for monitoring the Company’s receipts and disbursements on a weekly basis.  The Monitor has 

also worked with the CROs to prepare a report comparing SFP Canada’s actual results to its prior projections, as detailed 

in the Initial Cash Flow Forecast. 
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47. A comparison of SFP Canada’s actual cash receipts and disbursements, as compared to the Initial Cash Flow Forecast, 

for the period ending March 20, 2020 is summarized as follows: 

 

48. As reflected in the summary table above, SFP Canada reported positive net cash flow of approximately $3.9 million for 

the nine-week period ending March 20, 2020 and had a cash balance of approximately $8.1 million, as at March 20, 

2020.  The actual cash balance is approximately $865,000 higher than forecast. 

49. The principal reasons for the favourable cash flow variance of approximately $865,000 include: 

(a) favourable variances due to lower than projected operating costs associated with the Liquidation Sale, including 

lower freight, store operating and other and payroll and benefits which was partially offset by lower than projected 

sales during the Liquidation Sale; and 

(b) timing differences associated with lower than projected disbursements for professional fees. The Monitor 

understands that this favourable variance will reverse during the remainder of the CCAA Proceedings, as set out 

in the Extended Cash Flow Forecast. 

 

SFP Canada Ltd.

Cash Flow Variances

For the period January 18, 2020 to March 20, 2020

(in $CAD 000's)

Budget Actual Variance

Receipts

Canada Retail Receipts 9,875 9,133 (742)

Total Receipts 9,875 9,133 (742)

Total Disbursements

Freight (236) (165) 71

Rent & Utilities (1,247) (1,263) (16)

Store Expenses and Other (277) (84) 193

Payroll & Benefits (1,548) (1,406) 142

Liquidation Fee & Expenses (465) (513) (47)

Sales Tax Remittances (1,155) (1,168) (12)

Professional Fees (1,835) (604) 1,231

Miscellaneous / Other 0 0 0

Total Disbursements (6,764) (5,202) 1,562

Net Cash Flow 3,111 3,931 820

Beginning Cash Balance 4,144 4,250 106

Net Cash Flow 3,111 3,931 820

Over/(Under) Funding 0 (61) (61)

Ending Cash Balance 7,255 8,120 865
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50. to the Amended and Restated Initial Order, SFP Canada was authorized, with the consent of the Monitor, to make 

payments up to a maximum aggregate amount of $100,000 for critical expenses incurred prior to the Filing Date.  As at 

March 20, 2020, SFP Canada has made, in consultation with the Monitor, approximately $7,000 in payments relating to 

critical expenses incurred prior to the Filing Date, excluding pre-filing sales taxes paid in accordance with the Amended 

and Restated Initial Order. 

IX. SFP CANADA’S REQUEST TO EXTEND THE STAY PERIOD TO JUNE 30, 2020 

51. The current Stay Period expires on March 31, 2020.  SFP Canada is seeking an extension of the Stay Period to June 

30, 2020. 

52. As the Initial Cash Flow Forecast only runs until April 17, 2020, SFP Canada, with the assistance of the Monitor, has 

prepared the Extended Cash Flow Forecast, a copy of which is attached hereto as Appendix “G” and is summarized 

below:   

 

53. As the Liquidation Sale has been completed and SFP Canada has already vacated all of their retail stores and terminated 

all but a few key employees essential to concluding the orderly wind down of SFP Canada’s operations, the Extended 

Cash Flow Forecast assumes there are no remaining funds to be collected and limited payment of those costs necessary 

to complete the wind down of SFP Canada’s operations. 

SFP Canada LTD.

Extended Cash Flow Forecast

For the period March 21, 2020 to July 3, 2020

(in $CAD 000's)

15-Week Total

Receipts

Canadian Retail Receipts 0

Total Receipts 0

Operating Disbursements

Freight (71)

Store Expenses and Other (194)

Sales Tax Remittances (899)

Professional Fees (1,745)

Miscellaneous / Other (200)

Total Operating Disbursements (3,109)

Net Cash Flow (3,109)

Opening Cash Balance 8,120

Net Cash Flow (3,109)

Ending Cash Balance 5,011
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54. The Extended Cash Flow Forecast indicates that SFP Canada will have sufficient liquidity to fund both operating costs 

and the costs of the CCAA Proceedings during the extension of the Stay Period, if granted.  

55.  The Monitor is of the view that the extension of the Stay Period is appropriate in the circumstances and supports SFP 

Canada’s request for an extension of the Stay Period to June 30, 2020 for the following reasons: 

(a) SFP Canada has acted and continues to act in good faith and with due diligence to advance the responsible, 

controlled and orderly wind-down of its business; 

(b) the extension will provide the time necessary for SFP Canada to complete the orderly wind down of its operations, 

including completing the final reconciliation under the Consulting Agreement and finalizing its affairs under the 

supervision of the Monitor; and 

(c) the extension should not prejudice any group of creditors, as SFP Canada is projected to have sufficient funds to 

pay post-filing services and supplies, as contemplated by the Extended Cash Flow Forecast. 

X. MONITOR’S CONCLUSIONS AND RECOMMENDATIONS 

56. For the reasons set out in this Third Report, the Monitor is of the view that the relief requested by SFP Canada is both 

appropriate and reasonable and the Monitor therefore recommends that this Court approve (a) the allocation of 30% of 

the KERP to SFP Canada, and (b) the extension of the Stay Period to June 30, 2020.   

 

All of which is respectfully submitted on this 27th day of March, 2020. 

 
Richter Advisory Group Inc. 
in its capacity as Monitor of  
SFP Canada Ltd. 
and not in its personal capacity 
 
 

     
___________________________________   ______________________________ 
Adam Sherman, MBA, CIRP, LIT    Pritesh Patel, MBA, CFA, CIRP, LIT 
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                                                 Court File No. CV-20-634980-00CL 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 
 

IN THE MATTER OF THE COMPANIES’ CREDITORS ARRANGEMENT ACT,  
R.S.C. 1985, c. C-36, AS AMENDED  

 
AND IN THE MATTER OF A PLAN OF COMPROMISE OR ARRANGEMENT OF  

SFP CANADA LTD. 
 

AFFIDAVIT OF ADAM SHERMAN  
(sworn June 25, 2020) 

I, Adam Sherman, of the City of Vaughan, in the Province of Ontario, MAKE OATH AND SAY: 

1. I am a Senior Vice President at Richter Advisory Group Inc. (“Richter”), the Court-appointed monitor (the 

“Monitor”) in the Companies’ Creditors Arrangement Act (R.S.C. 1985, c. C-36, as amended) proceedings (the 

“CCAA Proceedings”) of SFP Canada Ltd. (“SFP Canada” or the “Company”) and, as such, I have knowledge 

of the matters hereinafter deposed to, except where stated to be on information and belief and whereso stated I 

verily believe it to be true. 

2. This affidavit is filed in connection with SFP Canada’s motion seeking approval of, among other things, the 

accounts of the Monitor and its counsel, Stikeman Elliott LLP (“Stikeman”). 

3. Unless otherwise stated, all monetary amounts contained herein (including exhibits) are expressed in Canadian 

dollars. 

4. Richter was appointed as Monitor pursuant to an order of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) 

(the “Court”) granted in the within proceedings dated January 23, 2020 (the “Initial Order”), as amended 

pursuant to an endorsement of the Honourable Justice Hainey dated January 31, 2020 (the “Amended Initial 

Order”). 

5. Attached as Exhibit “A” hereto is a summary listing of Richter’s invoices for the within matter for the period from 

January 6, 2020 to June 22, 2020 (the “Period”), including invoice date and amount of the invoice (the 

“Accounts”). As shown in the summary listing, Richter’s total fees and disbursements for the Period are 

$350,230.50 and $23,325.59, respectively, each excluding applicable taxes. 
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6. Richter, in its capacity as Monitor, has filed four (4) reports with the Court (including the Monitor’s Fourth Report 

to Court dated June 25, 2020 in support of the within motion; collectively, the “Court Reports”).  Details of the 

activities undertaken and services provided by the Monitor, as applicable, in the within proceedings are described 

in the Court Reports and incorporated herein by reference. 

7. In the course of performing its duties pursuant to the Initial Order and the Amended Initial Order, Richter’s staff 

has expended a total of 525.90 professional hours during the Period at an average hourly rate of $665.96. 

Attached as Exhibit “B” is a table detailing the billing rates and total hours of each of the professionals at Richter 

who performed services in the within proceedings. 

8. Attached as Exhibit “C” hereto are true copies of Richter’s invoices, which include a fair and accurate description 

of the services provided along with hours and applicable rates claimed by the Monitor, for the within matter. These 

invoices have been submitted to the Company and paid in the normal course since the commencement of the 

CCAA Proceedings as authorized by the Initial Order and the Amended Initial Order.  

9. The Monitor requests that this Court approve its Accounts for the Period, in the total amount of $422,118.38, 

inclusive of applicable taxes, for services rendered and recorded during the Period. 

10. Stikeman has provided legal services to the Monitor throughout the CCAA Proceedings in a manner consistent 

with the instructions of the Monitor.  Stikeman has prepared an affidavit with respect to its fees and disbursements 

charged in connection with services rendered during the period from January 15, 2020 to June 22, 2020.  The 

Monitor has reviewed the invoices rendered by Stikeman during the period and believes the services performed 

are consistent with the instructions given by the Monitor.  The Monitor is also seeking approval of Stikeman’s 

fees and disbursements on the within motion in the amount of $171,047.40, inclusive of applicable taxes. 

11. The Monitor’s fees and disbursements for the period from and after June 23, 2020 to the completion of all work 

relating to the CCAA Proceedings will be calculated and billed at the standard rates currently in effect.  Barring 

any delays, disputes or unforeseen circumstances in connection with this matter and taking into account the 

remaining work to be done in connection with this matter, I estimate that those fees and disbursements will not 

exceed $75,000 (excluding applicable taxes) (the “Remaining Fees and Disbursements”), as follows: 

a) Richter - $50,000; and 

b) Stikeman - $25,000. 
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12. The above estimates take into consideration the reasonable professional and legal fees required to complete all 

work relating to the CCAA Proceedings up to the effective date of the Monitor’s discharge.  If the actual Remaining 

Fees and Disbursements are less than the above estimates, no further Court approval of fees is required.  If the 

actual Remaining Fees and Disbursements exceed the estimates, the Monitor will seek the consent of SFP 

Canada to pay same, without further Order of the Court.  

13. To the best of my knowledge, the rates charged by Richter and Stikeman are comparable to the rates charged 

by other firms for the provision of similar restructuring services. 

14. I verily believe that the fees and disbursements incurred by Richter and Stikeman, including the estimated 

Remaining Fees and Disbursements, are fair and reasonable in the circumstances. 

15. This Affidavit is sworn in connection with a motion for an Order of this Court to, among other things, approve the 

fees and disbursements of the Monitor and those of its legal counsel and for no improper purpose. 

 

I confirm that while connected via video 

technology, Adam Sherman showed me the front 

and back of his government-issued photo identity 

document and that I am reasonably satisfied it is 

the same person and the document is current 

and valid. I confirm that I have reviewed each 

page of this affidavit with Adam Sherman and 

verify that the pages are identical. 

 

SWORN BEFORE ME by video conference from 

the City of Vaughan, Ontario,  to the Community 

of Eugenia (Grey County), Ontario, on June 25, 

2020. 

 

  
Commissioner for taking affidavits  

in the Province of Ontario 

  
Adam Sherman 
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This is Exhibit “A” referred to in the Affidavit of  
Adam Sherman, sworn on June 25, 2020     
       

 

 

 

_______      

Commissioner for Taking Affidavits, etc. 
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Richter Advisory Group Inc. Exhibit A

in its capacity as CCAA Monitor of

SFP Canada Ltd.

Statement of accounts

Invoice # Period Fees

Technology & 

Administrative Fee Disbursements Sub total HST Total

20404898 January 6, 2020 to January 31, 2020 146,575.50$ 7,328.78$                        -$                     153,904.28$  20,007.55$   173,911.83$     

20404938 February 1, 2020 to February 7, 2020 15,717.50$   785.88$                           -$                     16,503.38$     2,145.44$      18,648.82$       

20404985 February 8, 2020 to February 21, 2020 26,482.25$   1,599.92$                        5,516.09$          33,598.26$     4,367.77$      37,966.03$       

20405062 February 22, 2020 to March 20, 2020 45,979.50$   2,298.98$                        -$                     48,278.48$     6,276.21$      54,554.69$       

20405228 March 21, 2020 to April 30, 2020 48,418.75$   2,420.94$                        -$                     50,839.69$     6,609.16$      57,448.85$       

20405238 May 1, 2020 to May 10, 2020 21,314.00$   1,065.70$                        -$                     22,379.70$     2,909.36$      25,289.06$       

20405302 May 11, 2020 to May 31, 2020 24,120.25$   1,207.07$                        21.09$                25,348.41$     3,295.29$      28,643.70$       

20405354 June 1, 2020 to June 22, 2020 21,622.75$   1,081.14$                        -$                     22,703.89$     2,951.51$      25,655.40$       

Total 350,230.50$  17,788.41$                      5,537.18$           373,556.09$   48,562.29$    422,118.38$      
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This is Exhibit “B” referred to in the Affidavit of  
Adam Sherman, sworn on June 25, 2020     
       

 

 

 

_______      

Commissioner for Taking Affidavits, etc. 
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Richter Advisory Group Inc. Exhibit B

in its capacity as CCAA Monitor of

SFP Canada Ltd.

Statement of accounts

Staff member

Number of 

hours Hourly rate Amount

Senior Vice President

A. Sherman 143.80 895.00$          128,701.00$  

P. Patel 124.20 825.00$          102,465.00$  

Senior Associate / Associate

A. Zeldin 216.75 495.00$          107,291.25$  

E. Finley 6.25 375.00$          2,343.75$      

P. Lareau 3.25 375.00$          1,218.75$      

Analyst

K. Ho 7.35 295.00$          2,168.25$      

Administration

C. O'Donnell 18.70 250.00$          4,675.00$      

K. Le 5.10 250.00$          1,275.00$      

N. Fournier 0.50 185.00$          92.50$            

Total 525.90 350,230.50$ 

Blended average hourly rate: 665.96$          
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This is Exhibit “C” referred to in the Affidavit of  
Adam Sherman, sworn on June 25, 2020     
       

 

 

 

_______      

Commissioner for Taking Affidavits, etc. 
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SFP Canada Ltd.
300 Oak Bluff Lane
Goodlettsville, TN 37072

Date: 02/03/2020
Invoice No.: 20404898

Engagement No.: 2021822
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered to January 31, 2020. $ 146,575.50

Sub-Total 146,575.50
Technology and Administrative Fees 7,328.78
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 20,007.55

Total Due CAD $ 173,911.83
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Invoice No.: 20404898
Date: 02/03/2020

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Sherman 83.50 $ 895.00 $ 74,732.50
Adam Zeldin 16.30  495.00  8,068.50
Carol O'Donnell 12.40  250.00  3,100.00
Eric Finley 6.25  375.00  2,343.75
Ken Le 3.55  250.00  887.50
Kristina Ho 7.35  295.00  2,168.25
Pritesh Patel 67.00  825.00  55,275.00

196.35 $ 146,575.50
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Invoice No.: 20404898
Date: 02/03/2020

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

01/06/2020 Adam Sherman 1.00 $ 895.00 $ 895.00
Calls with Osler re various matters. Draft
engagement letter. Emails with Osler.
Discussions with Richter team.

01/07/2020 Adam Sherman 0.50  895.00  447.50
Emails/discussions with Osler.

01/08/2020 Adam Sherman 2.50  895.00  2,237.50
Emails with Osler. Preliminary review of cash
flows, retail store summary, other Company
info. Call with Osler and the Company's US
advisors re various matters. Emails with
Richter team. Email to the Company and its
advisors re Richter engagement.

01/09/2020 Adam Sherman 3.50  895.00  3,132.50
Email from Landis re landlord matters.
Review most recent monthly financial
reporting package, FY '19 financials, creditor
list, employee list and other Company info.
Calls with Osler. Call with Osler/US advisors.
Emails/discussions with Richter team.

01/10/2020 Adam Sherman 1.50  895.00  1,342.50
Calls with Osler. Email from Mackinac re
landlord matters. Email from Oslers re PPSA
search results. Call with Osler/US advsiors.

01/13/2020 Adam Sherman 2.00  895.00  1,790.00
Emails with Osler/Mackinac re various
matters. Calls with Osler. Emails/discusisons
with Richter team. Continue review of
Company financial/other info.

01/13/2020 Eric Finley 1.00  375.00  375.00
Call with Osler and US advisors re filing
timeline and updates.

01/14/2020 Adam Sherman 1.50  895.00  1,342.50
Emails with Mackinac. Calls with Osler.
Review updated landlord tracker. Call with
Osler/US advisors re status update,
intercompany claims, next steps and other
matters. Emails/discussions with Richter
team.

01/14/2020 Eric Finley 0.75  375.00  281.25
Review of Company fianancials, including
cashflows, balance sheet and income
statement.

01/15/2020 Adam Sherman 2.50  895.00  2,237.50
Emails with Osler/Mackinac re cash flow
comments. Email from Osler re draft
GB/HIlco consulting agreement, including
review/comments on same. Calls/email with
Stikeman. Call with Osler/US advisors.

01/16/2020 Adam Sherman 5.00  895.00  4,475.00
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Invoice No.: 20404898
Date: 02/03/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review updated cash flows. Call with
Osler/US advisors re cash flows,
intercompany claims, etc. Emails with Osler
re intercompany claims. Emails with
Stikeman. Call with Osler/Stikeman re update
and next steps. Emails/discussions with
Richter team.

01/16/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.00  825.00  825.00
Review of CF and discussion with
A.Sherman on same.  Call with counsel to
discuss next steps.

01/16/2020 Eric Finley 1.00  375.00  375.00
Call with Osler and US advisors re filing
timeline and updates. Review of revised
cashflow forecast.

01/17/2020 Adam Sherman 5.00  895.00  4,475.00
Emails/call with Mackinac re revised cash
flow, intercompany claims analysis and other
matters. Emails/calls with Osler/Stikeman re
revised cash flow, intercompany claims
analysis, transfer of funds, consulting
agreement. Discussions with Richter team.

01/17/2020 Pritesh Patel 4.00  825.00  3,300.00
Review of draft consulting agreement,
background information on case.  Review of
revised CF, interco analysis and call with
Mackinac on same.  Call with Osler on status
of materials, information requests.  Review of
revised consulting agreement from GB.

01/18/2020 Adam Sherman 2.50  895.00  2,237.50
Emails from Mackinac/Oslers re Canadian
retail leases and Consulting Agreement.
Review revised/updated cash flow, including
emails with Richter team.

01/18/2020 Pritesh Patel 2.00  825.00  1,650.00
Review of CF model and comments to
Mackinac on same.

01/19/2020 Adam Sherman 1.50  895.00  1,342.50
Emails from Mackinac re revised/updated
cash flow and intercompay analysis. Emails
with Osler re draft initial order/liquidation sale
approval order.

01/20/2020 Carol O'Donnell 0.10  250.00  25.00
Prepare URL for website.

01/20/2020 Adam Sherman 6.00  895.00  5,370.00
Emails with Osler. Review draft initial
order/liquidation order/sale guidelines,
includng emails with Stikeman on same.
Emails/call with Mackinac re cash flow,
intercompany claims analysis, etc.
Emails/discussions with Richter team. Draft
report.
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Invoice No.: 20404898
Date: 02/03/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

01/20/2020 Pritesh Patel 7.00  825.00  5,775.00
Review of response from Mackinac re CF
questions. Review of revised CF and interco
analysis, call with Mackinac on same.
Review of draft orders, sale guidelines and
discussion with A.Sherman on same.
Review of employee, inventory, banking info.

01/20/2020 Kristina Ho 2.80  295.00  826.00
Call with Mackinac re updated cashflow and
intercompany analysis. Review updated
cashlow.

01/21/2020 Adam Sherman 8.00  895.00  7,160.00
Emails with Osler re initial orders, affidavit,
cash flow, etc. Call with
Osler/Mackinac/Stikeman re cash
flow/intercompany analysis/etc. Emails/calls
with Stikeman re various matters.
Emails/discussions with Richter team. Draft
report.

01/21/2020 Pritesh Patel 8.00  825.00  6,600.00
Call with CRO, counsels re interco analysis
and transfers. Review of current draft
materials, discussions with A.Sherman and
email with counsel on same. Review of CF
and assist in preparing filing version.
Emails/calls with Oslers on numerous
matters.

01/21/2020 Kristina Ho 1.00  295.00  295.00
Review draft Boucher affidavit and prepare
reports on the Company's cash flow forecast.

01/22/2020 Adam Sherman 6.50  895.00  5,817.50
Sign Consent - email to Osler. Emails/calls
with Osler and Stikeman re initial
order/liquidaiton order/etc. Emails with
Mackinac re further revised cash flow.
Emails/discussions with Richter team. Draft
report.

01/22/2020 Pritesh Patel 10.00  825.00  8,250.00
Assist with preparation of CF reports, review
of Monitor's report on CF.  Review and
comment on various drafts of affidavit,
orders, and other materials.  Review of
financials for report.  Numerous calls and
emails with Osler re CF and other materials.

01/22/2020 Kristina Ho 2.80  295.00  826.00
Review revised affidavit. Prepare summary of
financials for report.

01/23/2020 Carol O'Donnell 0.40  250.00  100.00
Various administrative matters. Discussions
with A. Sherman.

01/23/2020 Adam Sherman 10.00  895.00  8,950.00
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Invoice No.: 20404898
Date: 02/03/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Emails with Mackinac re cash flow.
Emails/calls with Osler/Stikeman re orders.
Email from Osler re CCAA application.
Attend in Court, including discussions with
counsel. Update report - emails with
Osler/Stikeman. Emails/discussions with
Richter team.

01/23/2020 Pritesh Patel 12.00  825.00  9,900.00
Review affidavit, update/edits to First Report.
Review comments from counsel, circulate
updated draft and compile appendices. Call
with CRO to finalize CF and reports.
Attendance in Court re Initial Order.
Discussion with Richter team on next steps.

01/23/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.20  495.00  1,089.00
Prepare Form 1, Form 2, newspaper ad.
Discussions with Richter team including
review of application materials in connection
with the foregoing.

01/23/2020 Kristina Ho 0.75  295.00  221.25
Prpeare 13-week cashflow forecast for report
filing.

01/24/2020 Carol O'Donnell 3.20  250.00  800.00
Email documents to OSB. Post documents to
website. Obtain 1-800#. Coordinate
newspaper ad. Various administrative
matters.

01/24/2020 Adam Sherman 4.00  895.00  3,580.00
Finalize/sign report. Emails/discussions with
Richter team. Attend in Court re liquidation
order, including discussions with counsel.
Approve/sign Form 1 and newspaper ad.
Email from D. Bish re Ameican Greetings
security/intercompany payments.

01/24/2020 Pritesh Patel 4.00  825.00  3,300.00
Review and update report based on
comments from Osler.  Finalize and sign
report for service.  Attendance in Court for
Liquidation Approval Sale Order.  Discussion
with Richter team re creditor notices, OSB
filing, etc.

01/24/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.50  495.00  1,237.50
Update/finalize form 1 and newspaper ad.
Review creditors list and emails with CRO in
connection with same. Draft notice to
creditors. Review Monitor's Report and
Liquidation Sale Approval Order application
materials.

01/27/2020 Carol O'Donnell 1.50  250.00  375.00
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Invoice No.: 20404898
Date: 02/03/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Finalize arrangements for newspaper ad.
Communications with OSB re various filing
matters. Discussions with A. Zeldin. Various
administrative matters.

01/27/2020 Ken Le 1.20  250.00  300.00
Review and modify creditor listing and upload
to Ascend.

01/27/2020 Adam Sherman 1.50  895.00  1,342.50
Emails from Osler re employee termination
letters, draft endorsement, etc. Emails with
Stikeman.  Emails with Richter team re
various matters.

01/27/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.50  825.00  1,237.50
Review and edits to draft creditor notice.
Approval of form and cost for newspaper
advertisement.  Review and comment on
employee letter.

01/27/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.40  495.00  693.00
Review newspaper ad draft/quote. Prepare
creditors lists, correspond with
Mackinac/Richter team re same. Discussions
with Richter team.

01/27/2020 Eric Finley 3.50  375.00  1,312.50
Review of various docs/discussions with
Richter team re monitoring. communications
with Mackinac re various matters. Respond
to inquiries re CCAA filing.

01/28/2020 Carol O'Donnell 1.50  250.00  375.00
Discussions with A. Zeldin. Preparation of
creditor lists for mailing. Post creditor list to
website and email to OSB. Various
administrative matters.

01/28/2020 Ken Le 1.75  250.00  437.50
Review and modify employee listing re
creditor notice. Various administrative
matters.

01/28/2020 Adam Sherman 5.50  895.00  4,922.50
Review/provide comments on creditor notice.
Emails/call with Stikeman re various matters.
Emails from Osler re lease disclaimers, draft
amended initial order, etc.
Emails/discussions with Richter team. Draft
Monitor's 2nd report.

01/28/2020 Pritesh Patel 3.50  825.00  2,887.50
Call with CRO to discuss CFs, update on
liquidation sale, timing for disclaimers etc.
Discussions with Richter team re creditor
mailing, drafting report, AG security review,
etc.

01/28/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.40  495.00  1,188.00

DocuSign Envelope ID: 5112F84F-771F-42F1-B232-5546C9D5B6DA



Invoice No.: 20404898
Date: 02/03/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Call with Mackinac/Osler re weekly
monitoring, store exit plan, other matters.
Review final creditors list, discussions with
Richter team re same. Correspond with
Mackinac re creditor mailing. Review/update
Form 2, emails with Osler/Mackinac re same.

01/29/2020 Carol O'Donnell 4.20  250.00  1,050.00
Preparation of mailing to creditors. File Form
2, post documents to website and email to
OSB. Various administrative matters.

01/29/2020 Ken Le 0.60  250.00  150.00
Prepare creditor mailing re landlords.

01/29/2020 Adam Sherman 6.00  895.00  5,370.00
Emails with Stikman re draft amended initial
order, funds transfer, etc. Finalize/sign Form
2. Emails/discussions with Richter team.
Emails from Osler/Mackinac re draft affidavit,
stay extension, lease disclaimers, etc.
Continue drafting 2nd report.

01/29/2020 Pritesh Patel 4.50  825.00  3,712.50
Review and comment on motion materials,
correspondence with Stikeman on same.
Review of GB liquidation reporting, CF
reporting and discussion wtih Richter team
on same.  Review and edits to 2nd Report.
Correspondence re funds transfer.

01/29/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.50  495.00  1,237.50
Finalize Form 2, correspond with
Mackinac/Osler and review Company
information re same. Review weekly variance
analysis, emails/calls with Mackinac re
same/other CF matters. Review/edit creditors
list. Dicsussions with Richter team.

01/30/2020 Adam Sherman 5.00  895.00  4,475.00
Email from landlord counsel re rent arrears,
etc. Emails with Stikeman/Osler re comments
on 2nd report, lease disclaimers, funds
transfer, etc. Emails/discussions with Richter
team. Finalize/sign Monitor's 2nd report.

01/30/2020 Pritesh Patel 5.50  825.00  4,537.50
Update report based on comments from
counsel. Review of disbursement request
and call with CRO on same. Execute lease
disclaimer. Calls with Osler re CF, funds
transfer and 2nd Report.  Finalize and sign
2nd Report.

01/30/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.50  495.00  1,237.50
Review current week disbursement summary
and supporting documents, including
calls/emails with Mackinac re same.
Discusisons with Richter team.

01/31/2020 Carol O'Donnell 1.50  250.00  375.00
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Invoice No.: 20404898
Date: 02/03/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Post documents to website and email to
OSB. Prepare mail affidavit and lists.

01/31/2020 Adam Sherman 2.00  895.00  1,790.00
Emails with Osler re entered amended and
restated initial order, lease disclaimers, etc.
Email from landlord counsel re rent arrears.
Emails/discussions with Richter team re
various matters.

01/31/2020 Pritesh Patel 4.00  825.00  3,300.00
Prep and attendance in Court re amended
inital order. Review revised disbursement
request for 1/31. Discussions with Richter
team. Calls with Osler re disclaimer notices,
KERP, etc. Calls with Mackinac re KERP,
CF.

01/31/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.80  495.00  1,386.00
Correspond with Mackinac/P. Patel re
planned disbursements for the week, review
documentation supporting same. Emails with
Mackinac/GB re sales to date and other
liquidation matters. Discussions with Richter
team.

Fees Total 196.35 $ 146,575.50
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Invoice No.: 20404898
Date: 02/03/2020

Remittance Form
SFP Canada Ltd.
300 Oak Bluff Lane
Goodlettsville, TN 37072

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 146,575.50
Technology and Administrative Fees 7,328.78
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 20,007.55

Total Due CAD $ 173,911.83

Payment Options

At this time, we ask that payment not be made by cheque.
Please use one of the payment options below. We appreciate your collaboration.
Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank

Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Credit Card payments can be made by contacting us as indicated below.
Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca
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SFP Canada Ltd.
300 Oak Bluff Lane
Goodlettsville, TN 37072

Date: 02/13/2020
Invoice No.: 20404938

Engagement No.: 2021822
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered to February 7, 2020. $ 15,717.50

Sub-Total 15,717.50
Technology and Administrative Fees 785.88
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 2,145.44

Total Due CAD $ 18,648.82

DocuSign Envelope ID: 5112F84F-771F-42F1-B232-5546C9D5B6DA



Invoice No.: 20404938
Date: 02/13/2020

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Sherman 6.40 $ 895.00 $ 5,728.00
Adam Zeldin 9.10  495.00  4,504.50
Ken Le 1.15  250.00  287.50
Pritesh Patel 6.30  825.00  5,197.50

22.95 $ 15,717.50
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Invoice No.: 20404938
Date: 02/13/2020

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

02/03/2020 Adam Sherman 1.20 $ 895.00 $ 1,074.00
Emails from Stikeman re account for period
ending 1/31/2020, AG security review, etc.
Call with Stikeman re support for funds
transfer. Discussons with Richter team re
various matters.

02/03/2020 Pritesh Patel 0.80  825.00  660.00
Discussion with A.Zeldin re CF and
disbursements.  Call with Osler re KERP and
next steps.  Review of email from counsel to
landlord re post-filing payments.

02/03/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.10  495.00  544.50
Correspond with Mackinac re proposed
disbursements, other matters. Review of
Amended Initial Order.

02/04/2020 Ken Le 0.90  250.00  225.00
Transfer funds. Prepare reconciliation. Issue
cheque. Email communication with A.
Sherman and P. Patel. Various
administrative matters.

02/04/2020 Adam Sherman 1.80  895.00  1,611.00
Emails with Stikeman re draft
communicaitons with
Osler/Mackinac/Landlord counsel. Email from
Osler. Email from D. Bish.
Emails/discussions with Richter team. Calls
with creditors.

02/04/2020 Pritesh Patel 3.00  825.00  2,475.00
Call with CRO re CF and payments.  Review
and comment on letter/emails from Stikeman
re pre-filing funds transfer.  Call with Osler re
letter, offer on leases and next steps.
Discussion with Richter team re creditor
inquiries, payments.

02/04/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.00  495.00  495.00
Respond to several creditor enquiries.
Discussions with Richter team.

02/05/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.00  825.00  825.00
Review of variance report, disbursement
request and discussion with A.Zeldin on
same.

02/05/2020 Adam Zeldin 3.10  495.00  1,534.50
Review weekly variance analysis and funding
request, including documentation supporting
same. Emails with P. Patel/Mackinac re
weekly variances and funding request.
Emails with Mackinac re other cash flow
matters. Emails with GB re daily reporting.

02/06/2020 Adam Sherman 2.40  895.00  2,148.00
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Invoice No.: 20404938
Date: 02/13/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Emails with creditors (utility providers). Email
from/discussions with L. Ellis re Enesco
(supplier), inluding emails/call with Stikeman
on same. Emails with Osler re Enesco.
Emails/discussions with Richter team.

02/06/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.50  825.00  1,237.50
Review of email from counsel to Enesco,
calls with Richter team and counsel on same.
Review of daily reporting from GB,
discussion with A.Zeldin on variance
reporting.

02/06/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.90  495.00  1,435.50
Review GB daily sales report, discuss same
with P. Patel. Emails/calls with Mackinac re
liquidation progress, disbursements, store
closures. Respond to several creditor
enquiries.

02/07/2020 Ken Le 0.25  250.00  62.50
Post incoming wire. Email communication
with A. Zeldin. Various administrative
matters.

02/07/2020 Adam Sherman 1.00  895.00  895.00
Emails from Stikeman re Unesco. Email from
Stikeman to L. Ellis. Email from Osler re
funds transfer. Discussions with Richter
team.

02/07/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.00  495.00  495.00
Respond to creditor enquiries. Review GB
daily sales report. Emails with Richter team
re administrative and other matters.

Fees Total 22.95 $ 15,717.50
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Invoice No.: 20404938
Date: 02/13/2020

Remittance Form
SFP Canada Ltd.
300 Oak Bluff Lane
Goodlettsville, TN 37072

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 15,717.50
Technology and Administrative Fees 785.88
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 2,145.44

Total Due CAD $ 18,648.82

Payment Options

At this time, we ask that payment not be made by cheque.
Please use one of the payment options below. We appreciate your collaboration.
Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank

Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Credit Card payments can be made by contacting us as indicated below.
Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca
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SFP Canada Ltd.
300 Oak Bluff Lane
Goodlettsville, TN 37072

Date: 02/28/2020
Invoice No.: 20404985

Engagement No.: 2021822
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered to February 21, 2020. $ 26,482.25

Disbursements  5,516.09

Sub-Total 31,998.34
Technology and Administrative Fees 1,599.92
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 4,367.77

Total Due CAD $ 37,966.03
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Invoice No.: 20404985
Date: 02/28/2020

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Sherman 7.00 $ 895.00 $ 6,265.00
Adam Zeldin 26.55  495.00  13,142.25
Carol O'Donnell 0.80  250.00  200.00
Ken Le 0.40  250.00  100.00
Nicole Fournier 0.50  185.00  92.50
Pritesh Patel 8.10  825.00  6,682.50

43.35 $ 26,482.25
Disbursements

Disbursements $ 5,516.09

$ 5,516.09
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Invoice No.: 20404985
Date: 02/28/2020

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

02/10/2020 Ken Le 0.40 $ 250.00 $ 100.00
Issue cheque. Emails with A. Zeldin re:
Hydro Quebec. Various banking and
administrative matters.

02/10/2020 Nicole Fournier 0.50  185.00  92.50
Translation of letter from Hydro Québec.

02/10/2020 Adam Sherman 1.00  895.00  895.00
Letter from Hydro Quebec re deposit
requirment. Emails with Stikeman re AG
security review/other matters.
Emails/discussions with Richter team.

02/10/2020 Pritesh Patel 0.60  825.00  495.00
Review of AG transactional data.  Respond
to creditor inquiries.

02/10/2020 Adam Zeldin 3.60  495.00  1,782.00
Respond to several creditor enquiries.
Emails/calls with Mackinac re creditor
enquiries, utilities deposits, American
Greetings (AG), post-filing disbursements
etc. Discussions/emails with Richter team.
Review/analyze schedule of purchases from
AG.

02/11/2020 Adam Sherman 0.80  895.00  716.00
Email from Hydro Ottawa re service. Emails
with Stikeman re funds transfer/etc.
Emails/discussions with Richter team.

02/11/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.00  825.00  825.00
Review of variance reporting.  Call with CRO
re KERP, correspondence with Osler on
same.

02/11/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.20  495.00  594.00
Review daily sales report. Respond to
several creditor enquiries. Call with Mackinac
re variance reporting, current week
disbursements, other matters.

02/12/2020 Carol O'Donnell 0.10  250.00  25.00
Prepare PO for Niwri invoice re
advertisement of CCAA proceedings.

02/12/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.50  495.00  1,237.50
Review weekly variance reporting and
support. Calls with Mackinac re variance
reporting, rent and landlord matters, other
cash flow matters. Review daily sales report,
emails with GB re same. Review funding
request and supporting documents.

02/13/2020 Adam Sherman 1.00  895.00  895.00
Email from BC Hydro re update. Discussion
with Ricther team re KERP/other matters.
Calls with various creditors.
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Invoice No.: 20404985
Date: 02/28/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

02/13/2020 Pritesh Patel 0.50  825.00  412.50
Respond to creditor inquiries.
Correspondence with Osler re KERP.

02/13/2020 Adam Zeldin 3.70  495.00  1,831.50
Respond to several creditor enquiries. Emails
with Mackinac re disbursements, creditor
enquiries, rent. Review disbursement
summary and supporting schedules. Review
daily sales report. Review/analyze February
rent schedule.

02/14/2020 Carol O'Donnell 0.20  250.00  50.00
Post document to website. Various
administrative matters.

02/14/2020 Adam Sherman 0.50  895.00  447.50
Calls with creditors. Email from Minden
Gross (landlord counsel).

02/14/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.75  495.00  866.25
Respond to creditor enquiries. Emails with
Mackinac re disbursements, inventory
matters. Review daily sales report. Review
filing cash flow in connection with next
week's disbursements. Arrange for posting of
updated service list.

02/17/2020 Adam Zeldin 0.50  495.00  247.50
Review email from Mackinac and supporting
document re Quebec sales tax remittance.
Review daily sales report.

02/18/2020 Carol O'Donnell 0.30  250.00  75.00
Communications with bank re wire transfer.
Prepare cheque. Discussions with Richter
team. Various administrative and banking
matters.

02/18/2020 Adam Sherman 0.80  895.00  716.00
Email from/call with Stikeman re update on
various matters. Discussions with Richter
team. Emails from Stikeman re
communications with Osler.

02/18/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.00  825.00  825.00
Review of liquidation reporting from GB and
discussion with A. Zeldin on same.  Update
call with Stikeman on outstanding issues.

02/18/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.40  495.00  693.00
Respond to creditor enquiries. Review daily
sales, discuss same with P. Patel. Emails
with Mackinac re creditor enquiries, cash flow
matters, inventory matters.

02/19/2020 Carol O'Donnell 0.20  250.00  50.00
Update wire transfer. Prepare cheque.
Various administrative and banking matters.

02/19/2020 Adam Sherman 1.00  895.00  895.00
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Invoice No.: 20404985
Date: 02/28/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Email from Mackinac re support for funds
transfer. Email from Stikeman re AG security
review. Discussions with Richter team.

02/19/2020 Pritesh Patel 2.50  825.00  2,062.50
Review of letter from CRO re $3m transfer,
discussion with Richter team on same.
Correspondence with Stikeman re AG
security review.

02/19/2020 Adam Zeldin 5.50  495.00  2,722.50
Review daily sales report, emails/call with
Mackinac/GB re same. Review supporting
docs re pre-filing Interco transfer, calls with
Mackinac and discussions with P. Patel re
same. Review weekly variance analysis, call
with Mackinac re same.

02/20/2020 Adam Sherman 0.70  895.00  626.50
Emails from Mackinac re DC shipments.
Discussions with Richter team.

02/20/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.00  825.00  825.00
Discussion with A. Zeldin re review of interco
charges and inventory shipments.  Call with
CRO.

02/20/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.70  495.00  1,336.50
Emails with Mackinac re current week
funding. Call with GB re daily sales report.
Review schedule of post-filing inventory
shipments. Emails/calls with Mackinac re
Interco transfer analysis, review of support
and discussions with Richter team on same.

02/20/2020 Adam Zeldin 0.90  495.00  445.50
Respond to creditor enquiries, emails with
Mackinac re same. Review daily sales report,
prepare analysis of same.

02/21/2020 Adam Sherman 1.20  895.00  1,074.00
Email from L. Ellis re request for update on
various matters. Emails from Stikeman re
AG, response to Ellis email.
Emails/discussions with Richter team.

02/21/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.50  825.00  1,237.50
Update call with Osler. Review of email from
counsel to Enesco and comment on
response. Review of email from counsel re
AG security review and email to CRO on
same.  Discussion with A. Zeldin re transfer
review.

02/21/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.80  495.00  1,386.00
Review daily sales report. Discussions with
P. Patel re Interco transfer analysis, continue
review of same. Respond to creditor
enquiries. Review emails re historical
payments and other matters relating to AG.
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Invoice No.: 20404985
Date: 02/28/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount
2262 Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Fees Total 43.35 $ 26,482.25

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount
02/05/2020 Disbursements $ 4,832.34

Advertisement re CCAA Proceeding
02/01/2020 Disbursements  120.00

Photocopying re creditor notice
02/01/2020 Disbursements  563.75

Postage re creditor notice

Disbursements Total $ 5,516.09
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Invoice No.: 20404985
Date: 02/28/2020

Remittance Form
SFP Canada Ltd.
300 Oak Bluff Lane
Goodlettsville, TN 37072

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 31,998.34
Technology and Administrative Fees 1,599.92
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 4,367.77

Total Due CAD $ 37,966.03

Payment Options

At this time, we ask that payment not be made by cheque.
Please use one of the payment options below. We appreciate your collaboration.
Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank

Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Credit Card payments can be made by contacting us as indicated below.
Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca
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SFP Canada Ltd.
300 Oak Bluff Lane
Goodlettsville, TN 37072

Date: 04/01/2020
Invoice No.: 20405062

Engagement No.: 2021822
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered to March 20, 2020. $ 45,979.50

Sub-Total 45,979.50
Technology and Administrative Fees 2,298.98
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 6,276.21

Total Due CAD $ 54,554.69
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Invoice No.: 20405062
Date: 04/01/2020

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Sherman 14.50 $ 895.00 $ 12,977.50
Adam Zeldin 44.10  495.00  21,829.50
Carol O'Donnell 0.80  250.00  200.00
Pritesh Patel 13.30  825.00  10,972.50

72.70 $ 45,979.50
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Invoice No.: 20405062
Date: 04/01/2020

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

02/24/2020 Adam Sherman 1.50 $ 895.00 $ 1,342.50
Emails with Stikeman re various matters.
Review/sign US counsel engagement letter.
Emails/discussions with Richter team. Call
with Stikeman re funds transfer, AG security
review, other matters. Call with creditor.

02/24/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.50  825.00  1,237.50
Update call with counsel re funds transfer,
AG security review.  Discussion with A.
Zeldin on outstanding items re transfer
review.  Update call with Osler.

02/24/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.00  495.00  495.00
Attend call with Stikeman/Richter team re
funds transfer, AG security review. Draft
email to Mackinac re funds transfer review
open items.

02/25/2020 Adam Sherman 1.00  895.00  895.00
Email from Mackinac re landlord matters.
Emails/discussions with Richter team.
Communications with Hydro Quebec.

02/25/2020 Pritesh Patel 2.30  825.00  1,897.50
Review of sales reporting from liquidator.
Email to CRO on outstanding items re funds
transfer review, discussion with A. Zeldin on
same.  Review of funding request, email to A.
Zeldin re same.

02/25/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.90  495.00  940.50
Review daily sales report. Respond to
several creditor enquiries. Review pre-filing
utilities bills, emails with Mackinac re same.
Review email to Mackinac re funds transfer.

02/26/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.90  495.00  1,435.50
Review current week disbursement request
and support, emails with Mackinac and
discussions with P. Patel re same. Review
daily sales, update internal analysis re same.

02/27/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.00  825.00  825.00
Review of responses from CRO re weekly
disbursement request.  Review of AG
payment data.  Discussion with A. Zeldin re
same and other matters.

02/27/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.70  495.00  1,336.50
Review schedule of payments to AG, call
with Mackinac re same, emails with Stikeman
re same. Review weekly variance analysis,
call with Mackinac re same. Review daily
sales report. Discussion with P. Patel.

02/28/2020 Adam Sherman 0.80  895.00  716.00
Emails with Stikeman re AG security.
Emails/discussions with Richter team.
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Invoice No.: 20405062
Date: 04/01/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

02/28/2020 Pritesh Patel 0.80  825.00  660.00
Review of correspondence with counsel re
AG security review.  Review of GB sales
reporting.

02/28/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.00  495.00  495.00
Emails with Stikeman re pre-filing payments
to AG, call with Mackinac re same. Review
daily sales report. Respond to creditor
enquiries.

03/02/2020 Adam Sherman 1.00  895.00  895.00
Email from Stikeman re AG security. Email
from Mackinac re Canadian store closures.
Emails/discussions with Richter team. Calls
with creditors.

03/02/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.30  825.00  1,072.50
Review of final liquidation sales reporting,
discussion with A. Zeldin re same.
Discussion with A. Zeldin re next steps.

03/02/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.80  495.00  891.00
Review daily sales reports re liquidation,
email to Mackinac re same and other store
closing matters. Respond to creditor
enquiries. Correspond with Osler re store
closing matters. Discussion with P. Patel.

03/03/2020 Carol O'Donnell 0.50  250.00  125.00
Finalize mail affidavit.

03/03/2020 Adam Sherman 1.20  895.00  1,074.00
Emails/call with Stikeman re AG security,
funds transfer, etc. Discussions with Richter
team.

03/03/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.00  825.00  825.00
Update call with Stikeman.  Review of email
re AG security review.  Review of AG data re
Quebec transactions.

03/03/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.60  495.00  1,287.00
Emails with Mackinac re status of liquidation,
landlord issues etc. Respond to creditor
enquiries. Update internal liquidation sale
analysis.

03/04/2020 Pritesh Patel 0.50  825.00  412.50
Emails/discussions with A. Zeldin re cash
matters.  Email to CRO re additional
information for AG security review.

03/04/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.50  495.00  1,237.50
Calls/emails with Mackinac re cash matters,
general update, discussion with P.Patel re
same. Respond to creditor enquiries.
Correspond with BC Hydro re closing of
accounts, emails with Osler re same.

03/05/2020 Adam Zeldin 0.80  495.00  396.00
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Invoice No.: 20405062
Date: 04/01/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review email from Mackinac re store closure
matters. Respond to creditor enquiries.

03/06/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.20  825.00  990.00
Review of documentation from CRO re funds
transfer. Review of response from CRO re
completion of liquidation sales.

03/06/2020 Adam Zeldin 3.00  495.00  1,485.00
Review email and supporting schedules from
Mackinac re funds transfer. Emails with
Mackinac re current week disbursements.
Respond to creditor enquiries.

03/10/2020 Adam Zeldin 0.75  495.00  371.25
Respond to creditor enquiries.

03/11/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.00  825.00  825.00
Review of rent analysis from Company and
correspondence with landlord re same.

03/12/2020 Carol O'Donnell 0.30  250.00  75.00
Update deposit in general trust account,
prepare cheque.

03/12/2020 Adam Sherman 0.60  895.00  537.00
Emails from Mackinac re funds transfer.
Emails/discussions with Richter team.

03/12/2020 Pritesh Patel 2.00  825.00  1,650.00
Review of additional info from CRO re funds
transfer, analysis of same. Calls/emails with
Richter team re funds transfer review,
outstanding issues. Call with CRO.

03/16/2020 Pritesh Patel 0.70  825.00  577.50
Correspondence with Cadillac Fairview re
rent arrears.  Review of email re sales tax
payments.

03/16/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.85  495.00  1,410.75
Emails with Mackinac re cash flow
variances/updated cash flow. Draft Monitor's
Third Report. Discussions with P. Patel re
funds transfer analysis. Respond to creditor
enquiries.

03/17/2020 Adam Sherman 2.20  895.00  1,969.00
Review funds transfer support, including
emails with Richter team. Call with Mackinac
re funds transfer and other matters. Email
from Stikeman re stay extension and other
matters.

03/17/2020 Adam Zeldin 6.10  495.00  3,019.50
Call with Mackinac re funds transfer, review
support and correspondence to date in
preparation for call. Review/update Monitor's
Third Report. Respond to creditor enquiries.

03/18/2020 Adam Zeldin 5.50  495.00  2,722.50
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Invoice No.: 20405062
Date: 04/01/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review/update Third Report. Calls/emails
with Mackinac re revised cash flow, variance
analysis, other matters.

03/19/2020 Adam Zeldin 5.20  495.00  2,574.00
Call with Stikeman re security review. Call
with Mackinac re GB final reconciliation,
other liquidation sale matters, updated cash
flow. Review/update Monitor's Third Report.

03/20/2020 Adam Sherman 6.20  895.00  5,549.00
Email with Richter team.
Review/revise/update Monitor's Third Report,
including review of files re same.

03/20/2020 Adam Zeldin 3.50  495.00  1,732.50
Calls/emails with Stikeman re AG security
review. Review/comment on revised CF for
stay extension motion, emails with Mackinac
re same. Respond to creditor enquiries.

Fees Total 72.70 $ 45,979.50
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Invoice No.: 20405062
Date: 04/01/2020

Remittance Form
SFP Canada Ltd.
300 Oak Bluff Lane
Goodlettsville, TN 37072

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 45,979.50
Technology and Administrative Fees 2,298.98
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 6,276.21

Total Due CAD $ 54,554.69

Payment Options

At this time, we ask that payment not be made by cheque.
Please use one of the payment options below. We appreciate your collaboration.
Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank

Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Credit Card payments can be made by contacting us as indicated below.
Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca
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SFP Canada Ltd.
300 Oak Bluff Lane
Goodlettsville, TN 37072

Date: 05/13/2020
Invoice No.: 20405228

Engagement No.: 2021822
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered to April 30, 2020. $ 48,418.75

Sub-Total 48,418.75
Technology and Administrative Fees 2,420.94
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 6,609.16

Total Due CAD $ 57,448.85
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Invoice No.: 20405228
Date: 05/13/2020

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Sherman 12.30 $ 895.00 $ 11,008.50
Adam Zeldin 55.45  495.00  27,447.75
Carol O'Donnell 1.90  250.00  475.00
Pritesh Patel 11.50  825.00  9,487.50

81.15 $ 48,418.75
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Invoice No.: 20405228
Date: 05/13/2020

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

03/23/2020 Adam Sherman 3.50 $ 895.00 $ 3,132.50
Email from Osler re draft motion docs,
including comments on same. Emails with
Stikeman re draft motion docs.
Emails/discussions with Richter team.
Review US KERP motion/order. Review,
revise, update Monitor'sThird Report.

03/23/2020 Adam Zeldin 4.60  495.00  2,277.00
Review draft motion materials (affidavit,
order, notice of motion) re stay extension,
calls/emails with Osler/Stikeman re same.
Review/update notes to CF, statutory reports
to the CF. Calls with Mackinac re CF.
Discussions with Richter team.

03/24/2020 Adam Sherman 2.80  895.00  2,506.00
Emails/call with Stikeman re SFP's motion,
Monitor's Third Report, etc. Email from Osler
re revised motion docs, including emails with
Stikeman re same. Emails/discussions with
Richter team. Email from Stikeman re
comments on Monitor's Third Report.

03/24/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.00  825.00  825.00
Discussion with Osler re motion materials.
Review of draft motion materials.

03/24/2020 Adam Zeldin 5.35  495.00  2,648.25
Review/update Monitor's Third Report,
calls/emails with Stikeman/Osler re same.
Calls/emails with Mackinac re stay extension
motion, cash flow, payment of post-filing
expenses. Emails/discussions with Richter
team.

03/25/2020 Adam Sherman 2.00  895.00  1,790.00
Emails with Stikeman re comments on relief
sought/Monitor's Third Report. Emails/call
with Stikeman re KERP. Review revised
Monitor's Third Report. Emails/discussions
with Richter team.

03/25/2020 Pritesh Patel 3.00  825.00  2,475.00
Review and comments on report. Call with
Stikeman re KERP. Calls with Osler re
motion materials, KERP. Call with CRO re
KERP and next steps. Emails/discussions
with Richter team.

03/25/2020 Adam Zeldin 6.15  495.00  3,044.25
Review/update Monitor's Third Report,
calls/emails with Stikeman re same.
Calls/emails with Mackinac re liquidation sale
results. Review of Mackinac invoice,
including engagement letter, email to Richter
team re same. Respond to creditor enquiries.

03/26/2020 Carol O'Donnell 0.40  250.00  100.00
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Invoice No.: 20405228
Date: 05/13/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Post documents to website and email to
OSB.

03/26/2020 Adam Sherman 1.50  895.00  1,342.50
Email from Osler re revised motion materials,
including emails with Stikeman re same.
Email from Osler re Monitor's Third Report.
including emails with Stikeman re same.
Emails with Richter team.

03/26/2020 Pritesh Patel 3.00  825.00  2,475.00
Review and comments on revised affidavit
and motion materials. Discussion with A.
Zeldin on Monitor's Third Report and
comments on same.  Correspondence with
CRO and Richter team re CF.

03/26/2020 Adam Zeldin 5.65  495.00  2,796.75
Calls/emails with Stikeman re Monitor's Third
Report, AG security. Review/update
Monitor's Third Report for counsel
comments. Calls/emails with Mackinac re
CF, KERP. Review updated stay motion
materials. Discussion with P. Patel.

03/27/2020 Adam Sherman 1.00  895.00  895.00
Review/sign off on extended cash flow and
associated docs. Finalize/sign Monitor's
report, including emails with Richter team.
Emails with Stikeman re service of materials,
Court communications, etc.

03/27/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.00  825.00  825.00
Review and sign final draft of Monitor's Third
Report, discussion with A. Zeldin on same.

03/27/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.50  495.00  742.50
Update/finalize Monitor's Third Report,
discussions with Richter team re same.

03/30/2020 Carol O'Donnell 0.90  250.00  225.00
Post documents to website, email to OSB.
Post service list to website.

03/30/2020 Adam Sherman 0.30  895.00  268.50
Email from Stikeman re Court
communications re motion. Email from Osler
re entered Order (stay extension/KERP
allocation). Email from Stikeman re account.
Emails with Richter team.

03/30/2020 Pritesh Patel 0.50  825.00  412.50
Review of correspondence re Court hearing
and order. Correspondence with Cadillac
Fairview re rent calculations.

03/30/2020 Adam Zeldin 0.90  495.00  445.50
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Invoice No.: 20405228
Date: 05/13/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review of emails re stay extension
motion/order. Respond to creditor enquiries.
Discussions with Richter team. Emails with
Osler re service list, arrange for same to be
updated/posted to website

03/31/2020 Adam Zeldin 0.80  495.00  396.00
Respond to creditor enquiries. Review of
email re landlord issues. Review
endorsement of Justice Hainey dated March
30, 2020.

04/01/2020 Adam Zeldin 0.45  495.00  222.75
Respond to creditor enquiries.

04/06/2020 Adam Zeldin 0.85  495.00  420.75
Respond to creditor enquiries. Discussion
with Richter team. Call with Mackinac re
post-filing disbursements.

04/07/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.50  495.00  742.50
Call/emails with Mackinac re post-filing
expenses. Review of legal invoices in
connection with security review, prepare
summary of same. Respond to creditor
enquiries.

04/08/2020 Pritesh Patel 0.50  825.00  412.50
Correspondence with CRO re KERP.
Correspondence with counsel re next steps.
Call with A. Zeldin re CF and GB final
reconciliation.

04/08/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.50  495.00  742.50
Emails with Mackinac re post-filing
disbursements, GB final reconciliation.
Respond to creditor enquiry. Discussion with
P. Patel re CF and GB final reconciliation.
Emails with Stikeman re GB final
reconciliation, general status update.

04/13/2020 Adam Zeldin 0.60  495.00  297.00
Review of invoices and coordinate payment
of post-filing expenses. Respond to creditor
enquiries.

04/14/2020 Carol O'Donnell 0.60  250.00  150.00
Verify bank for wire transfers, update deposit.
Prepare wire transfer.

04/14/2020 Adam Zeldin 0.55  495.00  272.25
Respond to creditor enquiry. Arrange
payment for post-filing expenses.

04/15/2020 Adam Zeldin 0.30  495.00  148.50
Correspond with professional firms/Mackinac
re post-filing expenses.

04/17/2020 Adam Zeldin 0.85  495.00  420.75
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Invoice No.: 20405228
Date: 05/13/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Calls/emails with Mackinac re status of
proceedings, final reconciliation, other
matters. Update email to Richter team re final
reconciliation. Respond to creditor enquiries.

04/20/2020 Adam Sherman 0.30  895.00  268.50
Emails with Richter team re update/next
steps. Emails from Mackinac re GB
reconciliation.

04/20/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.00  825.00  825.00
Review of final reconciliation and comments
on same.

04/20/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.85  495.00  1,410.75
Emails/call with Mackinac re final
reconciliation, CF variances, next steps in the
proceedings. Review of final reconciliation
analysis and supporting documents, CF
variance analysis. Respond to creditor
enquiry. Emails with Richter team.

04/21/2020 Adam Sherman 0.20  895.00  179.00
Emails with Richter team. Emails with
Stikeman.

04/21/2020 Adam Zeldin 0.50  495.00  247.50
Call with Osler re next steps in proceedings.
Call with Mackinac re final reconciliation
analysis, CF variance analysis, post-filing
disbursements. Emails with Richter team.

04/22/2020 Adam Sherman 0.70  895.00  626.50
Call with Stikeman re status update and next
steps. Emails/discussion with Richter team.

04/22/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.00  825.00  825.00
Call with Osler re outstanding matters and
next steps. Update call with A. Zeldin.

04/22/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.20  495.00  1,089.00
Call with Stikeman re final reconciliation, next
steps in proceedings. Calls/emails with
Richter team re same. Review Liquidation
Sales data for purposes of cost allocation
analysis, email to Mackinac re same.

04/23/2020 Pritesh Patel 0.50  825.00  412.50
Call with CRO on Quebec matters and next
steps.

04/23/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.90  495.00  940.50
Call with Mackinac re next steps in the
proceedings. Analyze Liquidation Sales data
for purposes of cost allocation analysis.
Discussions with Richter team.

04/24/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.00  495.00  990.00
Draft Monitor's Fourth Report to Court.
Review of emails with Stikeman re secured
claim of AG.
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Invoice No.: 20405228
Date: 05/13/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

04/27/2020 Adam Zeldin 4.50  495.00  2,227.50
Continue drafting Monitor's Fourth Report.
Prepare affidavits for same. Email to
Mackinac re cost allocation analysis. Review
of Quebec Liquidation Sale results, update
analysis of same.

04/28/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.35  495.00  1,163.25
Review/update Monitor's Fourth Report.
Review cost allocation analysis, emails/call
with Mackinac re same. Emails with
Mackinac/Osler re landlord claims, review of
rent arrears schedule in connection with
same.

04/29/2020 Adam Zeldin 4.00  495.00  1,980.00
Emails/calls with Mackinac re cost allocation
analysis, cash flow variances, landlord
matters. Review/update Monitor's Fourth
Report.

04/30/2020 Adam Zeldin 3.60  495.00  1,782.00
Calls/emails with Mackinac re Quebec store
proceeds, cost allocation. other Quebec
landlord matters. Review of lease
documentation relating to Quebec landlords
and summary of same. Review/update
Monitor's Fourth Report.

Fees Total 81.15 $ 48,418.75
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Invoice No.: 20405228
Date: 05/13/2020

Remittance Form
SFP Canada Ltd.
300 Oak Bluff Lane
Goodlettsville, TN 37072

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 48,418.75
Technology and Administrative Fees 2,420.94
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 6,609.16

Total Due CAD $ 57,448.85

Payment Options

At this time, we ask that payment not be made by cheque.
Please use one of the payment options below. We appreciate your collaboration.
Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank

Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Credit Card payments can be made by contacting us as indicated below.
Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca
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SFP Canada Ltd.
300 Oak Bluff Lane
Goodlettsville, TN 37072

Date: 05/14/2020
Invoice No.: 20405238

Engagement No.: 2021822
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional fees rendered for the period May 1, 2020 to May 10, 2020. $ 21,314.00

Sub-Total 21,314.00
Technology and Administrative Fees 1,065.70
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 2,909.36

Total Due CAD $ 25,289.06
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Invoice No.: 20405238
Date: 05/14/2020

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Sherman 7.30 $ 895.00 $ 6,533.50
Adam Zeldin 20.15  495.00  9,974.25
Carol O'Donnell 1.00  250.00  250.00
Patrick Lareau 2.25  375.00  843.75
Pritesh Patel 4.50  825.00  3,712.50

35.20 $ 21,314.00
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Invoice No.: 20405238
Date: 05/14/2020

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

05/01/2020 Adam Sherman 0.30 $ 895.00 $ 268.50
Emails with Richter team. Review draft
Quebec store net proceeds analysis.

05/01/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.40  495.00  1,188.00
Review Quebec store net proceeds analysis
prepared by Mackinac. Emails with Mackinac
re same and other matters. Review/update
Monitor's Fourth Report.

05/02/2020 Adam Zeldin 3.85  495.00  1,905.75
Discussions with Richter team re upcoming
distribution motion. Review Quebec Stores
net proceeds analysis, call with Mackinac re
same. Email to Stikeman re distribution
motion and related matters. Review/update
Monitor's Fourth Report.

05/03/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.80  495.00  891.00
Review Chapter 11 Proceedings dockets.
Update Monitor's Fourth Report. Discussions
with Richter team.

05/04/2020 Adam Zeldin 3.15  495.00  1,559.25
Call with Mackinac re CF variances, Chapter
11 Proceedings, Quebec Stores net
proceeds analysis. Review of CF activity and
variances, prepare schedule for Monitor's
Fourth Report. Discussions with Richter
team. Review of Chapter 11 Proceedings’
dockets.

05/05/2020 Adam Sherman 0.20  895.00  179.00
Call from Workers Compensation Board
(BC). Emails with Richter team.

05/05/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.40  495.00  693.00
Calls with Osler re distribution motion, relief
sought. Call with Workers Compensation
Board (BC). Review email/supporting
invoices from utilities provider re post-filing
expenses. Richter team discussion.

05/06/2020 Adam Sherman 2.50  895.00  2,237.50
Emails/call with Stikeman re Quebec store
net proceeds, next steps, etc. Review
Quebec store net proceeds analysis.
Emails/discussions with Richter team. Emails
from Blakes re support for AG security,
timing for SFP motion, other matters

05/06/2020 Pritesh Patel 2.00  825.00  1,650.00
Review of draft Monitor’s Fourth Report,
materials on landlord claims. Call with
Stikeman to discuss distribution motion, next
steps.

05/06/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.65  495.00  1,311.75
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Invoice No.: 20405238
Date: 05/14/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review of emails re AG security, Quebec
landlords. Review schedule re details of
Quebec leases. Prepare landlord claim
analysis. Call with Stikeman re distribution
motion and related relief/matters. Call with
Mackinac re distribution motion.

05/07/2020 Patrick Lareau 1.75  375.00  656.25
Prepare preliminary WEPP calculation.

05/07/2020 Carol O'Donnell 0.70  250.00  175.00
Review preliminary WEPP calculation with P.
Lareau, discussion with A. Zeldin re same.

05/07/2020 Adam Sherman 0.80  895.00  716.00
Emails/discussions with Richter team.
Preliminary review of Monitor’s Fourth
Report.

05/07/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.80  495.00  1,386.00
Review/update Monitor's Fourth Report.
Emails with Mackinac re employee matters,
distribution motion and related matters.
Review of employee information for potential
WEPP claims and preliminary calculation of
same. Discussions with Richter team.

05/08/2020 Patrick Lareau 0.50  375.00  187.50
Review/update preliminary WEPP
calculation.

05/08/2020 Carol O'Donnell 0.30  250.00  75.00
Review WEPP schedule, discuss with P.
Lareau.

05/08/2020 Adam Sherman 3.50  895.00  3,132.50
Emails/discussions with Richter team.
Review/revise/update Monitor’s Fourth
Report. Review potential employee WEPP
entitlement calculation. Emails from
Stikeman/Blakes re motion.

05/08/2020 Pritesh Patel 2.50  825.00  2,062.50
Review/revise Monitor’s Fourth Report.
Review data from AG, correspondence with
counsel on same. Correspondence with
Cadillac Fairview and CRO re outstanding
rent payments.

05/08/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.10  495.00  1,039.50
Review of comments re Monitor's Fourth
Report. Review information/emails
supporting AG's secured claim. Review of
emails/support re lease adjustment
obligations. Review revised preliminary
WEPP calculation. Discussions with Richter
team.

Fees Total 35.20 $ 21,314.00
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Invoice No.: 20405238
Date: 05/14/2020

Remittance Form
SFP Canada Ltd.
300 Oak Bluff Lane
Goodlettsville, TN 37072

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 21,314.00
Technology and Administrative Fees 1,065.70
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 2,909.36

Total Due CAD $ 25,289.06

Payment Options

At this time, we ask that payment not be made by cheque.
Please use one of the payment options below. We appreciate your collaboration.
Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank

Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to: 
ClientService@richter.ca

Credit Card payments can be made by contacting us as indicated below.
Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca
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SFP Canada Ltd.
300 Oak Bluff Lane
Goodlettsville, TN 37072

Date: 06/03/2020
Invoice No.: 20405302

Engagement No.: 2021822
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional Services rendered to May 31, 2020. $ 24,120.25

Disbursements  21.09

Sub-Total 24,141.34
Technology and Administrative Fees 1,207.07
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 3,295.29

Total Due CAD $ 28,643.70
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Invoice No.: 20405302
Date: 06/03/2020

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Sherman 6.70 $ 895.00 $ 5,996.50
Adam Zeldin 22.75  495.00  11,261.25
Carol O'Donnell 1.20  250.00  300.00
Patrick Lareau 1.00  375.00  375.00
Pritesh Patel 7.50  825.00  6,187.50

39.15 $ 24,120.25
Disbursements

Telephone Charges $ 21.09

$ 21.09
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Invoice No.: 20405302
Date: 06/03/2020

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

05/11/2020 Adam Sherman 2.50 $ 895.00 $ 2,237.50
Review/revise/update Monitor’s Fourth
Report, including emails/discussions with
Richter team.

05/11/2020 Adam Zeldin 3.40  495.00  1,683.00
Review/update Monitor's Fourth Report.
Discussions with Richter team. Emails/call
with Mackinac re CF matters, distribution
motion.

05/12/2020 Patrick Lareau 0.50  375.00  187.50
Discussion with C. O'Donnell re preliminary
WEPP calculation.

05/12/2020 Adam Sherman 0.80  895.00  716.00
Emails with Stikeman/Richter team re
outstanding matters and next steps. Emails
between Stikeman/Blakes re AG.

05/12/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.00  825.00  825.00
Correspondence with counsel and Richter
team re status of distribution review,
outstanding items. Call with Osler on timing
and next steps.

05/12/2020 Adam Zeldin 3.20  495.00  1,584.00
Emails with Stikeman re AG transaction data,
distribution motion. Emails/call with Mackinac
re Quebec Store proceeds analysis,
distribution analysis. Review/update
Monitor's Fourth Report, Quebec Stores
analysis.

05/13/2020 Adam Sherman 1.00  895.00  895.00
Emails/discussions with Richter team. Email
from Stikeman re accounts. Review
Mackinac distribution analysis.

05/13/2020 Pritesh Patel 2.50  825.00  2,062.50
Call with A. Zeldin re status of Monitor’s
Fourth Report, WEPP calculation and AG
liability review. Review of invoice schedules
from SFP and AG. Emails with CRO on
outstanding items.

05/13/2020 Adam Zeldin 3.15  495.00  1,559.25
Call with P. Patel re WEPP, AG liability
review, Fourth Report. Emails with CRO re
AG liability review, distribution analysis, CF.
Review/update Fourth Report/appendices.
Review distribution analysis. Emails with
Osler re distribution motion.

05/14/2020 Adam Sherman 0.30  895.00  268.50
Emails from Stikeman/Blakes re AG
distribution, other related matters. Emails
with Richter team.

05/14/2020 Adam Zeldin 3.60  495.00  1,782.00
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Invoice No.: 20405302
Date: 06/03/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Emails/call with Osler re distribution motion.
Emails with Mackinac re distribution analysis,
AG liability review, CF matters.
Review/comment on distribution analysis.
Review/update Monitor's Fourth
Report/appendices.

05/15/2020 Carol O'Donnell 0.60  250.00  150.00
Verify bank for wire transfer, update deposit
and prepare wire.

05/15/2020 Adam Sherman 0.50  895.00  447.50
Email from Blakes re support to AG debt,
including preliminary review of same. Emails
with Richter team.

05/15/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.00  825.00  825.00
Review of cash tracker and distribution
analysis from CRO.

05/15/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.95  495.00  965.25
Emails with Osler re distribution motion.
Review/compare transaction data re AG
liability. Richter team discussion.

05/19/2020 Carol O'Donnell 0.60  250.00  150.00
Prepare wire transfers, update GL.

05/19/2020 Adam Sherman 0.50  895.00  447.50
Call with former employee re update. Email
from Blakes re support for AG debt.

05/19/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.20  495.00  1,089.00
Emails with Osler re distribution motion
materials. Review additional information in
support of AG liability, update internal
analysis of same. Discussions with Richter
team. Emails with Mackinac re cash flow
matters.

05/20/2020 Patrick Lareau 0.50  375.00  187.50
Review/update preliminary WEPP
calculation.

05/20/2020 Adam Sherman 0.60  895.00  537.00
Emails from A. Zeldin re review of support for
AG debt and draft Monitor’s Fourth Report.
Preliminary review of revised draft Monitor’s
Fourth Report.

05/20/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.00  825.00  825.00
Review of revised Monitor’s Fourth Report.

05/20/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.15  495.00  1,064.25
Respond to creditor enquiry. Review prior
week CF variances. Review/update charts for
Monitor's Fourth Report. Emails to
Osler/Mackinac re distribution motion.

05/21/2020 Adam Sherman 0.30  895.00  268.50
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Invoice No.: 20405302
Date: 06/03/2020

Date Hours Rate Amount

05/21/2020 0.60  495.00  297.00

05/22/2020 0.10  895.00  89.50

05/22/2020 0.50  495.00  247.50

05/25/2020 0.10  895.00  89.50

05/25/2020 0.30  495.00  148.50

05/28/2020 1.50  825.00  1,237.50

05/28/2020 0.20  495.00  99.00

05/29/2020 0.50  825.00  412.50

05/29/2020 1.50  495.00  742.50

Fees Total 39.15 $ 24,120.25

Date Hours Rate Amount
04/27/2020

Name and Description

Email from Stikeman re update on 
outstanding matters. Emails with Richter 
team.
Adam Zeldin
Emails with Stikeman/Richter team re 
Monitor's Fourth Report, distribution motion. 
Correspond with utilities provider/Mackinac 
re post-filing expenses.
Adam Sherman
Email from Blakes re status of distribution 
motion.
Adam Zeldin
Review email from Blakes re status of 
distribution motion. Emails with Mackinac re 
payment of post-filing expenses.
Adam Sherman
Email from Stikeman re status of distribution 
motion, Monitor's Fourth Report. Emails with 
Richter team.
Adam Zeldin
Emails with Stikeman re status of distribution 
motion, Monitor's Fourth Report. Emails with 
Richter team.
Pritesh Patel
Call with Osler re status of distribution and 
review of information supporting same.
Adam Zeldin
Respond to creditor enquiry.
Pritesh Patel
Emails with A. Zeldin re status of distribution 
motion and next steps.
Adam Zeldin
Review of AG transaction/payments data, 
email to P. Patel re same.

Description
Telephone Charges $ 21.09

Disbursements Total $ 21.09
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Invoice No.: 20405302
Date: 06/03/2020

Remittance Form
SFP Canada Ltd.
300 Oak Bluff Lane
Goodlettsville, TN 37072

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 24,141.34
Technology and Administrative Fees 1,207.07
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 3,295.29

Total Due CAD $ 28,643.70

Payment Options

At this time, we ask that payment not be made by cheque.
Please use one of the payment options below. We appreciate your collaboration.
Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank

Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Credit Card payments can be made by contacting us as indicated below.
Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca
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SFP Canada Ltd.
300 Oak Bluff Lane
Goodlettsville, TN 37072

Date: 06/23/2020
Invoice No.: 20405354

Engagement No.: 2021822
Payment Terms: Due on Receipt

Professional services rendered from June 1 to June 22, 2020. $ 21,622.75

Sub-Total 21,622.75
Technology and Administrative Fees 1,081.14
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 2,951.51

Total Due CAD $ 25,655.40
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Invoice No.: 20405354
Date: 06/23/2020

Fees

Name Hours Rate Amount

Adam Sherman 6.10 $ 895.00 $ 5,459.50
Adam Zeldin 22.35  495.00  11,063.25
Carol O'Donnell 0.60  250.00  150.00
Pritesh Patel 6.00  825.00  4,950.00

35.05 $ 21,622.75
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Invoice No.: 20405354
Date: 06/23/2020

Fee and Disbursement Details
Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

06/02/2020 Adam Sherman 1.00 $ 895.00 $ 895.00
Emails with Stikeman. Emails with Osler re
call with UCC. Review draft UCC complaint.
Emails with Richter team.

06/02/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.00  825.00  825.00
Review of UCC complaint.

06/02/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.60  495.00  792.00
Review of pre-filing AG payment data, emails
with Richter team. Emails with Mackinac re
distribution analysis.

06/03/2020 Adam Sherman 1.50  895.00  1,342.50
Emails/call with Stikeman re UCC draft
complaint, next steps, other matters. Call
with Stikeman, Osler, CRO, UCC counsel re
draft complaint in US proceedings. Emails
with Richter team.

06/03/2020 Pritesh Patel 2.00  825.00  1,650.00
Call with counsel on complaint. Call with
counsel to UCC/Stikeman/Osler/CRO, follow-
up with Stikeman and Osler.

06/03/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.30  495.00  1,138.50
Email to Stikeman re distribution motion,
accounts. Emails/calls with
Stikeman/Osler/Richter team re status of
distribution motion, UCC complaint. Call with
Osler/Stikeman/CRO/UCC's counsel re UCC
complaint. Revise Fourth Report appendices.

06/05/2020 Adam Sherman 0.20  895.00  179.00
Emails with Stikeman. Emails with Richter
team.

06/05/2020 Adam Zeldin 0.50  495.00  247.50
Emails with Mackinac re post-filing expenses.
Review of cash flow variances.

06/08/2020 Carol O'Donnell 0.10  250.00  25.00
Miscellaneous administration.

06/08/2020 Adam Sherman 0.10  895.00  89.50
Email from UCC re follow up on draft UCC
complaint.

06/08/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.00  495.00  495.00
Call with Stikeman re UCC complaint,
accounts. Discussions with Richter team.
Email to Mackinac re post-filing expenses.
Call with Mackinac re cash, other matters.

06/09/2020 Adam Sherman 0.20  895.00  179.00
Emails with Stikeman re draft UCC response.
Emails with Richter team.

06/09/2020 Adam Zeldin 0.30  495.00  148.50
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Invoice No.: 20405354
Date: 06/23/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Review of email to UCC's counsel re UCC
complaint. Emails with Mackinac re cash
matters.

06/10/2020 Carol O'Donnell 0.50  250.00  125.00
Verify bank for wire transfer, update deposit,
prepare wire transfer, update GL.

06/10/2020 Adam Sherman 0.10  895.00  89.50
Email from Stikeman re communications with
counsel for AG.

06/10/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.50  495.00  1,237.50
Review of emails from Stikeman re AG
security, UCC complaint. Review updated
cash tracker, emails with Mackinac re same.
Update Monitor's Fourth Report for same.

06/11/2020 Adam Sherman 0.40  895.00  358.00
Email from Stikeman re comments on
Monitor’s Fourth Report. Emails with Richter
team.

06/11/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.90  495.00  1,435.50
Review Stikeman comments re Monitor's
Fourth Report, revise report for same. Emails
with Stikeman re status of communications
with UCC.

06/12/2020 Adam Sherman 0.50  895.00  447.50
Emails with Richter team re updated
Monitor's Fourth Report, other matters. Email
from Stikeman re communications with
counsel for UCC. Review updated Monitor’s
Fourth Report.

06/12/2020 Pritesh Patel 0.50  825.00  412.50
Call with Osler re next steps.

06/12/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.30  495.00  1,138.50
Emails with Richter team/Stikeman re
Monitor's Fourth Report, UCC complaint,
status of distribution motion. Call with
Stikeman re Monitors Fourth Report,
review/revise same. Emails with Mackinac re
cash matters.

06/14/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.50  825.00  1,237.50
Review of updated draft of Monitor’s Fourth
Report and comments on same.

06/15/2020 Adam Zeldin 1.30  495.00  643.50
Call with Stikeman/UCC counsel re UCC
complaint. Review additional comments on
Monitor's Fourth Report, discussions with P.
Patel re same.

06/18/2020 Adam Sherman 0.80  895.00  716.00
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Invoice No.: 20405354
Date: 06/23/2020

Date Name and Description Hours Rate Amount

Emails from Osler attaching draft Notice of
Motion, Affidavit re CCAA
termination/distribution motion, including
email from Stikeman re same. Emails with
Richter team.

06/18/2020 Pritesh Patel 1.00  825.00  825.00
Update call with Osler, email to
Richter/Stikeman on same. Review of
revised draft of Monitor's Fourth Report.

06/18/2020 Adam Zeldin 2.50  495.00  1,237.50
Review of emails re status of UCC complaint.
Review/comment on notice of motion/affidavit
for distribution motion. Review/revise
Monitor's Fourth Report. Emails with
Mackinac re sales tax returns, next steps.

06/19/2020 Adam Sherman 0.50  895.00  447.50
Emails from Osler re draft UCC term sheet,
draft order re distribution/termination of
CCAA. Emails with Richter team.

06/19/2020 Adam Zeldin 0.50  495.00  247.50
Review of draft UCC term sheet.

06/20/2020 Adam Sherman 0.20  895.00  179.00
Emails from Stikeman re comments on draft
affidavit and AG distribution. Email from P.
Patel re AG distribution.

06/21/2020 Adam Sherman 0.20  895.00  179.00
Email from Stikeman to Blakes re AG
distribution. Email from Osler/Stikeman re
CCAA termination/distribution motion.

06/22/2020 Adam Sherman 0.40  895.00  358.00
Email from Blakes re AG distribution. Emails
from Stikeman re Monitor’s Fourth Report,
AG distribution, other matters. Emails with
Richter team.

06/22/2020 Adam Zeldin 4.65  495.00  2,301.75
Review of comments/emails re motion
materials/Fourth Report. Emails with
Stikeman re distribution to AG, related
matters. Update Monitor's Fourth Report,
call/emails with Stikeman re same.
Emails/call with Mackinac re CF matters,
HST, QC realizations.

Fees Total 35.05 $ 21,622.75
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Invoice No.: 20405354
Date: 06/23/2020

Remittance Form
SFP Canada Ltd.
300 Oak Bluff Lane
Goodlettsville, TN 37072

Invoice Summary

Sub-Total $ 21,622.75
Technology and Administrative Fees 1,081.14
GST/HST #885435842 RT0001 2,951.51

Total Due CAD $ 25,655.40

Payment Options

At this time, we ask that payment not be made by cheque.
Please use one of the payment options below. We appreciate your collaboration.
Wire Transfer Toronto Dominion Bank

Commercial Banking Center
525 Av. Viger Ouest, Montréal (Qc) H2Z 0B2
Bank Institute No.: 004
CAD Account no.: 5300836 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
USD Account no.: 7332090 Transit no.: 41601 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Email payment details, including invoice number and amount paid to:
ClientService@richter.ca

Credit Card payments can be made by contacting us as indicated below.
Inquiries: please call our general line 416.488.2345 or e-mail ClientService@richter.ca
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Court File No. CV-20-634980-00CL 
 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE  

COMMERCIAL LIST 
 

IN THE MATTER OF THE COMPANIES’ CREDITORS ARRANGEMENT ACT,  
R.S.C. 1985, c. C-36, AS AMENDED 

 
AND IN THE MATTER OF A PLAN OF COMPROMISE OR ARRANGEMENT OF  

SFP CANADA LTD. 
Applicants 

AFFIDAVIT OF ASHLEY TAYLOR 
(SWORN JUNE 24, 2020) 

 I, Ashley Taylor, of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario, MAKE OATH 

AND SAY: 

 

1. I am a barrister and solicitor qualified to practice law in the Province of Ontario and I 

am a partner at Stikeman Elliott LLP (“Stikeman”), and counsel to Richter Advisory 

Group Inc. in its capacity as the Monitor in the above-noted proceedings. As such, I 

have knowledge of the matters to which I hereinafter depose. 

2. I make this affidavit in support of a motion by the Applicants for, inter alia, approval 

of the fees and disbursements of Stikeman, in its capacity as the Monitor’s counsel. 

3. During the period from January 15, 2020 to June 22, 2020, Stikeman docketed 177.26 

hours, resulting in legal fees of $150,608.30 and disbursements and other charges in 

the amount of $679.22, plus harmonized sales tax (“HST”) of $19,666.95 and British 

Columbia provincial sales tax (“BCPST”) of $92.93. 

4. Attached hereto and marked as Exhibit “A” are copies of the accounts rendered by 

Stikeman to the Monitor for the period from January 15, 2020 to June 22, 2020, which 

have been redacted in specific instances for confidential or privileged information. 

5. Attached hereto and marked as Exhibit “B” is a schedule summarizing each invoice 

included in Exhibit “A”, including the fees, expenses, HST and BCPST charged in 

each invoice. 
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6. Attached hereto and marked as Exhibit “C” is a schedule summarizing the hours 

billed, the billing rates and the total amounts billed by each member of Stikeman who 

rendered services to the Monitor. 

7. To the best of my knowledge, the hourly billing rates outlined in Exhibit “C” were no 

more than Stikeman’s normal hourly rates, which were in effect from January 15, 

2020 to June 22, 2020, and are comparable to the hourly rates charged by Stikeman for 

services rendered in relation to similar proceedings. 

8. To the best of my knowledge, the hourly billing rates outlined in Exhibit “C” are 

comparable to the hourly rates charged by other firms in the Toronto market for the 

provision of similar services. 

 

SWORN before me by video conference 
from Toronto in the Province of Ontario 
(location of affiant), to the Community of 
Eugenia (Grey County) in the Province of 
Ontario (location of commissioner) this 
24th day of June, 2020. 
 

 

 

   

Commissioner for Taking Affidavits   ASHLEY TAYLOR 
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This is 

EXHIBIT “A” 
referred to in the Affidavit of 

ASHLEY TAYLOR 
sworn on June 24, 2020. 

 

 

 

__________________________________ 
Commissioner for Taking Affidavits 
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EXHIBIT “A” 

 
Copies of Accounts of Stikeman Elliott LLP for Services Rendered  

from January 15, 2020 to June 22, 2020 
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Stikeman Elliott Stikeman Elliott LLP 

Barristers & Solicitors 

5300 Commerce Court West 

199 Bay Street

Toronto, ON Canada M5L1B9

Main: 416 869 5500 

Fax: 416 947 0866

www.stikeman.com

GST / HST No. 1214111360001 

QST No. 1018978624

Account

January 27, 2020

File No. 1266971016 

Invoice No. 5786682

Richter Advisory Group Inc. 

Bay Wellington Tower 

181 Bay Street 

Suite 3510

Toronto, ON M5J 2T3

Attention: Adam Sherman

For Professional Services Rendered in connection with SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Papyrus) for the period 

from January 15, 2020 to and including Friday, January 24, 2020.

Time Summary

Date Timekeeper Hours Description Amount

Jan 15, 2020 A.J. Taylor 0.33 Telephone conversation with A. Sherman 

re CCAA filing;

354.75

Jan 17, 2020 A.J. Taylor 0.75 Review ; 

review emails re Intercompay Transfers;

806.25

Jan 20, 2020 N. Avis 0.92 Reviewing background information on 

Papyrus; reviewing the draft initial order.

460.00

Jan 21, 2020 A.J. Taylor 7.17 Emails re Initial Order; review draft initial 

order; emails re Cash Flow; telephone 

conversation with A. Sherman; 

conference call with Osier, Mackinac and 

Richter; review draft affidavit; telephone 

conversation with A. Sherman; telephone 

conversation with M. Calvaruso;

7,707.75

Jan 22, 2020 N. Avis 0.18 Reviewing emails. 90.00

Jan 22, 2020 A.J. Taylor 4.75 Review revised Initial Order; telephone 5,106.25

conversation with A. Sherman and P. 

Patel re Affidavit and Order; emails with 

Osier re Order and Affidavit; review 

revised documents; prepare for 

Application; telephone conversation with
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Stikeman Elliott

Date Timekeeper Hours Description

M. Calvaruso;

Amount

Jan 23, 2020 N. Avis 2.17 Attending court; revieiwng emails. 1,085.00

Jan 23, 2020 A.J. Taylor 5.17 Revised Initial Order; CRO Engagement 

Letter; Liquidation Order; Employee FAQ; 

Telephone conversation with A.

Sherman; conversation with N. Avis;

CCAA Application; review factum; review 

and revise draft report;

5,557.75

Jan 24, 2020 N. Avis 2.35 Attending court; reviewing the monitor’s 

report.

1,175.00

Jan 24, 2020 A.J. Taylor 3.75 Court Report; preparation for and 4,031.25
attendance of Liquidation Sale Approval 

Motion; conversation with A. Sherman;

Fee Summary

Timekeeper

N. Avis 

A.J. Taylor

Hours Rate/Hr Amount

5.62 $500.00 $2,810.00

21.92 1,075.00 23,564.00

Professional Services 

HST@ 13.0%

CA $26,374.00 

3,428.62

Total Professional Services and Taxes CA $29,802.62

Charges Summary

Description Taxable Non - Taxable Total

Photocopies 425.50 425.50

Total Charges 425.50 0.00 425.50

HST@ 13.0% 55.32

Total Charges and Taxes CA $480.82

Disbursements Summary

Description Taxable Non - Taxable Total

Business Meals - In Town 13.37 13.37

Cash Received 0.00 0.00

Book Binding/Binders 13.32 13.32

Page 2 of 4
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Stikeman Elliott

Description Taxable Non - Taxable Total

Total Disbursements 26.69 0.00 26.69

HST @ 13.0% 3.47

Total Disbursements and Taxes CA $30.16

Account Summary

Invoice No. 5786682 

File No. 1266971016 

Re: SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Papyrus)

Taxable

Professional Services 26,374.00

HST@ 13.0%

Charges 425.50

HST @ 13.0%

Disbursements 26.69

Non-Taxable Total

0.00 $26,374.00

3,428.62

0.00 425.50

55.32

0.00 26.69

3.47

CA $30,313.60

Accounts are due when rendered. Please note that a prevailing quarterly pre-judgement 

interest rate will be charged for amounts unpaid 30 days or more.

Disbursements and charges may not have been posted at the date of this account.

Please quote our File number and/or Invoice number 126697.1016/5786682 when making 

payment.

Page 3 of 4
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Stikeman Elliott

GST/HST No. 1214111360001 
QST No. 1018978624

Stikeman Elliott LLP 
Barristers & Solicitors 

5300 Commerce Court West 
199 Bay Street
Toronto, ON Canada M5L1B9

Main: 416 869 5500 

Fax: 416 947 0866
www.stikeman.com

Account

February 3, 2020

File No. 1266971016 
Invoice No. 5787488

Richter Advisory Group Inc. 
Bay Wellington Tower 

181 Bay Street 
Suite 3510
Toronto, ON M5J 2T3

Attention: Adam Sherman

For Professional Services Rendered in connection with SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Papyrus) for the period 
from January 24, 2020 to and including Friday, January 31, 2020.

Time Summary

Date Timekeeper Hours Description Amount

Jan 24, 2020 M. Garneau 0.25 Various email correspondence with Andie 
Lipetz and Ashley Taylor regarding 
security review.

256.25

Jan 27, 2020 N. Avis 0.08 Reviewing the endorsement circulated by
D. Bish.

40.00

Jan 27, 2020 A.J. Taylor 0.33 Review draft endorsement; Emails re 
Endorsement

354.75

Jan 28, 2020 N. Avis 0.23 Meeting with A. Taylor; reviewing emails. 115.00

Jan 28, 2020 M. Garneau 0.33 Various email correspondence with Andie 
Lipetz and Ashley Taylor.

338.25

Jan 28, 2020 A. Lipetz 1.50 Emails with A. Taylor and M. Garneau; 
review application; review documents; 
send summary email to M. Garneau.

885.00

Jan 28, 2020 A.J. Taylor 2.92 Telephone conversation with M. 3,139.00
Calvaruso; telephone conversation with 
A. Sherman; conversation with N. Avis; 
telephone call with ; 
telephone conversation with D. Bish; all 
emails re security review; review affidavit 
and report re security;

111448769 v1
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Stikeman Elliott

Date TimekeeDer Hours Description Amount

Jan 29, 2020 N. Avis 0.35 Replying to emails from A. Taylor; 
reviewing the draft endrosements from D. 
Bish and M. Calvaruso.

175.00

Jan 29, 2020 M. Garneau 1.00 Meetings with Andie Lipetz to discuss file; 
conference call with Andie Lipetz and
Ashley Taylor to discuss file; telephone 

conversation with Chris Fattey; various 

email correspondence.

1,025.00

Jan 29, 2020 A. Lipetz 3.67 Review documents and searches; call 
with A. Taylor; meeting with M. Garneau; 
emails to all local counsel; call with T. 
Watson.

2,165.30

Jan 29, 2020 B.J. Lorusso 0.27 Re: SFP Canada Ltd., obtained 
corporate profile report for A. Lipetz.

102.60

Jan 29, 2020 A.J, Taylor 3.25 Review revised Initial Order; emails re

Initial Order; review and comment on 
draft affidavit; emails re affidavit; review 
draft Endorsement; emails re
Endorsement; telephone call with M. 
Garneau and A. Lipetz re Security
Review; telephone call with N. Avis re 
research;

3,493.75

Jan 29, 2020 A.J. Taylor 1.17 Telephone call with M. Wasserman and
M. Calvaruso ; email 
to Richter re ;

1,257.75

Jan 30, 2020 N. Avis 1.67 Calling W. Malik; reviewing emails; 
reviewing the sale guidelines and sharing 
them with M. Konyukhova; reviewing the 
Monitor's report; serving the Monitor's 
report.

835.00

Jan 30, 2020 M, Garneau 1.00 Various email correspondence and 
meetings with Andie Lipetz regarding 

security review and local agents.

1,025.00

Jan 30, 2020 M. Konyukhova 1.50 Review e-mails regarding comeback 
motion and materials; draft 

; e-mails regarding 
; review motion record and 

monitor's report.

1,350.00

Jan 30, 2020 A. Lipetz 1.33 Emails with A. Taylor; emails with C.
Reagh; emails with F. Shawe; call with
US counsel.

784.70

Jan 31, 2020 N. Avis 0.33 Meeting with A. Smirnova to discuss 
research with respect to 

.

165.00

Jan 31, 2020 A. Lipetz 2.00 Emails with local counsel and coordinate 
opinions; call with D. MacKenzie; emails 
with M. Garneau; email to A. Taylor.

1,180.00
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Stikeman Elliott

Fee Summary

Timekeeper Hours Rate/Hr Amount

N. Avis 2.66 $500.00 $1,330.00

M. Garneau 2.58 1,025.00 2,644.50

M. Konyukhova 1.50 900.00 1,350.00

A. Lipetz 8.50 590.00 5,015.00

B.J. Lorusso 0.27 380.00 102.60

A,J. Taylor 7.67 1,075.00 8,245.25

Professional Services CA $18,687.35

HST@ 13.0% 2,429.36

Total Professional Services and Taxes CA $21,116.71
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Account Summary

Invoice No. 5787488 
File No. 1266971016 

Re: SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Papyrus)

Taxable

Professional Services 18,687.35

Non-Taxable

0.00

Total

$18,687.35

2,429.36

CA $21,116.71

Accounts are due when rendered. Please note that a prevailing quarterly pre-judgement 
interest rate will be charged for amounts unpaid 30 days or more.

Disbursements and charges may not have been posted at the date of this account.
Please quote our File number and/or Invoice number 126697.1016/5787488 when making 
payment.
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Stikeman Elliott

GST / HST No. 1214111360001 
QST No. 1018978624

Stikeman Elliott LLP
Barristers & Solicitors 
5300 Commerce Court West 
199 Bay Street
Toronto, ON Canada M5L1B9

Main; 416 869 5500 
Fax: 416 947 0866
www.stikeman.com

Account

February 10, 2020

File No. 1266971016 
Invoice No. 5791014

Richter Advisory Group Inc. 

Bay Wellington Tower 
181 Bay Street 
Suite 3510
Toronto, ON M5J 2T3

Attention: Adam Sherman

For Professional Services Rendered in connection with SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Papyrus) for the period 
up to February 7, 2020.

Time Summary

Date Timekeeper Hours Description Amount

Jan 31,2020 M. Garneau 0.50 Various email correspondence regarding 
issues relating to local counsel opinions.

512.50

Jan 31,2020 M. Konyukhova 1.58 Attend court hearing; e-mails regarding 
landlord issues; calls to landlords.

1,422.00

Jan 31,2020 D.J. MacKenzie 0.50 Review analysis; review 
opinion issues.

575.00

Feb 3,2020 M. Garneau 0.50 Various email correspondence with Andie 
Lipetz and local counsel regarding 
security review.

512.50

Feb 3, 2020 A. Lipetz 1.33 Emails with Manitoba counsel; emails 
with Saskatchewan counsel; emails with
F. Shaw; discussions with M. Garneau; 
emails with T. Watson; internal emails.

784.70

Feb 3,2020 A. Smirnova 0.40 Review background documents and 

conduct research regarding 
.

140.00

Feb 3, 2020 A.J. Taylor 1.25 Telephone conversation with A.
Sherman; conversation with M.

1,343.75

Konyukhova re Motion; emails re 
; all emails 

111474333 v1
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Stikeman Elliott

Date Timekeeper Hours Description

;

Amount

Feb 4, 2020 M. Garneau 0.75 Meetings with Andie Lipetz and Ashley 

Taylor to discuss file; various email 
correspondence.

768.75

Feb 4, 2020 A. Lipetz 0.50 Emails with Manitoba counsel; call with T. 
Watson.

295.00

Feb 4,2020 A. Smirnova 1.63 Review background documents and 
conduct research 

.

570.50

Feb 4, 2020 A.J. Taylor 2.17 Draft letter to Mackinac Partners; draft 
emails to Osier and Tory's; conversation 
with M. Garneau re Security review;

2,332.75

Feb 4, 2020 T. Watson 1.52 Review background materials. 896.80

Feb 5, 2020 N. Avis 0.67 Reviewing emails; conducting research 

with respect to the 
.

335.00

Feb 5, 2020 M. Garneau 0.42 Meeting with Andie Lipetz to discuss file; 
various email correspondence regarding 
security review.

430.50

Feb 5, 2020 A. Lipetz 0.33 Emails with F. Shaw; emails with A.
Taylor and Ohio counsel; discussions 
with M. Garneau.

194.70

Feb 5, 2020 A. Smirnova 2.25 Conduct research regarding 
.

787.50

Feb 5, 2020 A.J. Taylor 0.67 Emails in Security Opinion; telephone 720.25
conversation with J. MacDonald and S. 
Stidwill re Order; telephone conversation 
re ;

Feb 5, 2020 T. Watson 0.50 Review security agreement and ancillary 
documents.

295.00

Feb 6, 2020 N. Avis 0.43 Researching  under the
CCAA.

215.00

Feb 6, 2020 M, Garneau 0.33 Various email correspondence and 
meeting with Andie Lipetz to discuss file.

338.25

Feb 6, 2020 A. Smirnova 3.50 Conduct research regarding 
.

1,225.00

Feb 6, 2020 A.J. Taylor 2.42 Emails re Monitor's inquiries; emails 2,601.50
; emails re Security 

Review; telephone conversation with P. 
Patel; draft email;

Feb 7, 2020 N. Avis 0.60 Reviewing emails; conducting research; 
meeting with A. Smirnova.

300.00

Feb 7, 2020 M. Garneau 0.75 Meeting with Andie Lipetz to discuss file; 768.75
various email correspondence regarding 
report on security review from certain 
loan counsel.

Feb 7, 2020 A, Smirnova 0.20 Discussion with N. Avis, conducting 
research regarding .

70.00

Feb 7, 2020 A.J. Taylor 0.83 ; emails re 892.25
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Date Timekeeper Hours Description Amount

; telephone conversation with 
;

Feb 7, 2020 T. Watson 0.23 Review ancillary documents. 135.70

Fee Summary

Timekeeper Hours Rate/Hr Amount

N. Avis 1.70 $500.00 $850.00

M. Garneau 3.25 1,025.00 3,331.25

M. Konyukhova 1.58 900.00 1,422.00

A. Lipetz 2.16 590.00 1,274.40

D.J. MacKenzie 0.50 1,150.00 575.00

A. Smirnova 7.98 350.00 2,793.00

A.J. Taylor 7.34 1,075.00 7,890.50

T. Watson** 2.25 590.00 1,327.50

Professional Services CA $19,463.65

BCPST @ 7.0% 92.93

HST@ 13.0% 2,530.28

Total Professional Services and Taxes CA $22,086.86

Charges Summary

Description Taxable Non - Taxable Total

Photocopies 54.75 54.75

Total Charges 54.75 0.00 54.75

HST@ 13.0% 7.12

Total Charges and Taxes CA $61.87

Disbursements Summary

Description Taxable Non-Taxable Total

Corporate Search N/T 3.45 3.45

Corporate Search 18.49 18.49

Total Disbursements 18.49 3.45 21.94

HST@ 13.0% 2.40

Total Disbursements and Taxes CA $24.34
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Stikeman Elliott

Account Summary

Invoice No. 5791014 
File No. 1266971016 
Re; SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Papyrus)

Taxable

Professional Services 19,463.65

BCPST @ 7.0%

HST@ 13.0%

Charges 54.75

HST @ 13.0%

Disbursements 18.49

Non-Taxable Total

0.00 $19,463.65

92.93

2,530.28

0.00 54.75

7.12

3.45 21.94

2.40

CA $22,173.07

Accounts are due when rendered. Please note that a prevailing quarterly pre-judgement 
interest rate will be charged for amounts unpaid 30 days or more.

Disbursements and charges may not have been posted at the date of this account.
Please quote our File number and/or Invoice number 126697.1016/5791014 when making 
payment.
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Stikeman Elliott

GST / HST No. 1214111360001 

QSTNo. 1018978624

Stikeman Elliott LLP 
Barristers & Solicitors 
5300 Commerce Court West 
199 Bay Street
Toronto, ON Canada M5L1B9

Main: 416 869 5500 

Fax: 416 947 0866
www.stikeman.com

Account

February 18, 2020

File No. 1266971016 

Invoice No. 5792551

Richter Advisory Group Inc. 
Bay Wellington Tower 

181 Bay Street 
Suite 3510
Toronto, ON M5J 2T3

Attention: Adam Sherman

For Professional Services Rendered in connection with SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Papyrus) for the period 
up to February 14, 2020.

Time Summary

Date Timekeeper Hours Description Amount

Feb 9, 2020 M. Garneau 0.25 Various email correspondence regarding 256.25
security opinions from local agents.

Feb 10, 2020 M. Garneau 0.75 Meeting with Andie Lipetz to discuss file 
and update on security review; various 
email correspondence regarding update 
from local agents.

768.75

Feb 11, 2020 M. Garneau 0.25 Meeting with Andie Lipetz to discuss file. 256.25

Feb 11, 2020 A.J. Taylor 0.25 Emails re ; 268.75

Feb 12, 2020 M. Garneau 0.33 Meeting with Andie Lipetz to discuss file. 338.25

Feb 12, 2020 A. Smirnova 5.20 Conducting research re:  
.

1,820.00

Feb 13, 2020 M. Garneau 0.75 Conference call with McDonald Hopkins; 
telephone conversation with Michael
Dyck to discuss Alberta security; 
meetings with Andie Lipetz to discuss file.

768.75

Feb 14, 2020 M. Garneau 0.50 Various email correspondence regarding 512.50
security review including Alberta and 
Ohio input.

111497538 v1
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Fee Summary

Timekeeper Hours Rate/Hr Amount

M. Garneau 2.83 $1,025.00 $2,900.75

A. Smirnova 5.20 350.00 1,820.00

A.J. Taylor 0.25 1,075.00 268.75

Professional Services CA $4,989.50

HST@ 13.0% 648.64

Total Professional Services and Taxes CA $5,638.14
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Stikeman Elliott

Account Summary

Invoice No. 5792551 
File No. 1266971016 

Re: SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Papyrus)

Taxable Non-Taxable

Professional Services 4,989.50 0.00

Total

$4,989.50

648.64

CA $5,638.14

Accounts are due when rendered. Please note that a prevailing quarterly pre-judgement 
interest rate will be charged for amounts unpaid 30 days or more.

Disbursements and charges may not have been posted at the date of this account.
Please quote our File number and/or Invoice number 126697.1016/5792551 when making 

payment.
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Stikeman Elliott

GST / HST No. 1214111360001 
QST No. 1018978624

Stikeman Elliott LLP 
Barristers & Solicitors 
5300 Commerce Court West 
199 Bay Street

Toronto, ON Canada M5L1B9

Main: 416 869 5500 
Fax: 416 947 0866
www.stikeman.com

Account

February 24, 2020

File No. 1266971016 
Invoice No. 5793285

Richter Advisory Group Inc. 
Bay Wellington Tower 

181 Bay Street 
Suite 3510
Toronto, ON M5J 2T3

Attention: Adam Sherman

For Professional Services Rendered in connection with SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Papyrus) for the period 
up to February 21, 2020.

Time Summary

Date Timekeeper Hours Description Amount

Feb 14,2020 M.L. Dyck 0.75 Review General Security Agreement and 
registration; note regarding security 
review.

750.00

Feb 16,2020 M. Garneau 0.17 Various email correspondence with 
Saskatchewan local agent.

174.25

Feb 17,2020 M. Garneau 0.08 Various email correspondence with Ohio 
local agent.

82.00

Feb 18,2020 M. Garneau 0.42 Meeting with Andie Lipetz to discuss file; 
various email correspondence regarding 
Ohio security opinion.

430.50

Feb 18,2020 A.J. Taylor 0.92 Telephone conversation with M.

Wasserman; telephone conversation with
A. Sherman and P. Patel; emails re
Osier;

989.00

Feb 19,2020 M. Garneau 0.58 Various email correspondence with
Ashley Taylor and Andie Lipetz regarding 
security review.

594.50

Feb 19,2020 A.J. Taylor 1.67 Review letter re ; 
telephone conversation with M.

1,795.25

Calvaruso; telephone conversation with

111522194 v1
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Stikeman Elliott

Date Timekeeper Hours Description

D. Bish; review ; emails with 
Richters; telephone conversation with A. 

Lipetz re security opinion;

Amount

Feb 20, 2020 N. Avis 2.90 Conducting research; reviewing emails 

from A. Smirnova.; drafting a research
1,450.00

summary.

Feb 20, 2020 A.J. Taylor 1.25 Review
 emails re security review;

1,343.75

Feb 21,2020 N. Avis 1.50 Conducting research and drafting a 
research summary re: .

750.00

Feb 21,2020 A.J. Taylor 2.33 Review cases re Security; emails re 2,504.75
Security review; telephone conversation 
with P. Hamilton ; email 
from L. Ellis;

Fee Summary

Timekeeper Hours

N. Avis 4.40

M.L. Dyck 0.75

M. Garneau 1.25

A.J. Taylor 6.17

Professional Services 

HST@ 13.0%

Total Professional Services and Taxes

Rate/Hr Amount

$500.00 $2,200.00

1,000.00 750.00

1,025.00 1,281.25

1,075.00 6,632.75

CA $10,864.00

1,412.32

CA $12,276.32
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Account Summary

Invoice No. 5793285 
File No. 1266971016 
Re: SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Papyrus)

Taxable

Professional Services 10,864.00

Non-Taxable

0.00

Total

$10,864.00

1,412.32

CA $12,276.32

Accounts are due when rendered. Please note that a prevailing quarterly pre-judgement 
interest rate will be charged for amounts unpaid 30 days or more.

Disbursements and charges may not have been posted at the date of this account.
Please quote our File number and/or Invoice number 126697.1016/5793285 when making 
payment.
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Stikeman Elliott

GST/HSTNo. 1214111360001 
QST No. 1018978624

Stikeman Elliott LLP 
Barristers & Solicitors 
5300 Commerce Court West 
199 Bay Street
Toronto, ON Canada M5L1B9

Main: 416 869 5500 
Fax: 416 947 0866

www.stikeman.com

Account

March 2, 2020

File No. 1266971016 
Invoice No. 5794461

Richter Advisory Group Inc. 
Bay Wellington Tower 

181 Bay Street 
Suite 3510
Toronto, ON M5J 2T3

Attention: Adam Sherman

For Professional Services Rendered in connection with SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Papyrus) for the period 

up to February 29, 2020,

Time Summary

Date Timekeeper Hours Description Amount

Feb 19, 2020 A. Lipetz 1.33 Internal discussions; emails with Ohio 
counsel; emails with F. Shaw; call with A. 
Taylor; discussion with M. Garneau.

784.70

Feb 21,2020 M. Garneau 0.33 Various email correspondence regarding 
New Brunswick and Saskatchewan 
matters.

338.25

Feb 21,2020 A. Lipetz 0.50 Emails with local counsel. 295.00

Feb 24,2020 N. Avis 0.90 Discussing the file with A. Taylor; meeting 
(via phone) with the Monitor).

450.00

Feb 24, 2020 M. Garneau 1.25 Meetings with Andie Lipetz, Ashley Taylor 
and Alina Smirnova to discuss file; to 
consider relevant provisions of PPSA 

regarding security for third party 
obligations; various email 
correspondence.

1,281.25

Feb 24, 2020 A. Lipetz 0.67 Review file notes; meeting with M.
Garneau and A. Taylor.

395.30

Feb 24, 2020 A. Smirnova 2.33 Conducting research re: 815.50

.

111566089 v1
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Stikeman Elliott

Date Timekeeper Hours Description Amount

Feb 24,2020 A.J. Taylor 3.17 Emails re ; Review
Second Report; draft response; emails re 
Ohio Engagement; review Security 

Agreement; conversation with N. Avis re 
Security Review; meeting with M.
Garneau and A. Lipetz re Security
Opinion; call re 

;

3,407.75

Feb 25, 2020 A. Smirnova 0.25 Conducting research re: 87.50

Feb 25,2020 A.J. Taylor 0.50 Telephone conversation with M.
Wasserman re Security; conversation 

with D. Bish re Security Review; emails re 
PPSA/Security Review;

537.50

Feb 26,2020 A.J. Taylor 0.17 Consider ; 182.75

Feb 28, 2020 A.J. Taylor 0.25 Emails re American Greetings; 268.75

Fee Summary

Timekeeper Hours Rate/Hr Amount

N. Avis 0.90 $500.00 $450.00

M. Garneau 1.58 1,025.00 1,619.50

A. Lipetz 2.50 590.00 1,475.00

A. Smirnova 2.58 350.00 903.00

A.J. Taylor 4.09 1,075.00 4,396.75

Professional Services CA $8,844.25

HST@ 13.0% 1,149.75

Total Professional Services and Taxes CA $9,994.00
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Stikeman Elliott

Account Summary

Invoice No. 5794461 
File No. 1266971016 
Re: SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Papyrus)

Taxable Non-Taxable

Professional Services 8,844.25 0.00

HST@ 13.0%

Total

$8,844.25

1,149.75

CA £9.994.00

Accounts are due when rendered. Please note that a prevailing quarterly pre-judgement 

interest rate will be charged for amounts unpaid 30 days or more.

Disbursements and charges may not have been posted at the date of this account.

Please quote our File number and/or Invoice number 126697.1016/5794461 when making 

payment.
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Stikeman Elliott LLP 
Barristers & Solicitors 
5300 Commerce Court West 
199 Bay Street 
Toronto, ON Canada  M5L 1B9 
 
Main:     416 869 5500 
Fax:       416 947 0866 
www.stikeman.com 

GST / HST No. 1214111360001 
QST No. 1018978624 
 

 

 
 

  

Account 
 

March 27, 2020 
 
File No. 1266971016 
Invoice No. 5797272 
 

 

Richter Advisory Group Inc. 
Bay Wellington Tower 
181 Bay Street 
Suite 3510 
Toronto,  ON   M5J 2T3   
 

 

 
Attention:  Adam Sherman 
 
For Professional Services Rendered in connection with SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Papyrus) for the period 
up to March 27, 2020. 
 
 
Time Summary 
 
 
Date Timekeeper Hours Description Amount 

Feb 7, 2020 A. Lipetz 0.50 Emails with local counsel; discussions 
with T. Watson. 

295.00 

Feb 10, 2020 A. Lipetz 1.17 Emails with F. Shaw; summary of security 
opinion status per jurisdiction to A. 
Taylor; emails with M. Garneau. 

690.30 

Feb 13, 2020 A. Lipetz 0.67 Emails with M. Kaczka; call with M. 
Kaczka and M. Garneau. 

395.30 

Feb 21, 2020 P.E. Hamilton 0.33 Occupied with A. Taylor. 396.00 
Feb 25, 2020 M. Garneau 0.42 Various email correspondence with 

Ashley Taylor and Alina Smirnova 
regarding 

 and other matters. 

430.50 

Feb 25, 2020 P.E. Hamilton 0.33 Telephone  call with A. Taylor. 396.00 
Feb 27, 2020 M. Garneau 0.17 Various email correspondence regarding 

Ohio security review. 
174.25 

Mar 3, 2020 M. Garneau 0.50 Meeting with Andie Lipetz to discuss file; 
various email correspondence regarding 
security review opinion. 

512.50 

Mar 3, 2020 A.J. Taylor 0.92 Telephone conversation with A. 
Sherman; telephone conversation with P. 

989.00 
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Date Timekeeper Hours Description Amount 

Patel; telephone conversation with M. 
Calvaruso; telephone conversation with 
A. Lipetz; emails re Security Review; 

Mar 11, 2020 M. Garneau 0.25 Various email correspondence regarding 
security review and related opinions. 

256.25 

Mar 12, 2020 M. Garneau 0.25 Various email correspondence with Andie 
Lipetz regarding security review opinion. 

256.25 

Mar 12, 2020 M. Obee Tower 0.20 Discussion with Andie Lipetz regarding 
security review opinion. 

180.00 

Mar 13, 2020 M. Garneau 0.75 Review of draft security review opinion 
and telephone conversation with Andie 
Lipetz to discuss opinion. 

768.75 

Mar 16, 2020 M. Garneau 0.33 Various email correspondence regarding 
local counsel opinions. 

338.25 

Mar 17, 2020 M. Garneau 0.58 Various email correspondence regarding 
local counsel security; review opinions; 
conference call with Andie Lipetz and 
Ashley Taylor to discuss file. 

594.50 

Mar 17, 2020 A.J. Taylor 0.75 Conference call with M. Garneau and A. 
Lipetz re security opinion; telephone 
conversation with M. Calvaruso; emails 
with Richter; 

806.25 

Mar 18, 2020 M. Garneau 0.17 Various email correspondence with Andie 
Lipetz. 

174.25 

Mar 19, 2020 N. Avis 0.40 Corresponding with A. Zeldin and A. 
Taylor. 

200.00 

Mar 20, 2020 N. Avis 0.48 Reviewing an email from A. Taylor; 
communicating with A. Zeldin; calling A. 
Lipetz. 

240.00 

Mar 20, 2020 M. Garneau 0.42 Various email correspondence  with 
Andie Lipetz and local counsel regarding 
to finalize security review opinions. 

430.50 

Mar 23, 2020 N. Avis 0.02 Reviewing emails. 10.00 
Mar 23, 2020 M. Garneau 0.50 Various email correspondence regarding 

security review opinions including Ohio 
opinion. 

512.50 

Mar 23, 2020 A. Lipetz 2.50 Emails with A. Taylor; call and 
discussions with M. Garneau; emails with 
local counsel; review local counsel 
opinions and provide comments. 

1,475.00 

Mar 23, 2020 A.J. Taylor 1.42 Review and comment on draft stay 
extension materials (Affidavit, Motion 
Material, Order); emails with Richter; 
Emails about opinion; 

1,526.50 

Mar 24, 2020 N. Avis 0.87 Meeting with Richters via phone 
conference; reviewing the Monitor's 
report. 

435.00 

Mar 24, 2020 M. Garneau 0.58 Various email correspondence with Andie 
Lipetz and Ashley Taylor regarding 

594.50 
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Date Timekeeper Hours Description Amount 

security review opinions and related 
PPSA searches. 

Mar 24, 2020 A. Lipetz 1.00 Review revised Saskatchewan opinion; 
emails with A. Taylor and M. Garneau; 
emails with local counsel. 

590.00 

Mar 24, 2020 A.J. Taylor 5.42 Emails with C. Burr re Security Review; 
review draft opinion; all emails re 
Opinion; review draft Monitor's Report; 
conference call with Richter re Report; 
Review revised Motion Materials; 

5,826.50 

Mar 25, 2020 M. Garneau 0.75 Telephone conversation with Ashley 
Taylor and Andie Lipetz to discuss 
securit\ review opinion and monitor¶s 
report; review of excerpts of Ohio opinion 
and monitor¶s report; Various email 
correspondence. 

768.75 

Mar 25, 2020 A. Lipetz 0.83 Call with A. Taylor and M. Garneau; 
emails with local counsel; emails with A. 
Taylor. 

489.70 

Mar 25, 2020 A.J. Taylor 2.75 Emails re KERP; telephone conversation 
with M. Garneau and A. Lipetz re Security 
Opinion; telephone conversation with P. 
Patel ; telephone conversation 
with M. Calvaruso re KERP; Review and 
revised - revised report; emails re Report; 

2,956.25 

Mar 26, 2020 A.J. Taylor 1.67 Review revised motion materials; Revise 
Report; All emails; telephone 
conversation with C. Burr re Security 
Review and Stay Extension Motion; 

1,795.25 

Mar 27, 2020 N. Avis 0.68 Serving the Monitor's report and 
subsequently evaluating how to file the 
Monitor's report with the Court. 

340.00 

 
 
Fee Summary 
 
Timekeeper Hours Rate/Hr 

N. Avis 2.45 $500.00  
M. Garneau 5.67 1,025.00  
P.E. Hamilton 0.66 1,200.00  
A. Lipetz 6.67 590.00  
M. Obee Tower 0.20 900.00  
A.J. Taylor 12.93 1,075.00  
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Professional Services CA $25,843.80 
HST @ 13.0% 3,359.69 
 
Total Professional Services and Taxes 

 
CA $29,203.49 

 
 
AAccount Summary  

 
Invoice No.  5797272 
File No.  1266971016 
Re:  SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Papyrus) 

 
 

 Taxable Non-Taxable Total 

Professional Services 25,843.80 0.00 $25,843.80 

HST @ 13.0%   3,359.69 

Amount Due CA $29,203.49 
 
Stikeman Elliott LLP 
 
 
 
 
Ashley J. Taylor 
 
 
Accounts are due when rendered. Please note that a prevailing quarterly pre-judgement 
interest rate will be charged for amounts unpaid 30 days or more. 
 
Disbursements and charges may not have been posted at the date of this account. 
Please quote our File number and/or Invoice number 126697.1016/5797272 when making 
payment.   
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SWLNHPDQ EOOLRWW LLP 
Barristers & Solicitors 
5300 Commerce Court West 
199 Ba\ Street 
Toronto, ON Canada  M5L 1B9 
 
Main:     416 869 5500 
Fa[:       416 947 0866 
ZZZ.stikeman.com 

GST / HST NR. 1214111360001 
QST NR. 1018978624 
 

 

 
 
AFFRXQW 

 
Ma\ 13, 2020 
 
File No. 1266971016 
InYoice No. 5813586 
 

 

Richter AdYisor\ Group Inc. 
Ba\ Wellington ToZer 
181 Ba\ Street 
Suite 3510 
Toronto,  ON   M5J 2T3   
 

 

 
Attention:  Adam Sherman 
 
FRU PURIHVVLRQDO SHUYLFHV RHQGHUHG in connection Zith SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Pap\rus) for the period 
up to Ma\ 10, 2020. 
 
 
TLPH SXPPDU\ 
 
 
Date Timekeeper Hours Description Amount 

Mar 12, 2020 A. Lipet] 1.67 Draft opinion; email to M. Garneau. 985.30 
Mar 16, 2020 A. Lipet] 0.33 Emails Zith local counsel. 194.70 
Mar 17, 2020 A. Lipet] 1.00 Emails Zith local counsel; call Zith A. 

Ta\lor and M. Garneau. 
590.00 

Apr 20, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 0.25 Telephone conYersation Zith M. 
CalYaruso re Distributions 

268.75 

Apr 22, 2020 N. AYis 0.47 Conference call Zith A. Ta\lor and the 
Monitor. 

235.00 

Apr 22, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 0.58 Conference call 623.50 
Apr 24, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 0.33 Telephone conYersation Zith M. 

CalYaruso re Termination Motion; email 
Richters; email to C. Burr 

354.75 

Apr 28, 2020 N. AYis 1.25 Conducting research Zith respect to 
 for A. Ta\lor. 

625.00 

Apr 28, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 0.17 Emails Zith N. AYis re 
; 

182.75 

Apr 29, 2020 N. AYis 0.93 Repl\ing to A. Ta\lor's email re: 
; 

reYieZing emails from A. Ta\lor and C. 

465.00 

DocuSign Envelope ID: 82E87543-4D08-4D9E-8694-2B0D45CABEC2



 

 

PDJH 2 RI 4 

Date Timekeeper Hours Description Amount 

Burr. 
Apr 29, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 0.50 Emails re 

 
537.50 

Ma\ 6, 2020 N. AYis 0.98 Conference call Zith A. Ta\lor and the 
Monitor. 

490.00 

Ma\ 6, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 2.17 Emails re ; ReYieZ 
 anal\sis; conference call Zith 

Richters; telephone conYersation Zith M. 
CalYaruso; telephone conYersation Zith 
C. Burr 

2,332.75 

Ma\ 8, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 0.17 Emails re Court Date 182.75 
 
 
FHH SXPPDU\ 
 
Timekeeper Hours Rate/Hr Amount 

N. AYis 3.63 $500.00  $1,815.00 
A. Lipet] 3.00 590.00  1,770.00 
A.J. Ta\lor 4.17 1,075.00  4,482.75 
 
Professional SerYices CA $8,067.75 
HST @ 13.0% 1,048.81 
 
Total Professional SerYices and Ta[es 

 
CA $9,116.56 

 
 
DLVEXUVHPHQWV SXPPDU\ 
 
Description Ta[able Non - Ta[able Total 

Telephone 1.12  1.12 
Total Disbursements 1.12 0.00 1.12 
HST @ 13.0%  0.15 
 
Total Disbursements and Ta[es 

 
CA $1.27 
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AFFRXQW SXPPDU\  

 
InYoice No.  5813586 
File No.  1266971016 
Re:  SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Pap\rus) 

 
 

 Ta[able Non-Ta[able Total 

Professional SerYices 8,067.75 0.00 $8,067.75 

HST @ 13.0%   1,048.81 

Disbursements 1.12 0.00 1.12 

HST  @ 13.0%   0.15 

APRXQW DXH CA $9,117.83 
 
SWLNHPDQ EOOLRWW LLP 
 
 
 
 
Ashle\ J. Ta\lor 
 
 
AFFRXQWV DUH GXH ZKHQ UHQGHUHG. POHDVH QRWH WKDW D SUHYDLOLQJ TXDUWHUO\ SUH-MXGJHPHQW 
LQWHUHVW UDWH ZLOO EH FKDUJHG IRU DPRXQWV XQSDLG 30 GD\V RU PRUH. 
 
Disbursements and charges ma\ not haYe been posted at the date of this account. 
Please quote our File number and/or InYoice number 126697.1016/5813586 Zhen making 
pa\ment.   
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SWLNHPDQ EOOLRWW LLP 
Barristers & Solicitors 
5300 Commerce Court West 
199 Ba\ Street 
Toronto, ON Canada  M5L 1B9 
 
Main:     416 869 5500 
Fa[:       416 947 0866 
ZZZ.stikeman.com 

GS7 / HS7 NR. 1214111360001 
QS7 NR. 1018978624 
 

 

 
 
AFFRXQW 

 
June 4, 2020 
 
File No. 1266971016 
Invoice No. 5817637 
 

 

Richter Advisor\ Group Inc. 
Ba\ Wellington ToZer 
181 Ba\ Street 
Suite 3510 
Toronto,  ON   M5J 2T3   
 

 

 
Attention:  Adam Sherman 
 
FRU PURIHVVLRQDO SHUYLFHV RHQGHUHG in connection Zith SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Pap\rus) for the period 
up to Ma\ 31, 2020. 
 
 
7LPH SXPPDU\ 
 
 
Date Timekeeper Hours Description Amount 

Ma\ 12, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 0.67 Emails re ; 
emails re Information requests; 

720.25 

Ma\ 13, 2020 N. Avis 0.07 RevieZing correspondence from the 
Monitor. 

35.00 

Ma\ 21, 2020 N. Avis 0.18 Speaking Zith C. Thompson to prepare a 
fee affidavit; revieZing the Monitor's 
report. 

90.00 

Ma\ 21, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 0.50 All emails re CCAA Termination Motion 537.50 
Ma\ 22, 2020 N. Avis 0.85 RevieZing the Monitor's report and 

sending comments to A. Ta\lor; 
revieZing emails from C. Burr and A. 
Ta\lor. 

425.00 

Ma\ 22, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 0.17 Telephone conversation Zith M. 
Calvaruso re ; 

182.75 

Ma\ 25, 2020 N. Avis 0.72 RevieZing the fee affidavit; 
corresponding Zith A. Ta\lor re: the fee 
affidavit. 

360.00 

Ma\ 25, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 0.33 Telephone M. Calvaruso; emails Zith 
Richters; 

354.75 
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FHH SXPPDU\ 
 
Timekeeper Hours Rate/Hr Amount 

N. Avis 1.82 $500.00  $910.00 
A.J. Ta\lor 1.67 1,075.00  1,795.25 
 
Professional Services CA $2,705.25 
HST @ 13.0% 351.68 
 
Total Professional Services and Ta[es 

 
CA $3,056.93 

 
 
DLVEXUVHPHQWV SXPPDU\ 
 
Description Ta[able Non - Ta[able Total 

On-Line Search 145.64  145.64 
Total Disbursements 145.64 0.00 145.64 
HST @ 13.0%  18.93 
 
Total Disbursements and Ta[es 

 
CA $164.57 
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AFFRXQW SXPPDU\  

 
Invoice No.  5817637 
File No.  1266971016 
Re:  SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Pap\rus) 

 
 

 Ta[able Non-Ta[able Total 

Professional Services 2,705.25 0.00 $2,705.25 

HST @ 13.0%   351.68 

Disbursements 145.64 0.00 145.64 

HST  @ 13.0%   18.93 

APRXQW DXH CA $3,221.50 
 
SWLNHPDQ EOOLRWW LLP 
 
 
 
 
Ashle\ J. Ta\lor 
 
 
AFFRXQWV DUH GXH ZKHQ UHQGHUHG. POHDVH QRWH WKDW D SUHYDLOLQJ TXDUWHUO\ SUH-MXGJHPHQW 
LQWHUHVW UDWH ZLOO EH FKDUJHG IRU DPRXQWV XQSDLG 30 GD\V RU PRUH. 
 
Disbursements and charges ma\ not have been posted at the date of this account. 
Please quote our File number and/or Invoice number 126697.1016/5817637 Zhen making 
pa\ment.   
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SWLNHPDQ EOOLRWW LLP 
Barristers & Solicitors 
5300 Commerce CoXrt West 
199 Ba\ Street 
Toronto, ON Canada  M5L 1B9 
 
Main:     416 869 5500 
Fa[:       416 947 0866 
ZZZ.stikeman.com 

GS7 / HS7 NR. 1214111360001 
QS7 NR. 1018978624 
 

 

 
 
AFFRXQW 

 
JXne 22, 2020 
 
File No. 1266971016 
InYoice No. 5819632 
 

 

Richter AdYisor\ GroXp Inc. 
Ba\ Wellington ToZer 
181 Ba\ Street 
SXite 3510 
Toronto,  ON   M5J 2T3   
 

 

 
Attention:  Adam Sherman 
 
FRU PURIHVVLRQDO SHUYLFHV RHQGHUHG in connection Zith SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Pap\rXs) for the period 
Xp to JXne 22, 2020. 
 
 
7LPH SXPPDU\ 
 
 
Date Timekeeper HoXrs Description AmoXnt 

JXn 3, 2020 N. AYis 0.37 Phone call Zith the Monitor and A. Ta\lor. 185.00 
JXn 3, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 2.58 All emails re ; reYieZ 

letter; reYieZ draft Complaint; conference; 
conference call Zith UCC; call Zith 
Richter; call Zith Osler; 

2,773.50 

JXn 4, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 0.92 All emails re distribXtions; telephone 
conYersation Zith C. BXrr; reYieZ 
complaint; 

989.00 

JXn 5, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 0.17 Telephone conYersation Zith M. 
CalYarXso 

182.75 

JXn 8, 2020 N. AYis 0.48 Call Zith the Monitor and A. Ta\lor. 240.00 
JXn 8, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 4.42 ReYieZ Report re 

; telephone conYersation Zith M. 
CalYarXso re CRO; Call Zith Richter; 
ReYieZ and reYise draft report; 

4,751.50 

JXn 9, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 0.92 ReYise Draft Report; emails re complaint 989.00 
JXn 10, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 3.83 ReYise report; telephone conYersation 

Zith C. BXrr; telephone conYersation Zith 
M. CalYarXso 

4,117.25 

JXn 11, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 2.17 ReYise report; all emails re 2,332.75 
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Date Timekeeper HoXrs Description AmoXnt 

; 
JXn 12, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 0.25 Telephone conYersation Zith A. Zeldin; 

emails Zith UCC; 
268.75 

JXn 15, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 0.25 Telephone conYersation Zith R. Ga\da re 
UCC Complaint 

268.75 

JXn 18, 2020 N. AYis 0.02 ReYieZing correspondence from A. 
Ta\lor; 

10.00 

JXn 18, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 0.67 Emails re UCC; telephone call Zith M. 
CalYarXso; emails Zith N. AYis; 

720.25 

JXn 19, 2020 N. AYis 1.27 ReYieZing SFP Canada's motion 
materials Zith a YieZ to ensXring the\ 
conform Zith the Monitor's FoXrth Report. 

635.00 

JXn 19, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 0.17 Emails re Motion 182.75 
JXn 20, 2020 N. AYis 0.05 ReYieZing correspondence from A. 

Ta\lor re: mark-Xps of YarioXs docXments 
in connection Zith the forthcoming 
motion; reYising the Monitor's Report. 

25.00 

JXn 20, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 3.25 All emails re Report, AffidaYit and Order; 
reYieZ draft Notice of Motion; reYieZ draft 
affidaYit; reYieZ draft order; 

3,493.75 

JXn 22, 2020 N. AYis 0.37 Call Zith A. Zeldin to discXss 
; corresponding Zith A. 

Ta\lor re: draft Monitor¶s report; 
circXlating the draft Monitor¶s report. 

185.00 

JXn 22, 2020 A.J. Ta\lor 2.25 ReYieZ draft settlement; ReYise draft 
report; Emails Zith N. AYis; 

2,418.75 

 
 
FHH SXPPDU\ 
 
Timekeeper HoXrs Rate/Hr AmoXnt 

N. AYis 2.56 $500.00  $1,280.00 
A.J. Ta\lor 21.85 1,075.00  23,488.75 
 
Professional SerYices CA $24,768.75 
HST @ 13.0% 3,219.94 
 
Total Professional SerYices and Ta[es 

 
CA $27,988.69 

 
 
DLVEXUVHPHQWV SXPPDU\ 
 
Description Ta[able Non - Ta[able Total 

Cash ReceiYed  -4,500.44 -4,500.44 
MiscellaneoXs N/T  4,500.44 4,500.44 
Telephone 3.58  3.58 
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Description Ta[able Non - Ta[able Total 

Total DisbXrsements 3.58 0.00 3.58 
HST @ 13.0%  0.47 
 
Total DisbXrsements and Ta[es 

 
CA $4.05 
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AFFRXQW SXPPDU\  

 
InYoice No.  5819632 
File No.  1266971016 
Re:  SFP Canada Ltd. (dba Pap\rXs) 

 
 

 Ta[able Non-Ta[able Total 

Professional SerYices 24,768.75 0.00 $24,768.75 

HST @ 13.0%   3,219.94 

DisbXrsements 3.58 0.00 3.58 

HST  @ 13.0%   0.47 

APRXQW DXH CA $27,992.74 
 
SWLNHPDQ EOOLRWW LLP 
 
 
 
 
Ashle\ J. Ta\lor 
 
 
AFFRXQWV DUH GXH ZKHQ UHQGHUHG. POHDVH QRWH WKDW D SUHYDLOLQJ TXDUWHUO\ SUH-MXGJHPHQW 
LQWHUHVW UDWH ZLOO EH FKDUJHG IRU DPRXQWV XQSDLG 30 GD\V RU PRUH. 
 
DisbXrsements and charges ma\ not haYe been posted at the date of this accoXnt. 
Please qXote oXr File nXmber and/or InYoice nXmber 126697.1016/5819632 Zhen making 
pa\ment.   
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This is 

EXHIBIT “B” 
referred to in the Affidavit of 

ASHLEY TAYLOR 
sworn on June 24, 2020. 

 

 

 

__________________________________ 
Commissioner for Taking Affidavits 
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EXHIBIT “B” 
 

Summary of Stikeman Elliott LLP’s Invoices for 
Services Rendered from January 15, 2020 to June 22, 2020 

 
Invoice 

No. 
Date Fee Expenses HST BCT Total 

5786682 January 27, 2020 26,374.00 452.19 3,487.41  30,313.60 

5787488 February 3, 2020 18,687.35  2,429.36  21,116.71 
5791014 February 10, 2020 19,463.65 76.69 2,539.80 92.93 22,173.07 
5792551 February 18, 2020 4,989.50  648.64  5,638.14 
5793285 February 24, 2020 10,864.00  1,412.32  12,276.32 

5794461 March 2, 2020 8,844.25  1,149.75  9,994.00 
5797272 March 27, 2020 25,843.80  3,359.69  29,203.49 
5813586 May 13, 2020 8,067.75 1.12 1,048.96  9,117.83 
5817637 June 4, 2020 2,705.25 145.64 370.61  3,221.50 

5819632 June 22, 2020 24,768.75 3.58 3,220.41  27,992.74 

TOTAL  $150,608.30 $679.22 $19,666.95 $92.93 $171,047.40 
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This is 

EXHIBIT “C” 
referred to in the Affidavit of 

ASHLEY TAYLOR 
sworn on June 24, 2020. 

 

 

 

__________________________________ 
Commissioner for Taking Affidavits 
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EXHIBIT “C” 
 

Summary of Stikeman Elliott LLP’s Invoices for 
Services Rendered from January 15, 2020 to June 22, 2020 

 
 

Name Position Hourly Rate Hours Total 

P. Hamilton Partner 1,200.00 0.66 792.00 
D. MacKenzie Partner 1,150.00 0.50 575.00 
A. Taylor Partner 1,075.00 88.06 94,664.50 

M. Garneau Partner 1,025.00 17.16 17,589.00 
M. Dyck Partner 1,000.00 0.75 750.00 
M. Obee Tower Partner 900.00 0.20 180.00 
M. Konyukhova Partner 900.00 3.08 2,772.00 

T. Watson Associate 590.00 2.25 1,327.50 
A. Lipetz Associate 590.00 22.83 13,469.70 
N. Avis Associate 500.00 25.74 12,870.00 
A. Smirnova Associate 350.00 15.76 5,516.00 

Clerk  380.00 0.27 102.60 
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IN THE MATTER OF THE COMPANIES’ CREDITORS ARRANGEMENT ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. C-
36, AS AMENDED AND IN THE MATTER OF A PLAN OF COMPROMISE OR 
ARRANGEMENT OF SFP CANADA LTD. 

Court File No.: CV-20-634980-00CL 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

Proceeding commenced at Toronto 

AFFIDAVIT OF ASHLEY TAYLOR 
(SWORN JUNE 24, 2020) 

STIKEMAN ELLIOTT LLP 
Barristers & Solicitors 
5300 Commerce Court West 
199 Bay Street 
Toronto, ON  M5l 1B9 

Ashley Taylor LSO# 39932E 
Tel: 416.869-5236 
Email: ataylor@stikeman.com 

Nicholas Avis LSO#: 76781Q 
Tel: (416) 869-5504 
Email: navis@stikeman.com  
Fax: (416) 947-0866 

Lawyers for Richter Advisory Group Inc., 
in its Capacity as Monitor 
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